

EXHIBIT 3

Burns Charest LLP

Time Report

Jane Doe, individually and on behalf of all others similarly situated, v. YouTube, Inc.
Inception through April 30, 2023

| Date | SM/Task | Name | Hrs | Amt | Rate | Narrative |
|------------|---------|-------------------|------|----------|--------|--|
| 05/27/2020 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.80 | 1,440.00 | 800.00 | Confer with S. Williams re potential claims; confer with partnership re potential claims and next steps; organize case evaluation and file review; confer with trial team re case evaluation issues. |
| 09/23/2020 | A104 | Wright, Lydia | 0.40 | 180.00 | 450.00 | Review complaint |
| 09/23/2020 | 1135 | Lopez, Hannah | 1.10 | 247.50 | 225.00 | Reach out to Lori at Saveri for copy of case caption; pull and post complaint and judge assignment to slack channel; pull remaining docs and save to server; pull all docket entries, save to server, update calendar with CMC hearing date and CMC Stmt due date, create list server for matter, post to slack channel for group; |
| 09/29/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 105.00 | 350.00 | Reviewed and edited pro hac vice application and supporting materials |
| 09/29/2020 | 1135 | Lopez, Hannah | 2.50 | 562.50 | 225.00 | Draft PHV docs based on Scola PHV filings; fwd drafts of all to team for final review; check docket for any new filings; |
| 10/06/2020 | 1135 | Lopez, Hannah | 1.10 | 247.50 | 225.00 | Finalize PHVs and confer with Chambers clerk on hearing date/time; confer with Heaven at Saveri for YouTube service address |
| 10/07/2020 | 1135 | Lopez, Hannah | 1.40 | 315.00 | 225.00 | Finalize PHV filing documents; confer with clerk on hearing date, fwd final to Heaven at Saveri for filing; upload and pay CA AIMS Bar Fee for all attorneys on PHV |
| 10/08/2020 | 1135 | Lopez, Hannah | 0.30 | 67.50 | 225.00 | Reach out to heaven on PHV update; |
| 10/12/2020 | 1135 | Lopez, Hannah | 0.60 | 135.00 | 225.00 | Confer with JSLF Paralegal re PHV filings; look into CourtCall case association procedure, if any; confer with maggie/bynum re court call login creds; |
| 10/20/2020 | A106 | Yelton, Rick | 0.60 | 225.00 | 375.00 | Speak over the phone with potential class rep who had previously reached out to discuss her experiences and interest in participating, provide update to the team. |
| 10/20/2020 | 1135 | Lopez, Hannah | 0.30 | 67.50 | 225.00 | Reach out to Heaven re PHV status; |
| 10/21/2020 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 140.00 | 350.00 | Read Verge article re Google content moderation for factual background |
| 10/28/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.60 | 150.00 | 250.00 | Updating docket with notice of removal with exhibits, Youtube's disclosure statement, the assignment to the magistrate judge, the order setting initial case management conference and Youtube's certificate of service for the notice of removal; pulling and posting docket report; discussing case with H. Lopez. |
| 10/28/2020 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.70 | 1,360.00 | 800.00 | Confer with co-lead counsel re file status, task assignments, and next steps; confer with trial team re same; organize trial team; review file materials. |
| 10/28/2020 | 1135 | Lopez, Hannah | 0.80 | 180.00 | 225.00 | Confer with dan re my assignment on the matter; finalize switch to julianna, update julianna on phv status |
| 10/30/2020 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 1.10 | 275.00 | 250.00 | Researching applying for admission PHV in ND Cal.; drafting on forms for D. Charest, L. Wright, M. Biblo, P. Murphree and R. Yelton; pulling current certificates of good standing to D. Charest, M. Biblo and R. Yelton; ordering certificates of good standing for L. Wright and P. Murphree; emailing with H. Haile. |
| 11/03/2020 | A106 | Yelton, Rick | 0.70 | 315.00 | 450.00 | Speak over the phone with potential class rep Mireya Lanz; provide update to the BC team following the call. |
| 11/05/2020 | A106 | Yelton, Rick | 0.30 | 135.00 | 450.00 | Prepare and send email in follow-up to conversation with potential class rep. |
| 11/06/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 75.00 | 250.00 | Call with Louisiana Supreme Court re certificates of good standing for L. Wright and P. Murphree (vm). |
| 11/18/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 100.00 | 250.00 | Registering L. Wright, M. Biblo, P. Murphree and R. Yelton for ECF in ND Cal. and discussing same. |
| 11/19/2020 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.60 | 150.00 | 250.00 | Finalizing and filing applications for admission pro hac vice for D. Charest, L. Wright, M. Biblo, P. Murphree and R. Yelton and circulating to team. |
| 11/23/2020 | 1137 | Yelton, Rick | 0.90 | 405.00 | 450.00 | Speak over the phone with new potential client, Ahmed, and follow up with email to him and also update to the BC team. |
| 11/24/2020 | A106 | Yelton, Rick | 0.10 | 45.00 | 450.00 | Communicate with M. Lanz to set up phone call. |
| 11/25/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.70 | 315.00 | 450.00 | Speak over the phone with M. Lanz about her potential role in the class action and other people she may know who are interested. |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|--------|--|
| 12/01/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.10 | 25.00 | 250.00 | Reviewing and circulating order granting admission PHV for D. Charest; |
| 12/02/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.50 | 675.00 | 450.00 | Read motion to dismiss and preliminary identified potential responses and avenues of research. |
| 12/02/2020 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 480.00 | 800.00 | Review file materials; confer with trial team re motion to dismiss; confer with trial team re organizational issues. |
| 12/02/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.10 | 25.00 | 250.00 | Reviewing and circulating YouTube's motion to dismiss and proposed order |
| 12/02/2020 | 1141 | Yelton, Rick | 0.60 | 270.00 | 450.00 | Initial reading and analysis of youtube MTD filed this day; coordinate internally for response. |
| 12/03/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 3.60 | 1,620.00 | 450.00 | Carefully read complaint and motion to dismiss. Developing potential avenues of counterarguments and structure for motion and began research to develop those arguments |
| 12/03/2020 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 45.00 | 450.00 | Emailed with RY re prospects for signing on a class rep that is a current content mod |
| 12/03/2020 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 480.00 | 800.00 | Confer with leadership re litigations strategy and case management; review file materials; confer with trial team re task assignments and next steps. |
| 12/03/2020 | 1141 | Yelton, Rick | 0.90 | 405.00 | 450.00 | Read through and analyze the arguments made by YT in the MTD; re-read memo drafted previously on related UCL application issues. |
| 12/03/2020 | 1141 | Yelton, Rick | 0.80 | 360.00 | 450.00 | Analyze the role of standing for injunctive relief, both under the UCL and in federal court; analyze the 9th circuit caselaw requiring remand when such a difference exists; discuss same with P Murphree and L Wright. |
| 12/04/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 2.80 | 1,260.00 | 450.00 | Researched choice of law issue for motion to dismiss response |
| 12/04/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 90.00 | 450.00 | Brainstormed ideas re conflict of law issue in motion to dismiss with MB |
| 12/04/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 2.40 | 1,080.00 | 450.00 | Researched standing issue re injunctive relief claim and identified possible courses of action |
| 12/04/2020 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 480.00 | 800.00 | Confer with trial team re team organization and task assignments; review file materials. |
| 12/04/2020 | A106 | Yelton, Rick | 0.50 | 225.00 | 450.00 | Speak with contact M Lanz about current moderators; follow up internally regarding same; correspond internally with P Murphree and L Wright regarding strategy in light of client contact. |
| 12/05/2020 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.90 | 720.00 | 800.00 | Review recent filings; confer with trial team re same; confer with leadership re task assignments and litigations strategy; confer with trial team re same; confer with trial team re potential class representatives and related issues. |
| 12/06/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 3.10 | 1,395.00 | 450.00 | Researched conflict of law issues for response to motion to dismiss |
| 12/07/2020 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.80 | 360.00 | 450.00 | Participated in BC call re next steps towards amended complaint |
| 12/07/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.20 | 540.00 | 450.00 | Researched re potential solutions to jurisdictional issues in case in federal court |
| 12/07/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.40 | 630.00 | 450.00 | Researched availability of attorney fees under California general PAGA action |
| 12/07/2020 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.80 | 440.00 | 550.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 12/07/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 50.00 | 250.00 | Reviewing and circulating orders granting admission PHV for L. Wright, M. Biblo, P. Murphree and R. Yelton. |
| 12/07/2020 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.20 | 960.00 | 800.00 | Confer with trial team re removal, remand, and responses to motion to dismiss; review file materials; confer with leadership re pleading issues and litigation strategy. |
| 12/07/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 1.60 | 720.00 | 450.00 | Prepare for internal meeting by researching locations of collabora content moderators and other moderators working as vendors for YT; read and analyze the memo produced by PM re: standing. |
| 12/07/2020 | 1135 | Wright, Lydia | 0.80 | 400.00 | 500.00 | Following research, participate in internal call with team to discuss possible amendment and responding to MTD. |
| 12/08/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.80 | 360.00 | 450.00 | TT call |
| 12/08/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.10 | 25.00 | 250.00 | Prepared brief memo/analysis re California private attorney general statute |
| 12/08/2020 | A107 | Yelton, Rick | 0.60 | 270.00 | 450.00 | Calendar weekly call and discussing same with P. Murphree; |
| 12/10/2020 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 45.00 | 450.00 | Speak with W. Most about possible termination claim for A. Alwreni; call A. Alwreni and leave message regarding same; when A. Alwreni called back, speak with him about status of the case and other updates; email W Most and A Alwreni to connect the two. |
| 12/10/2020 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.40 | 220.00 | 550.00 | Attended internal BC meeting re case status |
| | | | | | | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|--------|--|
| 12/10/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 100.00 | 250.00 | Attend weekly call; In preparation for weekly internal call, review the memo circulated by P. Murphree on the PAGA civil rule and also review my previous memo on the PAGA statute; participate in weekly call. |
| 12/10/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 1.00 | 450.00 | 450.00 | Respond to two emails from JSLF team; review the PTSD acknowledgement form to ensure it is devoid of personal information and update team internally of its ability to be sent to CBS; coordinate time for strategy call with JSLF; follow up with email correspondences with JSLF on the issue of UCL and article III standing. |
| 12/11/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 1.10 | 495.00 | 450.00 | Reviewing and saving notice of appearance of K. Levy on behalf of plaintiffs; reviewing and circulating joint stipulation and proposed order on the motion to dismiss briefing schedule. |
| 12/14/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 75.00 | 250.00 | Email with K Malone from the JSLF team to coordinate team meeting. |
| 12/14/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.10 | 45.00 | 450.00 | Reviewing and circulating order granting joint stip re MTD briefing schedule; updating calendar. |
| 12/15/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 50.00 | 250.00 | Coordinate with emails to arrange for teamwide call on the next day. |
| 12/15/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.20 | 90.00 | 450.00 | Participated in call with JLSF re finding new plaintiffs + strategic plan for opposing MTD |
| 12/16/2020 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.60 | 270.00 | 450.00 | Researched re viability of our causes of action in current procedural posture with Jane Doe + Federal court |
| 12/16/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 90.00 | 450.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 12/16/2020 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.60 | 330.00 | 550.00 | Attend call with co-counsel re motion to dismiss; |
| 12/16/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.60 | 150.00 | 250.00 | Prepare for meeting with co-counsel on responding to to MTD; participate in meeting. |
| 12/16/2020 | A107 | Yelton, Rick | 0.70 | 315.00 | 450.00 | Email marketing team to set up a call on the issue of outreach to moderators. |
| 12/16/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.20 | 90.00 | 450.00 | Composed memo summarizing research on standing and equitable relief issues and predicting likelihood of success on claims. |
| 12/17/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 3.00 | 1,350.00 | 450.00 | Edited for circulation memo re current status of case with Jane Doe + federal court |
| 12/17/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 225.00 | 450.00 | Participated in internal firm meeting re status and next steps |
| 12/17/2020 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 135.00 | 450.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding content moderators |
| 12/17/2020 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.40 | 220.00 | 550.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 12/17/2020 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.30 | 165.00 | 550.00 | Attending weekly call; |
| 12/17/2020 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 75.00 | 250.00 | Prepare for phone call with Bria Burk at Androvet about reaching out to content moderators, participate in call, follow up with email. |
| 12/17/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.60 | 270.00 | 450.00 | Researched re applicable CAFA exceptions if we brought a California-only class |
| 12/18/2020 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 135.00 | 450.00 | Reviewed and edited ad copy and search terms for search for content mods |
| 12/21/2020 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 90.00 | 450.00 | Speak over the phone with K. Malone regarding the plan for responding to MTD. |
| 12/23/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.50 | 225.00 | 450.00 | Met with RY and MB re approach to JSLF re response to MtD |
| 12/28/2020 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 90.00 | 450.00 | Participate in brief internal call regarding strategy for responding to MTD; analyze outline prepared by JSLF and forward to the team. |
| 12/28/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.80 | 360.00 | 450.00 | Participated in meeting w/ JLSF re planning for drafting opposition to MtD |
| 12/29/2020 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 225.00 | 450.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 12/29/2020 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.20 | 110.00 | 550.00 | Coordinate a call with JSLF. |
| 12/29/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.20 | 90.00 | 450.00 | Prepare for conversation with JSLF team and coordinate same; participate in call; follow up with correspondences internally regarding the next steps. |
| 12/29/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.90 | 405.00 | 450.00 | Initial review of the expert disclosures produced by defendants and the supplement filed by defendants. |
| 12/30/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 1.40 | 630.00 | 450.00 | Analyze email sent by D. Charest, and email B Burk to move forward with androvet campaign. |
| 12/31/2020 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.30 | 135.00 | 450.00 | Reviewed relevant Texas law, read negligence cases cited by D, and prepared counterargs to use in opposition of MtD |
| 01/01/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 3.20 | 2,240.00 | 700.00 | Read Texas cases cited by YT in MTD and prepared responsive arguments for use in opposition brief |
| 01/04/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 2.50 | 1,750.00 | 700.00 | |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|--------|--|
| 01/05/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.70 | 210.00 | 300.00 | Reviewing and circulating ADR Certification; emailing with Androvett; reviewing intake forms to prepare for moderator calls; |
| 01/05/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 3.10 | 2,170.00 | 700.00 | Drafted and edited response to motion to dismiss |
| 01/05/2021 | A103 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.40 | 280.00 | 700.00 | Review and revise leads website |
| 01/05/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 760.00 | 950.00 | Confer with trial team re MTD briefing and litigation strategy; review file materials. |
| 01/06/2021 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.70 | 490.00 | 700.00 | Analyze the SJ order in the Washington case, review safeguards program set up in scola for use in this case; share those documents with D. Charest. |
| 01/06/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 350.00 | 700.00 | Edited response to motion to dismiss |
| 01/06/2021 | A103 | Biblo, Mallory | 1.40 | 980.00 | 700.00 | Review and revise ads; telephone conference with Ms. Burk regarding sme |
| 01/06/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.70 | 490.00 | 700.00 | Began to draft additional section of response to motion to dismiss re UCL claims |
| 01/07/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | Participate in weekly call; |
| 01/07/2021 | A107 | Yelton, Rick | 0.70 | 490.00 | 700.00 | Participate in videoconference with counsel in other case representing content moderators to discuss the standard of care aspect of these cases. |
| 01/07/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.60 | 1,120.00 | 700.00 | Drafted additional sections and edited response to MtD |
| 01/07/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 01/07/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Participated in weekly BC call re status of case |
| 01/07/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 570.00 | 950.00 | Confer with trial team re file status, task assignments, and litigation strategy; review file materials. |
| 01/08/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 2.60 | 1,820.00 | 700.00 | Edited and checked case citations in response to MtD |
| 01/11/2021 | 1141 | Yelton, Rick | 0.40 | 280.00 | 700.00 | Review draft opposition assembled by P Murphree on the issue of UCL, workers' compensation exclusivity, and negligence; review cases cited therein. |
| 01/11/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Prepared final document of BC portion of response to MtD for circulation |
| 01/11/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 475.00 | 950.00 | Confer with trial team re briefing status for opposition to motion to dismiss; confer with trial team re outreach efforts; confer with leadership re same. |
| 01/14/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | Attend weekly call. |
| 01/14/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 01/14/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Participated in weekly BC internal meeting |
| 01/15/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Brainstormed new language for ad with MB |
| 01/15/2021 | A104 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.70 | 490.00 | 700.00 | Review and revise ads |
| 01/21/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | Editing YouTube forms for intake; participating in weekly call; |
| 01/21/2021 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.50 | 350.00 | 700.00 | Participate in weekly BC call to discuss updates on drafting and identifying class reps; reach out to connections and arrange for call on the next day. |
| 01/21/2021 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Coordinate with team to obtain the updated firm resume and send same to JSLF for purposes of mtn to be named class counsel. |
| 01/21/2021 | A103 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 01/21/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Participated in weekly BC meeting re organizing process on case |
| 01/21/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 475.00 | 950.00 | Confer with leadership re file status and opposition to motion to dismiss briefing; confer with trial team re same. |
| 01/22/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 1.10 | 330.00 | 300.00 | Preparing YouTube content moderator form and excel spreadsheet; call with content moderator N. Pope (vm); |
| 01/22/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Met with KM re strategic structure of response to MtD |
| 01/22/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 280.00 | 700.00 | Read current draft of response to MtD |
| 01/22/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Met with KM re strategy for editing response to MtD |
| 01/22/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 6.90 | 4,830.00 | 700.00 | Redrafted and edited response to MtD |
| 01/22/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | Had phone call with KM at JSLF re status of opposition brief re motion to dismiss and coordinating handoffs of same |
| 01/24/2021 | 1141 | Yelton, Rick | 1.80 | 1,260.00 | 700.00 | Review the draft opposition that was circulated by P. Murphree; make edits and recirculate. |
| 01/24/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 2.90 | 2,030.00 | 700.00 | Edited brief in opposition to MtD |
| 01/24/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Drafted notice of dismissal of strict liability claim |
| 01/25/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Researched re ability to use Rule 41 to dismiss some but not all of the claims |
| 01/25/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Talked with KM re strategy of including or not including detailed Cali law in brief |
| 01/25/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Reviewed opposition brief to MtD |
| 01/26/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Reviewing and saving plaintiff's opposition to defendant's motion to dismiss; |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|--------|--|
| 01/28/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | Participated in weekly BC meeting |
| 01/28/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 01/28/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 120.00 | 300.00 | Attend weekly call; calendaring hearing on motion to dismiss; Call with C. Crane to set up time to discuss intake for CM; call with R. Mendoza re CM intake; call with N. Pope re CM intake (vm); preparing email to team; |
| 02/02/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.90 | 270.00 | 300.00 | Speak over the phone with Accenture manager who anonymously reached out to me. |
| 02/03/2021 | A106 | Yelton, Rick | 0.40 | 280.00 | 700.00 | Attend weekly call; |
| 02/04/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 02/04/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Participated in BC planning/strategy meeting re clients |
| 02/04/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 02/11/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Participated in weekly BC meeting |
| 02/11/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Attend weekly call; calling lead for content moderator (S. Ricke) |
| 02/11/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | (vm); Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward; email Androvett regarding LinkedIn ads. |
| 02/18/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Participated in weekly BC internal meeting |
| 02/18/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Attend weekly call; |
| 02/18/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Read and analyzed reply to motion to dismiss in light of response to determine necessity of filing sur-reply |
| 02/23/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.20 | 840.00 | 700.00 | Review recent filing; confer with trial team re same. |
| 02/23/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 475.00 | 950.00 | |
| 02/23/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Reviewing and circulating YouTube's reply ISO motion to dismiss; Speak with possible class rep lead; in light of conversation, follow-up with an employment law contact to get list of possible attorneys to represent the client. |
| 03/05/2021 | 1137 | Yelton, Rick | 0.80 | 560.00 | 700.00 | Prepped for oral argument with KM |
| 03/08/2021 | 1143 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 350.00 | 700.00 | Attend weekly call; |
| 03/11/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | Participate in weekly internal phone call. |
| 03/11/2021 | A105 | Yelton, Rick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 03/11/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | Prepared outline of hot questions for oral argument on MTD to assist KM prep |
| 03/11/2021 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.90 | 1,330.00 | 700.00 | Participated in internal BC call re case strategy |
| 03/11/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Call with D. Evans (former content mod for Facebook) re referral for content mods for this case; |
| 03/12/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | Researched re possibly way to use civil code to make negligence a statutory cause of action |
| 03/16/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 350.00 | 700.00 | Speak over the phone with potential class representative about his employment law claim and send the name of referred attorneys. |
| 03/17/2021 | A106 | Yelton, Rick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | Attending weekly call; |
| 03/18/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | Participate in weekly BC teamwide call. |
| 03/18/2021 | A105 | Yelton, Rick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward |
| 03/18/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Participated in weekly BC call |
| 03/18/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Reviewing and circulating order vacating hearing on defendant's motion to dismiss and updating calendar; |
| 03/19/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Send email to Androvett rep and also another to co-counsel regarding the status of identifying current moderator. |
| 03/29/2021 | A108 | Yelton, Rick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Phone conversation with androvett representative discussing the current campaign and strategizing for better success in identifying current mods. |
| 04/01/2021 | A108 | Yelton, Rick | 0.60 | 420.00 | 700.00 | Email Androvett regarding updating website; in-person conference with Mr. Charest regarding same |
| 04/01/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.40 | 280.00 | 700.00 | Discussing info@burnscharest.com email with R. Licon and emailing with team re same; |
| 04/02/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Reviewing and circulating notice of firm name change; |
| 04/15/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Reviewing 3 lead submissions; call with M. Flaherty re intake and setting up call for later; call with S. Ricke re intake and leaving vm; updating team re same; |
| 04/21/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | Participated in weekly BC meeting |
| 04/22/2021 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Call with P. Aldama re intake (vm); |
| 04/22/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | [No Charge] Reviewing docket, active complaints, and factual assertions to get caught up on case |
| 04/26/2021 | A104 | Fairchild, Grace | 0.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | Call with M. Flaherty to set up call this evening; call with S. Ricke (vm); call with P. Aldama (vm). |
| 04/28/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 120.00 | 300.00 | |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|--------|---|
| 04/29/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 120.00 | 300.00 | Updating team re contact with leads; call with M. Flaherty (vm). [No Charge] Researching relevant laws applicable to complaint; |
| 04/29/2021 | A104 | Fairchild, Grace | 0.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | developing questions about jurisdiction Speak with D Charest about documents that may be useful to |
| 05/03/2021 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.40 | 280.00 | 700.00 | reporter; identify same and circulate. |
| 05/04/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Redacting accenture doc per R. Yelton and circulating same; |
| 05/05/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Updating team re calls with leads; Discussing incoming calls with B. Prewitt; discussing emails to |
| 05/06/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.50 | 150.00 | 300.00 | info@burnscharest.com with R. Licon; emailing with B. Burk; Confer with leadership re hearing date and related issues; confer |
| 06/21/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 570.00 | 950.00 | with Google counsel re hearing date and potential settlement issues; confer with trial team re same. |
| 06/22/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | Reviewing and circulating clerk's notice setting the hearing on the motion to dismiss; calendaring hearing; Participated in call re planning for oral argument with JSLF |
| 06/25/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.00 | 700.00 | 700.00 | attorneys |
| 07/11/2021 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.80 | 560.00 | 700.00 | Reviewed briefing in prep for mootng Kate for MtD hearing |
| 07/11/2021 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.50 | 1,050.00 | 700.00 | Mooted Kate for oral argument on MtD |
| 07/13/2021 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | Had prep call with Kate re oral argument on MtD |
| 07/13/2021 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.30 | 910.00 | 700.00 | Attended hearing re MtD Discussed next steps following hearing based on judge's |
| 07/13/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | comments with KM |
| 07/13/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Drafted email reported results of hearing for BC team Reviewing and circulating clerk's notice re Zoom hearing with the |
| 07/13/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Zoom link and information; updating calendar re same; |
| 07/14/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Reviewed court order re amending complaint Messaged with BC and JSLF attorneys re plan for amending |
| 07/14/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | complaint Reviewing and circulating minute entry for hearing on motion to |
| 07/14/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 120.00 | 300.00 | dismiss with leave to amend and updating the calendar; Discussed strategy for responding to YT re amending complaint |
| 07/15/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | with RY |
| 07/15/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Reviewing and circulating transcript request form; |
| 07/16/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 280.00 | 700.00 | Researched re issue of YT as special employer Call and leave voicemail for potential clients E. Kolar, J. Jimenez |
| 07/20/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.80 | 240.00 | 300.00 | and D. Urdiales; call with D. Urdiales and discussing with team; |
| 07/21/2021 | A104 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Review Moderators Intake Form for Diego Urdiales Confer with trial team re potential clients and related issues; |
| 07/21/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 475.00 | 950.00 | review file materials. Emails with team regarding potential class plaintiff; telephone |
| 07/22/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | conference with content moderator Diego Urdiales (vm) |
| 07/22/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.70 | 490.00 | 700.00 | Participated in call with KM re strategy for amending complaint |
| 07/22/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | Had call with RY re potential new client Researched re standing for employee offered a job but who |
| 07/22/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.80 | 560.00 | 700.00 | turned it down under UCL Call with C. Leininger re form submission re content moderation; |
| 07/22/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | updating team re same; Communicate with potential class representative; following the |
| 07/22/2021 | 1135 | Yelton, Rick | 0.70 | 490.00 | 700.00 | call, speak over the phone with P Murphree regarding potential for adding class rep who had recent opportunity to be employed by team. Emailed and met with HC re material needs for project |
| 07/26/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | concerning standing of former employee who turned down YT job offer |
| 07/28/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | Call (vm) with J. Jimenez; call (vm) with E. Kolar; Discussions with team regarding strategy moving forward; |
| 07/29/2021 | 1137 | Biblo, Mallory | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | telephone conference with content moderator Diego Urdiales (vm) |
| 07/29/2021 | A108 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 280.00 | 700.00 | Participated in call with YT counsel re discovery of agreements between YT and vendors |
| 07/29/2021 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Emailed with KM re next steps following meeting with YT counsel Confer with trial team re call schedule and related logistics; |
| 07/29/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.70 | 665.00 | 950.00 | confer with Google counsel re file status, potential stipulations, and pleading deadlines; confer with trial team re same. |
| 07/30/2021 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | Emailed with cocounsel re potential new class reps and when to add to complaint |
| 07/30/2021 | A106 | Yelton, Rick | 1.10 | 770.00 | 700.00 | Communicate with multiple contacts regarding addition of new class rep.; discuss strategy for same internally. |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|--|
| 08/02/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 280.00 | 700.00 | Reviewing and circulating notice of transcript availability; reviewing PACER re KE involvement and reporting to D. Charest; |
| 08/02/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | Reviewing and circulating transcript order form; Reviewed research memo re former employee standing issues for use in amending complaint |
| 08/05/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | 700.00 Emailed with KM re amending complaint |
| 08/06/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | 700.00 Participated in call with YT re possible settlement |
| 08/09/2021 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 210.00 | 700.00 | 700.00 Prepared summary of call with YT for BC team |
| 08/09/2021 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | 700.00 Confer with trial team re stipulations and trial schedule; confer with YouTube counsel re same; review file materials. |
| 08/09/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 475.00 | 950.00 | 950.00 Reviewing and saving email agreement re Youtube's amended and restate master services agreement and statement of work being highly confidential AEO; reviewing and circulating notice of withdrawal of counsel; |
| 08/09/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 90.00 | 300.00 | 300.00 Reviewed and edited stipulation re extending time for amending complaint |
| 08/10/2021 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | 700.00 Reviewing and circulating joint stipulated request and proposed order to extend time to file complaint; reviewing and circulating order granting stipulation and calendaring deadline to file amended complaint; |
| 08/16/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 120.00 | 300.00 | 300.00 Call with M. Thornton re intake as potential client; call with E. Hoskins (vm) re intake as potential client; updating team on both; |
| 08/24/2021 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 120.00 | 300.00 | 300.00 Read Google-Accenture contract to understand Google retained authority for potential amendment to complaint |
| 08/25/2021 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.80 | 560.00 | 700.00 | 700.00 Reviewing and saving document production from Google-Youtube and discussing same with P. Murphree; |
| 08/25/2021 | 1139 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 60.00 | 300.00 | 300.00 Confer with YouTube counsel re conference call logistics and settlement discussions' confer with leadership re same. |
| 10/11/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 475.00 | 950.00 | 950.00 Confer with YouTube counsel re conference call logistics and settlement discussions' confer with leadership re same. |
| 10/12/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 475.00 | 950.00 | 950.00 Confer with leadership re settlement discussions, litigation strategy, and next steps; confer with trial team re same; review file materials; confer with leadership re litigation strategy. |
| 10/13/2021 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.00 | 950.00 | 950.00 | 950.00 Emailed BC re status of case |
| 12/29/2021 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 70.00 | 700.00 | 700.00 Communicated with BC team re plans for responding to court order re compliance with amended complaint |
| 01/05/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 140.00 | 700.00 | 700.00 Emailed with Dan C and Kate M separately re plans for complying with court order for status update |
| 01/10/2022 | A107 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | 750.00 Confer with leadership re settlement discussions and mediation plans; confer with trial team re same; review file materials. |
| 01/10/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 630.00 | 1,050.00 | 1,050.00 Emailed with Kate M re status of response to court order for status update |
| 01/11/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | 750.00 Confer with leadership re mediation and related issues; review file materials; confer with Google counsel re mediation; confer with leadership re litigation strategy and next steps; confer with trial team re same. |
| 01/13/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.20 | 1,260.00 | 1,050.00 | 1,050.00 Reviewed filing of status report with court |
| 01/14/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | 750.00 Confer with leadership re mediation logistics and preparation; confer with trial team re same; confer with Google counsel re mediation logistics. |
| 01/19/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 630.00 | 1,050.00 | 1,050.00 Confer with leadership re mediation and related issues; confer with YouTube counsel re same; confer with trial team re same; prepare for mediation. |
| 01/20/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 630.00 | 1,050.00 | 1,050.00 Confer with leadership re expert meeting and mediation preparation; coordinate same with trial team; review file materials. |
| 02/04/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.70 | 735.00 | 1,050.00 | 1,050.00 Confer with experts re potential expert engagement and related issues; review file materials; confer with trial team re experts and settlement discussion. |
| 02/07/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.90 | 945.00 | 1,050.00 | 1,050.00 Participated in call with our experts re initial information needed from Google to begin making recommendations |
| 02/07/2022 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | 750.00 Investigated sample of retention agreement for experts (Watson and Norman) |
| 02/07/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | 750.00 Researched for expert engagement letter |
| 02/08/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | 750.00 Prepared draft engagement letter for experts (Watson + Norman) |
| 02/08/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | 750.00 |
| 02/08/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.10 | 32.50 | 325.00 | 325.00 Reviewing and saving template expert agreement for P. Murphree; Confer with YouTube counsel re mediation issues and logistics; |
| 02/09/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 630.00 | 1,050.00 | 1,050.00 confer with trial team re same. |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 02/09/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Discussing distro lists with P. Murphree; reviewing and saving draft of expert engagement letter; |
| 02/10/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Edited engagement letters for experts Norman and Watson |
| 02/10/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with co-counsel and internally to arrange distribution list serv |
| 02/10/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.90 | 945.00 | 1,050.00 | Prepare for settlement conference; review file materials; attend settlement conference and mediation preparation session. |
| 02/11/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Saving drafts of expert engagement letters; discussing email distribution lists with P. Murphree and T. Sanchez; |
| 02/13/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Dan C re plan for drafting mediation brief for Westerfield |
| 02/14/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Followed up with co counsel on approval for engagement letters for Norman and Watson |
| 02/14/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Proofread and finalized expert engagmt letters for Watson and Norman |
| 02/14/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.60 | 195.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing mediation confirmation letter and calendaring mediation and deadline to submit mediation briefing; formatting and revising expert engagement letters and discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 02/16/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Finalized and sent engagement letters to Drs Norman and Watson along with request for status update on their list of needed information from YT to build their plans |
| 02/16/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re mediation plans and related logistics; confer with YouTube counsel re same. |
| 02/16/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Dr Norman and Dan C and co-counsel re Dr Norman rate increase |
| 02/16/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Updating expert files for S. Norman and P. Watson with engagement letters; |
| 02/17/2022 | 9901 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Updated Watson engaged letter to reflect new fee agreement |
| 02/17/2022 | 9901 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Updated and recirculated Norman engagement letter (expert) |
| 02/17/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving revised expert engagement letters for S. Norma and P. Watson; |
| 02/18/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Sonya re engagement letter |
| 02/18/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Updated group on status of Watson and Norman expert |
| 02/18/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Coordinated payment for invoice for mediation with JLSF |
| 02/18/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.10 | 32.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving fully executed expert engagement letter from S. Norman; |
| 02/22/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with c=counsel re info for mediation and to send to experts |
| 02/22/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed YT proposal for high-level settlement terms and shared with our experts for review |
| 02/22/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed mediator with list of attendees for plaintiffs |
| 02/22/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed co-counsel re reply brief to K Line supplemental briefing |
| 02/24/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.70 | 735.00 | 1,050.00 | Prepare for mediation; confer with trial team re same. |
| 02/24/2022 | A111 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re payment of invoice for JAMS |
| 02/24/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.10 | 32.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving fully executed expert agreement for P. Watson; |
| 02/25/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Prepare for mediation; confer with trial team re same; coordinate mediation logistics. |
| 02/25/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed co-counsel re plan for drafting letter in response to mediator's request |
| 02/25/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.10 | 32.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing mediation letters and updating calendar entry; discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 02/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.70 | 525.00 | 750.00 | Edited letter to mediator prior to first mediation |
| 02/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed co-counsel re statement for mediator and payment of mediator fees |
| 02/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Proofread letter to mediator |
| 03/01/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Discussing link for mediation with team and T. Sanchez (separately); |
| 03/01/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.20 | 1,260.00 | 1,050.00 | Prepare for mediation; review file materials; confer with trial team re mediation planning and related issues. |
| 03/02/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 3.00 | 2,250.00 | 750.00 | Participated in mediation session with Judge Westerfield |
| 03/02/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with experts re information needs in order to evaluate injunctive relief part of settlement |
| 03/02/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Updating calendar entry with Zoom link and sending to T. Sanchez; |
| 03/02/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 5.40 | 5,670.00 | 1,050.00 | Prepare for mediation; review file materials; attend mediation; confer with trial team re mediation and litigation strategy. |
| 03/03/2022 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with expert re YT internal research on mods use of platform enhancements |
| 03/03/2022 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed questions for YT provided by experts |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 03/04/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Edited list of expert questions to send to YT for help with evaluating injunctive relief portion of settlement |
| 03/04/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed opposing counsel with questions experts want to know to evaluated settlement proposal |
| 03/04/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed experts re team call on Monday |
| 03/07/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Sonya N re potential pre-mediation meeting |
| 03/07/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.60 | 450.00 | 750.00 | Participated in mediation prep session with expert, Dan C, and Steve W |
| 03/07/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.40 | 1,470.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re mediation preparation and next steps; review file materials. |
| 03/08/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed YouTube answers to questions posed by our experts in advance of mediation session |
| 03/08/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with our experts re YT's response to their questions in advance of mediation session |
| 03/08/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Dan C and Steve W re YT response to employee numbers and answers to our questions from our experts |
| 03/08/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 5.30 | 3,975.00 | 750.00 | Participated in mediation |
| 03/08/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 6.20 | 6,510.00 | 1,050.00 | Prepare for mediation session; attend mediation session; confer with trial team re mediation session results and next steps. |
| 03/09/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving settlement terms; |
| 03/11/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Read ND Cal specific instructions for approval motions in class actions |
| 03/11/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with co-counsel and outside counsel re setting up meeting with YouTube experts and Plaintiffs experts re injunctive relief |
| 03/11/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 2.00 | 2,100.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with leadership re settlement issues and approval standards; confer with trial team re settlement administrator and related issues. |
| 03/14/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with opposing counsel and our experts re scheduling time for experts to meet with youtube experts |
| 03/14/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with co-counsel and experts re meeting with YT experts |
| 03/14/2022 | 1137 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.60 | 195.00 | 325.00 | Emailing with C. Clapp (Angeion), S. Wallace (KCC), and O. Brown (BrownGreer) re settlement administration to set up calls with D. Charest; calendaring calls and discussing with T. Sanchez; |
| 03/15/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.60 | 450.00 | 750.00 | Met with YT counsel and accenture counsel re getting number of class members and info re class members |
| 03/15/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged Dan C with recap of meeting with YT and Accenture |
| 03/15/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with co-counsel re recap of status of YouTube preliminary approval paperwork and related matters |
| 03/15/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with opposing counsel re attendance at meeting of experts from both sides |
| 03/19/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with experts re meeting with YT experts |
| 03/19/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with opposing counsel re Wednesdya meeting between our experts and YT experts |
| 03/20/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Steve W re questions on deadlines for finishing settlement work with YT |
| 03/21/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.60 | 195.00 | 325.00 | Call with C. Clapp from Angeion and D. Charest; call with S. Wallace from KCC and D. Charest; call with O. Brown from BrownGreer and D. Charest; |
| 03/22/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 130.00 | 325.00 | Call with A. Palmer (Epiq) re settlement administration; attend call with J. Keough (JND) re settlement administration; |
| 03/23/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving settlement admin bids from Brown Greer, Epiq (updated) and KCC; |
| 03/23/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement issues and data requirements; attend expert conference re workplace conditions and related issues; confer with YouTube counsel re settlement issues, timeline, and next steps. |
| 03/24/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed experts re questions for YT and scheduling new meeting with YT experts |
| 03/24/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re status of YT case after abortive meeting of exerperts on 3/23 |
| 03/24/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YouTube counsel and experts re schedule and plans for upcoming call between Plaintiff and YT experts |
| 03/27/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with opposing counsel re questions from our experts to YT |
| 03/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Participated in call with YT re questions from experts to be answered before they can sign off on settlement |
| 03/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had call with Patricia W re call with YT for expert approval of settlement |
| 03/28/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Dan C and Steve W re Patricia Watson missing call and to report on my call with Patricia |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 03/28/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with opposing counsel to relay Dr Watson apology for missing scheduled call |
| 03/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 3.30 | 2,475.00 | 750.00 | Edited draft of settlement agreement circulated by YouTube |
| 03/28/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 630.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re expert information exchange, settlement issues, and next steps; review file materials. |
| 03/29/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with opposing counsel re value of opt out threshold |
| 03/29/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had call with JLSF re plans for next steps in settlement |
| 03/29/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 1.40 | 455.00 | 325.00 | Preparing comparison of KCC, Angeion, Epiq, and BrownGreer bids; emailing with J. Keough re JND bid; |
| 03/30/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Researched re disclosing or not disclosing opt out threshold in class settlements |
| 03/30/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Researched re how far to disclose Blow provision in settlement for Judge Gonzalez specifically |
| 03/30/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Researched re how far to disclose Blow provision in settlement for Judge Gonzalez Rogers specifically |
| 03/30/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re Judge ROgers concerns with making existence of side agreements clear |
| 03/30/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed Steve Williams edits to YT proposed settlement agreement |
| 03/30/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.00 | 750.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed proposals and costs from settlement administrators |
| 03/30/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Edited proposed settlement agreement in preparation for returning it to YouTube |
| 03/30/2022 | 1142 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing bids; emailing with J. Keough; |
| 03/30/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 630.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re class administrator bids and related issues; confer with trial team re settlement agreement draft review, motion papers, and next steps; review file materials. |
| 03/31/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed YT counsel with comments on settlement agreement draft |
| 03/31/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with co counsel re question about scope of NDAs and whether to include in settlement agreement |
| 04/10/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.10 | 825.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed and commented on YT edits to settlement agreement |
| 04/11/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Steve W re responding to YT proposal re settlement agreement |
| 04/12/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed co-counsel re settlement administrator selection |
| 04/12/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed opposing counsel re settlement agreement review |
| 04/12/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating defendant's answer to 2nd amended complaint; |
| 04/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed BC and JLSF re meeting re selecting administrator and subpoenaing records from YT vendors |
| 04/19/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC and JLSF re meetings internally and with YouTube this week |
| 04/19/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed YouTube proposed supplemental agreement and material re platform enhancements |
| 04/20/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re expert evaluation and settlement issues; review file materials. |
| 04/20/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed opposing counsel re question about answer to our experts questions and scheduling meeting |
| 04/20/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Prepared comparisons for proposed injunctive relief for experts |
| 04/20/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed experts re YT answers to questions re platform enhancements and to request input on injunctive relief |
| 04/20/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Edit supplemental confidential agreement |
| 04/20/2022 | A111 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Worked with IT to resolve issue preventing attachment of files to share with experts |
| 04/20/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and BC re edits to supplemental confidential agreement |
| 04/20/2022 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.90 | 675.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed material re platform enhancements and need for same shared by YT |
| 04/20/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed JLSF and BC counsel re summary of key points of documents circulated by YT re platform enhancements |
| 04/21/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement issues and progress; review file materials. |
| 04/21/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re scheduling meeting on various issues to discuss (administrators, YT responses to requests, number of class members) |
| 04/22/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Sonya Norman re response to YT answers re tech enhancements |
| 04/24/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re meeting re case |
| 04/24/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed summary of status of ongoing issues to BC and JLSF attorneys in advance of meeting |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|--|
| | | | | | | Confer with trial team re settlement administration, settlement issues, and task assignments; confer with settlement administrators re vendor bids and adjustments; review file materials. |
| 04/25/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.60 | 1,680.00 | 1,050.00 | |
| 04/25/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Had call with JLSF re next steps in YT case and settlement |
| 04/25/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Drafted email to YT counsel re questions from expert re injunctive relief |
| 04/25/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with JLSF re NDA provision in settlement agreement |
| 04/25/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with counsel for YT re edits to confidential supplemental agreement |
| 04/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Researched to compare proposals for settlement administrators around case/project management costs to identify differences contributing ot price difference |
| 04/25/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emaild back and forth with BC and JLSF re settlement administrator selection |
| 04/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild KCC re work as settlement administrator |
| 04/26/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with Plaintiff team and opposing counsel re settlement |
| 04/28/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emaild back and forth with JLSF and YT re status of settlement |
| 04/28/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild to schedule meet and confer with YT and JLSF |
| 04/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild Patricia Watson re position on YouTube injunctive relief in advance of meeting with YT |
| 04/28/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 3.50 | 2,625.00 | 750.00 | Edited draft of preliminary approval motion |
| 04/29/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with Patricia W re research on appropriateness of YT SRT |
| 05/01/2022 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed material provided by expert Patricia Watson in advance of call with YT |
| 05/02/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.40 | 1,470.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with YouTube counsel re settlement draft and related issues; confer with trial team re same. |
| 05/02/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with JLSF re meeting with YT re settlement agreement |
| 05/02/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.00 | 750.00 | 750.00 | Participated in call re settlement agreement with YT counsel |
| 05/02/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.70 | 525.00 | 750.00 | Edited settlement agreement to incorporate changes discussed at meeting with YT |
| 05/02/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with co-counsel re next steps following meeting with YT |
| 05/02/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild experts to update on status of negotiations following call with YT re settlement |
| 05/03/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 630.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement administrator; confer with KCC re settlement administration and engagement issues; review file materials. |
| 05/03/2022 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Had call with JLSF re YT settlement agreement and paperwork |
| 05/03/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild Dan C and Steve W re YT request for preliminary approval papers |
| 05/04/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re draft preliminary approval parers, comments to same, and related issues; confer with trial team re settlement issues and next steps. |
| 05/04/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Edited draft prelim approval motion and brief |
| 05/08/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with contact at KCC re update on status of settlement |
| 05/09/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with JLSF re Accenture in house counsel |
| 05/09/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed material provided by YT re class members |
| 05/09/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Emaild back and forth with JLSF and BC re YT info re class members and unresolved issues before filing for preliminary approval |
| 05/10/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.70 | 735.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement issues and class size; confer with YouTube counsel re same; coordinate settlement agreement draft edits and related issues. |
| 05/10/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Participated in call with YT re settlement |
| 05/10/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Edited settlement agreement and supplement per call with YT |
| 05/10/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild experts re approving settlement injunctive relief |
| 05/10/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with JLSF re approval of settlement agreement before circulation to YT |
| 05/10/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with JLSF re response to YT re timing for settlement agreement |
| 05/10/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild YT counsel re settlement agreement draft and expert questions |
| 05/10/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed edits to proposed injunctive relief provided by expert |
| 05/10/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with Dan C and JLSF re response to YT and expert re expert comments on injunctive relief |
| 05/11/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Drafted email to experts re injunctive relief for settlement |
| 05/11/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild BC and JLSF re expert positions on injunctive relief |
| 05/11/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with experts re YT settlement |
| 05/11/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with Patricia W re YT settlement |
| 05/11/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emaild with Dan C and JLSF re plans for approach YT following expert sign off on the settlement |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 05/11/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with experts and attorneys re scheduling call re settlement |
| 05/12/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Emailed multiple times with JLSF, BC, and experts re meeting to discuss injunctive relief |
| 05/12/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Prepared for call with Expert re YT settlement |
| 05/12/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Had call with experts re views on settlement and answer their questions re injunctive relief |
| 05/12/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Sent recap email to JLSF following call with experts |
| 05/15/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed YT edits to settlement agreement and compare to prior conversations |
| 05/15/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re response to YT re edits to settlement agreement |
| 05/16/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.50 | 1,575.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with YouTube counsel re settlement agreement and related issues; revise and edit draft settlement agreement; confer with trial team re same. |
| 05/16/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.60 | 450.00 | 750.00 | Had call with Dan C and JLSF re responding to YT edits to settlement |
| 05/16/2022 | 1139 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Edited subpoena to accenture re content moderator numbers |
| 05/16/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re subpoena for Accenture |
| 05/18/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with Google counsel re settlement agreement confer with trial team re same; review file materials. |
| 05/18/2022 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Read expert recommendation document prepared by Drs Watson and Norman before circulation to YT |
| 05/18/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Read Google confidentiality agreement for potential inclusion in settlement agreement |
| 05/18/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed YT edits to settlement agreement |
| 05/18/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and Dan C re additional onsite counseling [provision in settlement agreement |
| 05/19/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.30 | 1,365.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with Google counsel re settlement agreement and related issues; confer with trial team re finalization of settlement agreement, expected filings, and next steps; review file materials. |
| 05/19/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Participated in settlement discussion with YT |
| 05/19/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed settlement agreement carefully for language abotu timing or approval of announcements |
| 05/20/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 2.60 | 2,730.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with Google counsel re settlement agreement and related issues; confer with trial team re finalization of settlement agreement and report to court. |
| 05/20/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed back and forth with JLSF and YT re joint status report |
| 05/20/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed YT edits to settlement agreement and checked accuracy of changed math |
| 05/20/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged wiwth Dan C re status of signed settlement agreeemnt |
| 05/23/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement papers, finalization of settlement, and related issues' review file materials. |
| 05/24/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement papers, finalization of settlement, and related issues' review file materials; confer with Google counsel re settlement and related issues. |
| 05/25/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating the joint status report and proposed order; |
| 06/13/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed emails from Accenture counsel re class member data and numbers |
| 06/14/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.80 | 600.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed class member data produced by Accenture for accuracy with estimates, comparison to previously produced data, and potential inaccuracies within the data |
| 06/14/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re Accenture data production of class members |
| 06/14/2022 | 1139 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving Accenture's production and discussing with P. Murphree; reviewing and saving YT's content mod roster and discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 06/16/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had call with Steve Williams re Accenture's class roster produced |
| 06/16/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YT counsel re Accenture roster of class members |
| 06/16/2022 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YT counsel and JLSF re arranging meetings |
| 06/17/2022 | 1136 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Participated in call with Steve W and YT counsel re class data list |
| 06/17/2022 | 1136 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with Steve W re remaining materials to assemble for prelim approval motion |
| 06/17/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Researched timing of engagement of settlement administrator |
| 06/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re engagement terms as settlement administrator |
| 06/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed JLSF and BC attorneys re KCC |
| 06/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with experts to update them on status of preliminary approval motion and declarations |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 06/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed BC and JLSF re final steps for preparing preliminary approval motion |
| 06/17/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement issues and administrator issues; review file materials; coordinate settlement administrator retention and related issues. |
| 06/18/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with settlement administrator re engagement agreement |
| 06/18/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re engagement agreement with settlement administrator |
| 06/20/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement issues and next steps; confer with Google counsel re same; review file materials. |
| 06/21/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 2.90 | 2,175.00 | 750.00 | Edited motion for preliminary approval to conform to ND Cal Guidance |
| 06/21/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 1.50 | 487.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing Scola settlement filings and discussing with P. Murphree; compiling data on class size and class notice per P. Murphree and discussing same with P. Murphree; |
| 06/22/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Drafted email to Epiq re info needed about FB settlement for use in YT prelim approval mtn |
| 06/22/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.30 | 975.00 | 750.00 | Edited motion for preliminary approval |
| 06/23/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Edited motion for preliminary approval |
| 06/23/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Epiq and with co-counsel re information for motion for preliminary approval |
| 06/23/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.10 | 1,155.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement issues and next steps; revise and edit draft motion for preliminary approval; confer with trial team re same. |
| 06/29/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Patricia W re Declaration |
| 07/03/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Steve W re declarations ISO mtn for preliminary approval |
| 07/03/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Edited short and long form notices |
| 07/03/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Dan C and Steve W re final prep for filing motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/03/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.70 | 735.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re notice program, settlement issues, and preliminary approval filing; review file materials; revise and edit draft approval submission. |
| 07/04/2022 | 1136 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Snow W at KCC re potential declaration ISO mtn for preliminary approval |
| 07/04/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 2.20 | 1,650.00 | 750.00 | Edited motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/04/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.60 | 450.00 | 750.00 | Drafted Declaration for Dan Charest ISO mtn for preliminary approval |
| 07/04/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Dan C and Steve W re status of work on motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/04/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Sonya Norman re executing declaration ISO motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/04/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.00 | 750.00 | 750.00 | Prepared proposed order granting motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/04/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.20 | 900.00 | 750.00 | Cross checked notice, motion for preliminary approval, and order to ensure compliance with Procedural Guidance for Class ACTION Settlements |
| 07/04/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Edited preliminary approval motion, order, notices, and Dan C declaration per Steve W comments |
| 07/04/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Steve W re changes to settlement paperwork and communication with YouTube counsel |
| 07/04/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed YouTube counsel re drafts of settlement paperwork (motion, order, notices) |
| 07/04/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re notice program, settlement issues, and preliminary approval filing; review file materials. |
| 07/05/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with Steve W re finalizing the preliminary approval package |
| 07/05/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Steve W and Snow W re edits to notices |
| 07/05/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Steve W re final versions of executed declarations |
| 07/05/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | ISO motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/05/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re execution of declaration ISO mtn for preliminary approval |
| 07/05/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Worked on updated and making consistent settlement motion paperwork |
| 07/05/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed SOnya N re declaration ISO motion for prelim approval |
| 07/05/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.90 | 675.00 | 750.00 | Proofread, assembled, and crosschecked package of materials for motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/05/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged Dan C and Julianna G re BC work on preliminary approval motion |
| 07/05/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Edited administrative motion to seal Exhibit 2 (confidential supplemental agreement) |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|--|
| 07/05/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed formatting of ToC in motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/05/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed final draft of motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/05/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed and messaged with STEve W and Dan C re final approval to file motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/05/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Emailed multiple times with JLSF and BC re filing of motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/05/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re draft approval briefs and related issues; review file materials. |
| 07/06/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re opposing counsel email re filing of motion for preliminary approval |
| 07/06/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with BC re providing KCC info to YouTube for settlement purposes |
| 07/06/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with co counsel re providing word version of settlement materials to court |
| 07/06/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving admin motion to file under seal exhibit for motion for preliminary approval and supporting docs; reviewing NDCA local rules; |
| 07/06/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.90 | 945.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement approval issues; confer with Google counsel re same; review file materials. |
| 07/07/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed JLSF re copying Ds on emails to the court |
| 07/07/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Juliana G re info to provide to KCC re settlement |
| 07/07/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Emailing with P. Murphree re motion for preliminary approval filing; emailing motion and exhibits to S. Wallace; |
| 07/11/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re info needed for YT to complete transfer of funds |
| 07/12/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Snow W re CAFA notice |
| 07/13/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re attendance on BC behalf at preliminary approval hearing |
| 07/13/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating plaintiffs' corrected admin motion for leave to seal ex. 2 to motion for preliminary approval; reviewing and circulating motion for preliminary approval and exhibits thereto; reviewing and circulating certificate of service re |
| 07/14/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | corrected admin motion; |
| 07/23/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed YT counsel re KCC wire instructions |
| 07/23/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YT counsel re wire info and W9 for settlement administrator |
| 07/23/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with settlement administrator re YT questions re wire instructions |
| 07/23/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re BC attendance person at preliminary approval hearing |
| 07/23/2022 | 9901 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.80 | 600.00 | 750.00 | Researched and purchased plane and hotel for travel to preliminary approval hearing |
| 07/25/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Snow W and Zach B re account for placing settlement fund |
| 07/25/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating YT's notice of non-opposition to the motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement; |
| 07/31/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | creating hearing prep folder and discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 07/31/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Investigated payment arrangements for Dr Norman |
| 07/31/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re payment for Dr Norman |
| 08/02/2022 | 9901 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Dr Norman re payment for expertwork |
| 08/12/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Adjusted travel arrangments to Oakland |
| 08/14/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Steve W re planning for prelim approval hearing attendance |
| 08/15/2022 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 7.90 | 5,925.00 | 750.00 | Made arrangements for SF trip |
| 08/15/2022 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.20 | 900.00 | 750.00 | Traveled from New Orleans to Oakland for preliminary approval hearing |
| 08/16/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Reviewed preliminary approval papers in preparation for preliminary approval hearing |
| 08/16/2022 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.70 | 525.00 | 750.00 | Confer with trial team re hearing results and next steps. |
| 08/16/2022 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Prepared materials to argue at preliminary approval hearing |
| 08/16/2022 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Traveled to and from preliminary approval hearing |
| 08/16/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Attended preliminary approval hearing |
| 08/16/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Met with co counsel to address concerns following preliminary approval hearing that was continued |
| 08/16/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed cocounsel re plans for complying with court requirements for supplementing preliminary approval papers |
| 08/16/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.80 | 600.00 | 750.00 | Prepared punch list for court's requirements for supplementing preliminary approval paperwork for organizing work with co counsel |
| 08/16/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JSLF associates re identifying final documents to use as base for editing to conform with court specifications |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|--|
| 08/16/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Edited settlement agreement and confidential settlement agreement to conform with court instructions |
| 08/16/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF associates re plan for submitting settlement agreement edits to Ds |
| 08/16/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re expert declarations for supplementary motion for preliminary approval |
| 08/16/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed JLSF attorneys re location of word version of Expert Dr Watson declaration |
| 08/16/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.80 | 600.00 | 750.00 | Drafted additional suggestions for Norman declaration to address concerns raised by court re adequacy of explanation in the declaration |
| 08/16/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re coordinating who will send revised settlement agreement to YT for approval to avoid duplicative emails or drafts |
| 08/16/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re plan re submitting settlement agreement versus agreement plus amended complaint to YT and strategic considerations therein |
| 08/16/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating supplemental declaration of S. Williams ISO motion for preliminary approval of class settlement and settlement agreement; |
| 08/17/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 3.70 | 3,885.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re supplemental briefing and related issues; revise and edit draft supplemental briefing materials; review file materials. |
| 08/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with experts re supplemental declarations for preliminary approval |
| 08/17/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.70 | 525.00 | 750.00 | Drafted and edited Watson Supplemental Declaration |
| 08/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed BC and JLSF re Watson supplemental declaration |
| 08/17/2022 | 1138 | Murphree, Patrick | 7.10 | 5,325.00 | 750.00 | Traveled from Oakland to New Orleans after preliminary approval hearing |
| 08/17/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 5.10 | 3,825.00 | 750.00 | Researched CA9 law re class action approval and redrafted motion for preliminary approval to accord with court's comments at 8/16 hearing |
| 08/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Assembled and annotated list of preliminary approval paperwork to update team on status of all moving pieces |
| 08/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Gayatri R and Bram M re coordinating plans for work on preliminary approval papers over Thursday and Friday |
| 08/17/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.70 | 227.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating minute entry; calendaring deadline for plaintiffs to file supplemental papers; calendaring hearing; reviewing and saving drafts of supplemental declarations and settlement agreement; reviewing docket for Facebook case re injunctive relief paragraph in S. Watson's declaration; |
| 08/18/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.70 | 735.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re supplemental briefing and related issues; revise and edit draft supplemental briefing materials; review file materials. |
| 08/18/2022 | 9901 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Completed reimbursement forms for SF trip for YouTube oral argument |
| 08/18/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.10 | 825.00 | 750.00 | Edited and redrafted amended complaint |
| 08/18/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Edited and added new allegations to Dan Charest declaration ISO preliminary approval |
| 08/18/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Edited draft of amended motion for preliminary approval |
| 08/19/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re supplemental briefing and related issues; revise and edit draft supplemental briefing materials; review file materials. |
| 08/19/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC and JLSF re edits to expert declarations |
| 08/19/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Had call with experts re supplemental declarations ISO preliminary approval |
| 08/19/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Made edits to complaint and expert declarations ISO motion for preliminary approval |
| 08/19/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Had call with Abraham M re edits to expert declarations ISO mtm for preliminary approval |
| 08/19/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re approval of materials for to send to YouTube re motion for preliminary approval |
| 08/19/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Had call with Abraham M re edits to amended complaint |
| 08/19/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed and edited amended complaint before sending to YT counsel |
| 08/19/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and Dr Norman re approval of edits to declaration ISO mtm for preliminary approval |
| 08/19/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed edits made by Sonya Norman to her declaration ISO mtm for preliminary approval |
| 08/19/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed edits made by Sonya Norman to her declaration ISO mtm for preliminary approval |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 08/19/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Prepared final declaration for Dan Charest ISO mtn for preliminary approval |
| 08/19/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C and Steve W re plans for filing motion ISO preliminary approval |
| 08/19/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed papers prior to filing mtn for prelimin approval |
| 08/19/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged BC attorneys re filing of preliminary approval papers |
| 08/19/2022 | 9901 | Murphree, Patrick | 4.20 | 3,150.00 | 750.00 | Remained BC attorney on call through filing process |
| 08/22/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 2.60 | 2,730.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement approval issues and YouTube comments to supplemental filings; confer with YouTube counsel re settlement approval and related issues; confer with trial team re same. |
| 08/22/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had call with Dan C re YT position on settlement |
| 08/22/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving amended complaint; reviewing and saving supplemental briefing, S. Williams declaration, D. Charest declaration, S. Watson declaration, P. Norman declaration, and the proposed order; reviewing and circulating notice re filing error fixed by clerk; |
| 08/23/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.90 | 945.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement approval issues and YouTube comments to supplemental filings; confer with YouTube counsel re settlement approval and related issues; confer with trial team re same. |
| 08/23/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Met with Amanda K and Corey N re status of supplemental motion for preliminary approval |
| 08/23/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re which attorney to attend 9/20 hearing |
| 08/23/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating 2nd supp declaration of S. Williams ISO motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement and draft settlement agreement; |
| 08/31/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Prepare for preliminary approval hearing; confer with trial team re same; confer with trial team re approval papers and recent developments. |
| 09/08/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.10 | 1,155.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with YouTube counsel re settlement agreement and related issues; confer with trial team re same; coordinate settlement signing and related issues. |
| 09/08/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Participated in call with YT counsel re executing settlement agreement |
| 09/09/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating notice of filing executed settlement agreement; |
| 09/09/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating notice of filing executed settlement agreement and settlement agreement; |
| 09/12/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 630.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re court request re settlement; review file materials. |
| 09/19/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re court order vacating hearing |
| 09/19/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating order vacating hearing; updating calendar; |
| 09/28/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 630.00 | 1,050.00 | Review order on preliminary approval; confer with trial team re same; confer with YouTube counsel re same; coordinate corrective action. |
| 09/29/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Read court order granting motion for preliminary approval |
| 09/29/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Email;ed JLSF re error in court order granting preliminary approval |
| 09/29/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re court order granting preliminary approval |
| 09/30/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Messaged and emailed with co-counsel and opposing counsel re notifying court of error in preliminary approval order |
| 09/30/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.80 | 260.00 | 325.00 | Calls A. Garcia (courtroom deputy for Judge) re typo and mistake in order; discussing with P. Murphree and D. Charest; emailing with A. Garcia and all counsel re correct number of class members; reviewing and circulating amended order granting preliminary approval of class action settlement; running compare report of exhibit B (as filed) and exhibit B (as ordered) and discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 09/30/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed order entered by court amending order granting preliminary approval to confirm changes made |
| 09/30/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with settlement administrator re amended preliminary approval order |
| 09/30/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YouTube re class member data for administrator |
| 09/30/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Compared court Exhibit B to draft of long form notice to identify differences before sending to KCC |
| 09/30/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re notices and other materials necessary for notice plan and website |
| 10/01/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | EMailed experts re grant of preliminary approval |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|--|
| 10/04/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.60 | 630.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re post-approval process and class information; confer with YouTube counsel re same. |
| 10/04/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Calendar deadlines in order granting preliminary approval; |
| 10/06/2022 | 1140 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Researched re contact info for Accenture counsel |
| 10/06/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with Accenture counsel re class list and updates to same; confer with trial team re same. |
| 10/06/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re Accenture counsel' |
| 10/06/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing class member info required to send to settlement admin; discussing with D. Charest; emailing with D. Charest re same; |
| 10/11/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Checked proposed schedule against court order for settlement administration for accuracy |
| 10/11/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed YT counsel and settlement admin re schedule in light of dates set in court order |
| 10/12/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re meeting with YT re size of class |
| 10/13/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement approval, class size data, and related issues; review file materials. |
| 10/17/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Participated in call with YT re increased number of class members |
| 10/17/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Calculated pro rata increase in settlement amount necessary to account for increase in class members |
| 10/17/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re class size, settlement approval, and related issues; confer with YouTube re class size and settlement agreement; review file materials. |
| 10/18/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.30 | 1,365.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with leadership re settlement issues, approval process, and fee application; confer with trial team re same; coordinate approval issues; review file materials; confer with YouTube counsel re amendment to settlement for increased class size and related issues; confer with leadership re same. |
| 10/18/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Discussing fee motion and collecting time reports with D. Charest; discussing time entry confirmation with team; |
| 10/21/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YT BC and co-counsel re answers to questions posed by KCC |
| 10/21/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed drafts of notices for accuracy and conformance with approved versions by court |
| 10/21/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed drafts of notices for accuracy and conformance with approved versions by court |
| 10/24/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Dan C and Steve W re questions from KCC |
| 10/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re readiness of settlement website |
| 10/25/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC and co-counsel re approaching deadlines for class notice |
| 10/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed revised drafts of notices |
| 10/25/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Steve Williams re post-approval notification and dealing with duplicate class members |
| 10/25/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | ERmailed with KCC re settlement website, post-approval notice, and duplicate class members. |
| 10/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed list of duplicate class members |
| 10/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re list of duplicate class members |
| 10/25/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with co-counsel and BC re updating class size with court |
| 10/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re plan for dealing with class members with multiple email addresses |
| 10/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed proposed supplemental agreement sent by YT and checked for accuracy against settlement agreement and confidential supplemental agreement |
| 10/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Dan C and Steve W re potential issues with YT's proposed supplemental settlement agreement |
| 10/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed KCC settlement website to conform with accuracy and accessibility for class members |
| 10/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re issues with current version of settlement website to correct and include accurate docuemnts |
| 10/25/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re issues with current version of class website and changes to be made re increased settlement amount in light of increase in numbers of class members |
| 10/25/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed back and forth with co counsel re finalizing supplemental settlement agreement amount re increased clas size |
| 10/25/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed multiple times with with BC and co-counsel re approval of YT proposed language for supplemental settlement agreement and amounts therein |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 10/25/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.60 | 1,680.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re class size, settlement amendment, and related issues; confer with YouTube counsel re same; review file materials. |
| 10/26/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 2.40 | 2,520.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re class size, settlement amendment, and related issues; confer with YouTube counsel re same; review file materials; draft notice re settlement amendment and next steps; confer with trial team re same; confer with YouTube counsel re same. |
| 10/26/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Edited notice to court re increased settlement |
| 10/26/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YT re notice to court re increased settlement |
| 10/26/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Proofread notice to court re increased settlement amount |
| 10/26/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 130.00 | 325.00 | Drafting notice shell for D. Charest; discussing same with D. Charest; emailing with A. Jensen re filing; discussing paralegal change at JSLF with team; emailing recent version to JSLF; |
| 10/27/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating notice regarding class size and increase in settlement amount; emailing with R. Vazquez-Ponce; |
| 10/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re finalizing plans for sending notice to class members |
| 10/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re use of notice of increased class size and settlement amount in communication with class members |
| 10/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC and with lead counsel re updating info on settlement website re increased settlement amount |
| 10/28/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with BC attorneys and staff re class notice being sent, posting of notice of increased class size and settlement, and need to begin actively checking the class website |
| 10/28/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with BC attorneys and staff re class notice being sent, posting of notice of increased class size and settlement, and need to begin actively checking the class website |
| 10/28/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re class notice, notice program, and settlement issues; review file materials. |
| 10/31/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged Dan C re responsible firm for motion for attorney fees |
| 11/01/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re responsibility for drafting motion for attorney fees |
| 11/02/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing KCC website and logging visit to same; |
| 11/04/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re providing updates to class counsel and addressing YT issue with being able to transfer funds to KCC's account |
| 11/07/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.10 | 32.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing KCC notice website and filling out log; |
| 11/08/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Steve Williams re materials needed for motion for attorney fees |
| 11/09/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re update on status of notice, website, etc. |
| 11/09/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C and JLSF re call to discuss motion for attorney fees |
| 11/09/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re class members with bounceback emails |
| 11/10/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with Steve W re dividing work for motion for fees |
| 11/10/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.70 | 525.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed firm time entries and clarified text descriptions in preparation for motion for fees |
| 11/10/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Emailing with accounting re time report and discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 11/12/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.60 | 1,200.00 | 750.00 | Edited and corrected time report for BC attorneys and staff for use in motion for approval of fees |
| 11/12/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Rick Y and Julianna G re clarification of a few time entries while preparing motion for fees |
| 11/13/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed preliminary approval ruling for content of documentation to provide ISO mtn for fees |
| 11/14/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.70 | 735.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re file status, settlement issues, and fee application; review file materials; coordinate scheduling and task assignments. |
| 11/14/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.60 | 450.00 | 750.00 | Prepared draft declaration by D Charest ISO mtn for attorney fees |
| 11/14/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re info for class members that did not receive notice |
| 11/14/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed spreadsheet of class members without emails or addresses and emailed YT counsel re same to determine if YT or Accenture may have additional contact information |
| 11/14/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with A Youpee-ROll re potential additional information from Accenture re class members without email or physical addresses on file and suggested potentially useful pieces of info |
| 11/14/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Updated time entries to remove misfiled entries after discussion with BC attorneys and staff in preparation for preparing time for motion for fees |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 11/14/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re class rep info to provide to KCC and timing for submission of motion for fees and expenses |
| 11/14/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with J Gravois and P Bruns re records needed for expense and tiem reports for use in motion to fees and expenses |
| 11/14/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 130.00 | 325.00 | Emailing with P. Bruns re updated time report and expense report; discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 11/15/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 2.30 | 2,415.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re file status, settlement issues, and fee application; review file materials; revise and edit draft declaration; confer with trial team re same; confer with YouTube counsel re class contact information issues; confer with trial team re same. |
| 11/15/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Edited declaration of D Charest ISO mtn for fees and expenses |
| 11/15/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Met with J Gravois re items needed to complete BC work on motion for fees |
| 11/15/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed and accepted edits to declaration made by Dan Charest |
| 11/15/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed new information provided by YT counsel re 6 class members with no contact info |
| 11/15/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | EMailed and messaged with BC staff re research to identify contact info for 6 class members with no contact info |
| 11/15/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had callw ith Steve Williams re planning for motion for fees and deciding lodestar or percentage |
| 11/15/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 130.00 | 325.00 | Call with P. Murphree re tasks for motion for attorney's fees; emailing with P. Bruns re updated reports; updating draft folder with firm bio and discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 11/16/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re fee application and related issues; review draft filings; confer with trial team re same. |
| 11/16/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC staff re most up-to-date time and expense records for use in motion for fees |
| 11/16/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with BC staff re assembling info for expenses and updated time for use ISO mtn for fees and expenses |
| 11/16/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Prepared updated report of expenses and showing time through November 16 for use ISO mtn for attorney fees |
| 11/16/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed draft motion and declaration for S Williams |
| 11/16/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re draft motion and declaration of Steve Williams |
| 11/16/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.40 | 130.00 | 325.00 | Drafting on cost summary and fees summary; discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 11/17/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.80 | 1,890.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re fee application and related issues; review draft filings; confer with trial team re same. |
| 11/17/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 4.30 | 3,225.00 | 750.00 | Edited, redrafted, and proofread motion for fees |
| 11/17/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Performed initial review of revised motion for attorney fees in advance of full edit |
| 11/17/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Finalized language, formatting, and numbers in Dan Charest declaration ISO mtn for fees and supporting exhibits |
| 11/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re edited version of motion for fees and plan for finalizing materials on Friday |
| 11/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed and messaged with Dan C re final review of declaration ISO mtn for fees and supporting exhibits and status of edited version of motion for fees |
| 11/17/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan Charest re requirements for signing declaration ISO mtn for fees |
| 11/17/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC and YT counsel re researching addresses for 6 remainjng unnoticed class members |
| 11/17/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re need to post motion for fees once it is on file and to alert to potential need to do so over weekend |
| 11/17/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.80 | 260.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing time report and creating fees summary for motion for attorney's fees; reviewing cost report and creating summary for motion for attorney's fees; discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 11/18/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 2.60 | 2,730.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re fee application and related issues; review draft filings; confer with trial team re same. |
| 11/18/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed and accepted D Charest edits to motion for fees |
| 11/18/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JSLF re current version of motion for fees as edited by D Charest |
| 11/18/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed final version of D Charest declaration and exhibits ISO mtn for fees before sending to co-counsel |
| 11/18/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed JLSF re BC edits to mtn for fees and final version of D Charest declaration and supporting exhibits |
| 11/18/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC and JLSF re posting filed mtn for fees to settlement website once it is filed |
| 11/18/2022 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.90 | 675.00 | 750.00 | Edited and proofread JLSF revisions to motion for attorney fees |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 11/18/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.50 | 162.50 | 325.00 | Researching missing class member information and discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 11/23/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Researching missing class member information and discussing with P. Murphree; |
| 11/26/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed D Charest re date/time of final approval and decision needed on. BC representative to attend |
| 11/26/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re update on class members' use of website and phone number |
| 11/28/2022 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 1.10 | 357.50 | 325.00 | Researching missing class member information and discussing with P. Murphree; writing up notes and saving to Egnyte. |
| 11/29/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.10 | 1,155.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re final approval hearing and related logistics; prepare for final approval hearing. |
| 11/29/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with D Charest re setting hearing for final approval |
| 11/29/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan Charest re potential mailing addresses for class members without contact info and methods of making payments to class members |
| 11/29/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re notice to be sent to class members for whom addresses have now been located and need for round of notice after final approval to provide opportunity to submit instructions for electronic payment if desired |
| 11/30/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re drafting language for notice following approval and invitation to submit info for electronic payment to be sent to class members |
| 12/01/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with SOnya Norman re payment for expert services |
| 12/01/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC attorneys and staff re payments to expert Norman |
| 12/02/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Sonya Norman and BC accounting re payment |
| 12/04/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed Dan Charest re recent YT filing and plan for setting hearing on motion for final approval |
| 12/05/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with BC team re setting motion for final approval for hearing |
| 12/05/2022 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.70 | 227.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving notice re motion for attorneys' fees; discussing hearing scheduling issue with P. Murphree; reviewing ND Cal. local rules, reviewing Judge Gozales-Rogers' procedures and discussing hearing on motion for attorneys' fees then motion for final approval with D. Charest and P. Murphree; |
| 12/05/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re updates on notice to class members and operation of website and settlement agreement |
| 12/05/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re pending motions, hearing dates, and relate logistics; review file materials. |
| 12/07/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with D Charest re attendance obo BC at 2/14 final approval hearing |
| 12/07/2022 | A101 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.70 | 525.00 | 750.00 | Made travel arrangements for California for final approval hearing |
| 12/08/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re usage of website and phone line |
| 12/13/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re notice to class members re payment methods |
| 12/13/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC team re payment methods for class members |
| 12/18/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with D Charest re meeting to discuss settlement admin issues |
| 12/18/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re recent developments and file status; review file materials. |
| 12/19/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed draft email notice to methods of payment prepared by KCC |
| 12/20/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had call with D Charest re issues surrounding finalizing settlement and KCC invoices |
| 12/20/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re times for meeting to discuss process of distributing payments to class members |
| 12/20/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC and JLSF re meeting with KCC re finalizing plans for distribution logistics |
| 12/21/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and KCC re meeting time to discuss issues concerning final distribution |
| 12/27/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Prepared talking points for call with KCC re mechanics of payout of settlement |
| 12/28/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Met with KCC re questions re finalizing settlement process |
| 12/28/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with D Charest re results of meeting with KCC re finalizing settlement |
| 12/29/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed draft notice to class re electronic payment |
| 12/29/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC to follow up on tasks from call on 12/28 |
| 12/29/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and BC re issue of many class members without physical addresses (email addresses only) |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 12/29/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Examined data on class members to determine availability of mailing addresses |
| 12/29/2022 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re mailing addresses for class members |
| 12/29/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with D Charest re approach in light of missing class member physical addresses |
| 12/29/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed S Williams re approach in light of missing addresses for subset of class members |
| 12/29/2022 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re class notice issues and mailing addresses; coordinate response to lack of information. |
| 12/30/2022 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed MTO re class members addresses missing from data |
| 12/30/2022 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with S Williams re issues surrounding missing class member addresses |
| 01/02/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re class addresses, settlement approval, and related issues; review file materials. |
| 01/02/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with S Williams and D Charest re approach to YT counsel re need for class member addresses |
| 01/03/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed YT counsel re need for addresses for class members (follow up email) |
| 01/03/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with S Williams re call with YT re mailing addresses for class members |
| 01/03/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had call with YT counsel re missing class member addresses |
| 01/04/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with B Maggard re materials gathering for use in motion for final approval |
| 01/05/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with S Williams re approach to YT and Accenture re missing class member addresses |
| 01/05/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.70 | 525.00 | 750.00 | Drafted Declaration of Dan Charest ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/05/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed A Maggard re contents of declarations from class counsel ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/05/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Edited draft notice to class members for opting in to electronic payment |
| 01/05/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re notice to class members re electronic payment and mailing addresses |
| 01/05/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with S Williams re follow up email to YT and Accenture counsel re class members addresses |
| 01/06/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re draft declaration and invoice |
| 01/06/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Accenture and YT counsel re call re class member addresses |
| 01/08/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re meeting with YT and Accenture |
| 01/08/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and BC re plan for updating court as to time and expenses |
| 01/08/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Edited draft declaration of KCC ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/08/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Edited draft decalration of D Charest ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/09/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.20 | 1,260.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with YouTube counsel, Accenture counsel, claims administrator, and trial team re notice issues and potential resolution; confer with trial team re same; review file materials; revise and edit draft approval papers; confer with trial team re same. |
| 01/09/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Participated in call with KCC, YT, and Accenture re class member addresses |
| 01/09/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC and JLSF re modifications to declarations ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/09/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 3.30 | 2,475.00 | 750.00 | Edited drafts of motion for final approval, declarations of Williams and Charest, order granting final approval and final judgment |
| 01/09/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Steve Williams re final approval paperwork |
| 01/10/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.60 | 1,680.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re settlement approval issues; revise and edit draft approval papers; confer with trial team re same. |
| 01/10/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YT counsel re CAFA notice |
| 01/10/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re declaration ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/10/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed and messaged with YT counsel, JLSF, and BC re CAFA notice |
| 01/10/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with S Williams re D Charest edits to declaration ISO final approval |
| 01/10/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with S Williams re CAFA notice and response to YT re same |
| 01/10/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YT counsel re drafts of final approval papers |
| 01/10/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with S Williams re response to YT re CAFA notice |
| 01/10/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had calls and email with S Williams and YT counsel re call re CAFA notice |
| 01/10/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with YT counsel re CAFA notice |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|--|
| 01/10/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC and JLSF re CAFA notice issues and requirement in CAFA statute |
| 01/10/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had call with JLSF re approach to CAFA notice issue |
| 01/10/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC, BC, and JLSF re CAFA notice |
| 01/10/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan C re YT CAFA issues and plans for filing final approval papers |
| 01/10/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.90 | 1,425.00 | 750.00 | Edited final approval papers |
| 01/10/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and BC re edits to final approval paperwork |
| 01/11/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.70 | 1,785.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with YouTube re settlement and approval issues; confer with trial team re same; coordinate finalization of final approval motion. |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re draft of declaration ISO motion for final approval |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had call with YT counsel re CAFA notice |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had call with BC and JLSF re CAFA notice |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re KCC's declaration and CAFA notice |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re questions re CAFA notice |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed and edited CAFA notice documents for approval for KCC |
| 01/11/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed updated draft declaration from KCC ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/11/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had call with KCC re declaration ISO motion for final approval |
| 01/11/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed calculations in declaration in motion ISO final approval |
| 01/11/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re notice info from KCC for declaration |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed final draft of CAFA notice materials |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re final approval of CAFA notice materials |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed YT re CAFA notice materials to be sent |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re CAFA notice date foe service |
| 01/11/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with D Charest re issues re filing final approval motion |
| 01/11/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YT counsel and KCC re edit to CAFA notice |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.40 | 300.00 | 750.00 | Had call with KCC re info for completing declaration re notice |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Edited KCC draft declaration in light of information received in conversation with KCC re notice plan implementation |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Edited cover letter re CAFA notice |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re final language for cover letter for CAFA notice |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with D Charest re language for CAFA notice cover letter and KCC declaration |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with KCC re declaration |
| 01/11/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Researched re timing of CAFA notice and commencement of 90-day period |
| 01/11/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 1.90 | 1,425.00 | 750.00 | Edited D Charest, S Williams declarations and motion for final approval |
| 01/11/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed and edited declaration of KCC ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/11/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re declaration ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re CAFA notice draft and specific edits to be made |
| 01/11/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and BC re papers for final approval |
| 01/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Accenture counsel re progress on obtaining class member addresses |
| 01/12/2023 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving drafts for final approval motion materials; finalizing D. Charest's declaration and circulating to JLSF; |
| 01/12/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 2.80 | 2,940.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re final approval papers; revise and edit same; confer with YouTube counsel re approval papers, hearing date, and related issues. |
| 01/12/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.50 | 375.00 | 750.00 | Edited final approval papers |
| 01/12/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with Dan Charest re final approval papers |
| 01/12/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with B Maggard re coordinating final approval papers filing |
| 01/12/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with Dan Charest re final approval papers filing |
| 01/12/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed KCC final draft of declaration ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/12/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Edited final approval papers |
| 01/12/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and BC re final drafts of approval papers |
| 01/12/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed final draft of declaration from KCC ISO mtn for final approval |
| 01/12/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with A Maggard re plans for finalizing final approval papers |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|----------|----------|--|
| 01/12/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with A Maggard and S Williams re finalized papers for motion for final approval |
| 01/12/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Drafted email text to send to YT counsel re filing |
| 01/13/2023 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Discussing final approval motion filing with P. Murphree; reviewing and circulating motion for final approval, declarations, exhibits, and proposed order/judgment; |
| 01/13/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with BC re motion for final approval |
| 01/17/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 1.30 | 1,365.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re Accenture data request; confer with Accenture counsel and YouTube counsel re same; review file materials. |
| 01/17/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and BC re lack of response from Accenture re class member mailing addresses |
| 01/17/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with BC re subpoena to Accenture |
| 01/17/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed and messaged with JLSF and BC re potential subpoena of class member mailing addresses |
| 01/18/2023 | 1139 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving subpoena to Accenture (sent in May 2022); emailing with R. Ponce re same; |
| 01/18/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re first set of additional mailing addresses for class members received from Accenture's subcontractors |
| 01/20/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re Accenture data and responsiveness; review file materials. |
| 01/20/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YT counsel re mailing addresses of class members from Accenture vendors |
| 01/20/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re additional lists of mailing addresses for class members who worked for Accenture vendors |
| 01/23/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.80 | 840.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re YouTube motion to continue and related issues; confer with YouTube counsel re same. |
| 01/23/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with S Williams and D Charest re meet and confer with YT counsel re moving final approval hearing |
| 01/24/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with leadership re CA AG CAFA inquiry and next steps; confer with trial team re same. |
| 01/24/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with D Charest and S Williams re email from YT counsel re communication from California AG |
| 01/24/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re class members mailing addresses from Accenture (YT vendor) subcontractors |
| 01/25/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with S Williams re plan for call with YT counsel re date of final approval hearing |
| 01/25/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Participated in call with YT counsel re Cal AG communication and date of final approval hearing |
| 01/25/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with D Charest re decisions from call with YT counsel re final approval, CAFA notice, and hearing date |
| 01/26/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with S Williams re call with AG re position on CAFA notice question |
| 01/26/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with D Charest to report result of conversation with JLSF re California AG phone conversation re CAFA notice |
| 01/26/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with YouTube counsel re class notice and related costs; confer with trial team re YouTube effort to change approval date; review file materials. |
| 01/27/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re class member mailing addresses |
| 01/27/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with D Charest and JLSF re class member addresses |
| 01/27/2023 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating admin motion to continue approval hearing, declaration, and proposed order; |
| 01/29/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Edited reply to YT mtn to reschedule hearing and emailed JLSF re same |
| 01/30/2023 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating plaintiffs' response to admin motion to continue hearing; |
| 01/30/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with YouTube counsel re settlement approval and related issues; confer with trial team re same. |
| 01/31/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with Accenture counsel re class member mailing addresses from vendors |
| 01/31/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re class members with and without mailing addresses and need for declaration |
| 01/31/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re class members with missing contact information |
| 02/01/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and BC and KCC re class member addresses |
| 02/01/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and BC re reset hearing and new round of notice to class members |
| 02/02/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.60 | 450.00 | 750.00 | Emailed back and forth on multiple chains with JLSF, BC, KCC, and YT counsel re updating class re rescheduled hearing, methods of notice re same, placing new notice on website, and adjusting plans for additional final approval papers in light of moved hearing date |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|------|--------|----------|--|
| 02/03/2023 | 1137 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with YT counsel re setting meeting re paying for email notice |
| 02/06/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re update on class member mailing addresses |
| 02/06/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Participated in meet and confer with YT re payment for class notice re rescheduled hearing |
| 02/06/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re notice to class re rescheduled hearing date |
| 02/06/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC and JLSF re notice to class and motion to court re same re rescheduled final approval hearing |
| 02/06/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.70 | 735.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with YouTube counsel re settlement issues and additional notice; review file materials; confer with trial team re settlement issues, additional notice, and next steps. |
| 02/08/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Edited notice to class re rescheduled hearing |
| 02/08/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re notice language for class re rescheduled hearing |
| 02/09/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re secondary notice to class |
| 02/10/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed and approved notices re rescheduled approval hearing |
| 02/10/2023 | 1135 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and saving final versions updated notice docs; |
| 02/15/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re notice to class re changed hearing date |
| 02/22/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re class member mailing addresses |
| 03/01/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re list of addresses of class members |
| 03/01/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed address list provided by KCC, evaluated sufficiency, and drafted memo to team re status of addresses for class members for receiving final notice and payment |
| 03/01/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re class notice issues, address concerns, and next steps; review file materials. |
| 03/03/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re additional notice to draft for class members w/o mailing addresses |
| 03/13/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Edited notice to class members without mailing addresses |
| 03/16/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re edits to notice to class members without mailing addresses |
| 03/16/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re class notice issues; confer with KCC re same; review file materials. |
| 03/21/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Reviewed and edited notices to class re payment methods and mailing addresses |
| 03/21/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re changes to notices to class and updates needed to declaration ISO final approval |
| 03/28/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with D Charest re attendance at final approval hearing |
| 03/28/2023 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.20 | 65.00 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating clerk's notice re hearing; updating calendar; |
| 03/30/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.70 | 735.00 | 1,050.00 | Review recent filings; confer with trial team re same; prepare for hearing on final approval; confer with trial team re same. |
| 04/05/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re declaration |
| 04/10/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re status of declaration ISO final approval |
| 04/11/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Edited KCC declaration ISO final approval |
| 04/11/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.90 | 675.00 | 750.00 | Edited draft of KCC declaration ISO final approval to conform to info re obtaining additional addresses etc. |
| 04/11/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re draft of declaration ISO final approval |
| 04/11/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC and JLSF re planning for filing ISO final approval in advance of 5/12 hearing |
| 04/12/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.60 | 450.00 | 750.00 | Prepared draft declaration ISO final approval for Dan Charest |
| 04/13/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re status of edited declaration |
| 04/13/2023 | 1141 | Gravois, Julianna | 0.30 | 97.50 | 325.00 | Reviewing and circulating notice of change of counsel for plaintiffs re A. Maggard; reviewing and circulating notice of change of counsel for plaintiffs re E. Buchanan; |
| 04/14/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Edited draft of declaration from KCC ISO final approval |
| 04/14/2023 | 1141 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.30 | 225.00 | 750.00 | Edited D Charest supplemental declaration ISO final approval |
| 04/14/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.20 | 150.00 | 750.00 | Had meeting with R Yelton re post approval procedures for class action settlement |
| 04/17/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re draft declaration ISO preliminary approval |
| 04/18/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed KCC re exhibits to declaration and current invoice |
| 04/19/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re exhibits to declaration and charges to date |
| 04/20/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re final approval preparation and related issues; review file materials. |
| 04/21/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF re meeting to prepare for post-approval process |
| 04/23/2023 | 1135 | Charest, Daniel | 0.50 | 525.00 | 1,050.00 | Confer with trial team re hearing on final approval, class notice issues, and subsequent class issues; review file materials. |
| 04/24/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with S Williams re scheduling meeting re final steps before final approval |
| 04/24/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with S Williams re meeting to discuss final approval |

| | | | | | | |
|------------|------|-------------------|---------------|-------------------|--------|--|
| 04/25/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Messaged with D Charest re JLSF position on outstanding items in advance of final approval hearing |
| 04/25/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Had call with JLSF re outstanding items in advance of final approval hearing |
| 04/25/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with BC and JLSF re remaining tasks before final approval hearing |
| 04/27/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re invoice |
| 04/28/2023 | 1142 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with KCC re declaration ISO final approval and invoice |
| 04/28/2023 | 1135 | Murphree, Patrick | 0.10 | 75.00 | 750.00 | Emailed with JLSF and BC re planning meeting for activities post final approval |
| | | | 408.50 | 298,320.00 | | |

Confidential - For Internal Purposes Only