

1 Steven N. Williams (State Bar No. 175489)  
JOSEPH SAVERI LAW FIRM, LLP  
2 601 California Street, Suite 1000  
San Francisco, California 94108  
3 Telephone: (415) 500-6800  
Facsimile: (415) 395-9940  
4 Email: swilliams@saverilawfirm.com

5 Daniel H. Charest (admitted *pro hac vice*)  
**BURNS CHAREST LLP**  
6 900 Jackson St., Suite 500  
Dallas, Texas 75202  
7 Telephone: (469) 904-4550  
Facsimile: (469) 444-5002  
8 Email: dcharest@burnscharest.com

9 *Attorneys for Plaintiff and the Class*

10  
11 UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT  
12 NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA

13  
14 **JANE DOE**, individually and on behalf of all others  
similarly situated,

15 *Plaintiff,*

16 v.

17 **YOUTUBE, INC.,**

18 *Defendant.*

Civil Case No. 4:20-CV-07493-YGR

19  
20 **DECLARATION OF DANIEL CHAREST  
IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF’S MOTION  
FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES,  
REIMBURSEMENT OF COSTS, AND  
SERVICE AWARD**

21  
22  
23  
24  
25  
26  
27  
28  
Date: February 21, 2023  
Time: 2:00 p.m.  
Judge: Hon. Yvonne Gonzalez Rogers  
Location: Courtroom 1

1 I, Daniel Charest, declare and state as follows:

2 1. I make this declaration in support of Plaintiffs’ Motion for Attorneys’ Fees,  
3 Reimbursement of Costs, and Service Awards. I am over 18 years of age, and I have personal  
4 knowledge of the facts set forth herein. If called as a witness, I could and would testify competently to  
5 them.

6 2. I am an attorney licensed to practice in Texas, Virginia (inactive), the District of  
7 Columbia, and the U.S. Virgin Islands. I have been admitted *pro hac vice* in this case. I am a co-founder  
8 and managing partner of Burns Charest LLP (“Burns Charest”) in Dallas, Texas. I serve as co-counsel  
9 for Jane Doe (“Plaintiff”) in this action. On September 30, 2022, the Court appointed Burns Charest  
10 and Joseph Saveri Law Firm (“JSLF”) as Class Counsel in this case.

11 3. I have over seventeen years’ experience as a trial attorney. I have played a leading role  
12 in many prominent trials and class actions throughout the United States, including serving as lead  
13 counsel for successful trials on behalf of Houston-area homeowners whose property was damaged or  
14 destroyed by flooding during Hurricane Harvey.<sup>1</sup> I have been recognized by my peers as a highly  
15 skilled litigator, including being nominated to a Texas Bar Pattern Jury Charge Committee, presenting  
16 various CLE events on behalf of the Texas Bar, being made a Fellow of the American Bar Foundation  
17 and of the Litigation Counsel of America. I was named Attorney of the Year in 2020 by Texas Lawyer. I  
18 have also been recognized in various publications such as Lawdragon, Benchmark Litigation, U.S.  
19 News & World Report, Super Lawyers, and Best Lawyers in America.

20 4. Attached as **Exhibit 1** is a Burns Charest firm resume and my biographical information.

21 5. In 2018, Burns Charest along with the Joseph Saveri Law Firm (“JLSF”) (together with  
22 Burns Charest, “Plaintiff’s Counsel”) filed a proposed class action on behalf of Facebook content  
23 moderators: *Scola v. Facebook, Inc.*, No. 18CIV05135 (Cal. Sup. Ct., San Mateo Cty.). After extensive  
24 discovery and hard-fought mediation, Plaintiff’s Counsel and Facebook reached a settlement that  
25 provided monetary awards to current and former content moderators as well as required Facebook to  
26 make changes to its content moderation platform and to provide enhanced psychological supports to  
27

28 <sup>1</sup> *In re Addicks and Barker (Texas) Flood-Control Reservoirs*, Master Docket No. 17-3000L (Fed. Cl. consolidated Oct. 31, 2017).

1 protect content moderators. The settlement was approved and is currently in the final stages of  
2 distribution of damages awards to class members.

3 6. As a result of the Facebook case, the two firms acquired substantial knowledge about the  
4 content moderation process and the vendors that provide content moderation services to large  
5 companies such as Facebook and YouTube.

6 7. Burns Charest has prosecuted this litigation on a contingent fee basis—advancing costs  
7 and time and taking the risk that the firm would not be compensated for services rendered or expenses  
8 advanced. In committing its time and resources to this matter and performing a key but time-consuming  
9 leadership role, my firm has forgone other legal work for which it could have been compensated.  
10 Together with JSLF, Burns Charest has advanced this case aggressively but efficiently. The work  
11 performed was necessary to achieve the result at hand.

12 8. Since mid-2020, Burns Charest has performed work on this case, including the  
13 following tasks:

14 a) engaging in multiple interviews with members of the proposed class to  
15 understand the nature of content moderators' work for YouTube and identify potential  
16 candidates to serve as class representatives;

17 b) with JSLF, drafting a vigorous opposition to YouTube's Motion to Dismiss and  
18 preparing for oral argument on the same;

19 c) with JSLF, engaging in extensive efforts to mediate the claims of the proposed  
20 class before the Hon. Rebecca Westerfield (Ret.) during two mediation sessions in March 2022,  
21 following which a settlement was reached in principle;

22 d) with JSLF, meeting and conferring with YouTube's counsel on multiple  
23 occasions to hammer out the details of the Settlement Agreement;

24 e) with JLSF, interviewing experts in trauma-related psychology and, in  
25 consultation with those experts, drafting safeguard protocols for incorporation into the  
26 settlement as injunctive relief;

27 f) with JLSF, engaging in extensive informal discovery with YouTube and its  
28 vendor, Accenture, including serving a subpoena to ascertain the size of the class in order to

1 ensure the adequacy of the monetary portion of the settlement and arranging several rounds of  
2 communications between Plaintiff's experts and YouTube's internal Mental Health Officers to  
3 enable Plaintiff's experts to acquire the information about YouTube's practices to ensure that the  
4 injunctive portion of the settlement would effectively help to mitigate harm to content  
5 moderators;

6 g) with JSLF, identifying and researching potential *cy prè*s recipients and  
7 presenting a recommendation to the Court;

8 h) with JSLF, drafting the Motion for Preliminary Approval and the ancillary  
9 documents attached thereto;

10 i) with JLSF, meeting and conferring with YouTube's counsel to adjust the  
11 settlement amount upward in light of the increase in the class size between the filing of the  
12 motion for preliminary approval and the date of preliminary approval;

13 j) with JSLF, conducting a notice plan, drafting and planning Long Form Notice  
14 and Summary Notice forms, overseeing implementation of notice plan, and coordinating with  
15 the Notice Administrator to ensure that the notice was sent out;

16 k) with JSLF, preparing the instant Motion for Attorneys' Fees, Costs, and Service  
17 Awards and gathering time and expense information in support of the same, for presentation to  
18 the Court.

19 9. The schedule attached hereto as **Exhibit 2** is a summary chart indicating the amount of  
20 time spent by the attorneys and other professional support staff at Burns Charest who were involved in  
21 this litigation and the lodestar calculation based on my firm's billing rates for the period from inception  
22 through November 17, 2022. The schedule was prepared from contemporaneous, daily time records  
23 regularly prepared and maintained by my firm and which are attached for the Court's review as **Exhibit**  
24 **3.**<sup>2</sup> The total lodestar amount for my firm's work at current rates is \$263,647.50, based upon 340.60  
25 hours billed.

26  
27  
28 <sup>2</sup> Potential class representatives to whom Burns Charest attorneys and staff have spoken have been  
anonymized in these records.



# **EXHIBIT 1**

# Burns Charest LLP

---

Dallas  
900 Jackson Street, Suite 500  
Dallas | Texas | 75202  
Tel: (469) 904-4550

New Orleans  
365 Canal Street, Suite 1170  
New Orleans | Louisiana | 70130  
Tel: (504) 799-2845

Washington, D.C.  
4725 Wisconsin Ave. NW Suite 200  
Washington | D.C. | 20016  
Tel: (202) 577-3977

[www.burnscharest.com](http://www.burnscharest.com)

# About Us

Burns Charest is a young firm with a dynamic and impressive pedigree. Our founders were partners and attorneys at some of the finest commercial litigation boutiques in the nation. In 2015, we came together to build a new, aggressive platform to pursue our clients' interests.

We know that experience matters to clients and judges. And we have it. Our lawyers have actually tried a complex class action to verdict, served as co-lead counsel in multi-district litigation, secured a \$106 million judgment in the first of the 2008 mortgage meltdown cases to go to trial, obtained significant settlements in royalty-owner disputes, and regularly represented individuals and businesses in complex, bet-the-company cases.

We currently serve as co-lead counsel in national antitrust and commodity class actions. We represent numerous royalty owners in disputes against oil and gas giants. We serve hundreds of individuals whose lives have been threatened by exposure to asbestos. And we are helping landowners clean up decades of environmental damage.

We have a strong team. Our lawyers are some of the most experienced and talented of their generation, and we are happy to match our credentials against others.

Our focus is on the future. We believe firmly that our nation's legal system was designed to protect individuals and businesses from the wrongdoing of others and to assure a level playing field. As lawyers, we have an incredibly important role to play in making that system work for our clients. And we will not shy away from a fight to protect their interests.

## We are Burns Charest LLP.



## Firm Leadership Experience

- Co-lead counsel: *In re Upstream Addick and Barker Flood-Control Reservoirs*. (U.S. Court of Federal Claims) Representing property owners in federal takings case relating to flooding during Hurricane Harvey.
- Co-lead counsel: *In re Plaid Inc. Privacy Litigation* (N.D. Ca.) Representing consumers against fintech apps for collecting sensitive transactional private banking data without consumers' knowledge or consent.
- Member of Plaintiff Steering Committee: *In re TikTok, Inc., Consumer Privacy Litigation* (N.D. Ill.). Representing app users against TikTok, Inc. and ByteDance, Inc. for their use of biometric information obtained from app users without prior consent.
- Co-lead counsel: *In re: EpiPen (Epinephrine Injection, USP) Marketing, Sales Practices and Antitrust Litigation*, MDL No: 2785 (D. Kan.). Representing tens of thousands of American consumers and businesses in a multidistrict class action designed to recoup the overpayments on the life-saving EpiPen device.
- Member of five-person executive committee: *In re Johnson & Johnson Talcum Powder Products Marketing, Sales Practices and Products Liability Litigation* (D.N.J.). Representing thousands of women alleging that talcum powder products cause ovarian and uterine cancer.
- Co-lead counsel: *In re Anadarko Basin Oil and Gas Lease Antitrust Lit.* (W.D. Okla.). Representing mineral owners against oil and gas companies for conspiring to rig bids and limit competition for oil and gas leases.
- Co-liaison counsel: *In re: Chesapeake Barnett Royalty Litigation #2*, MDL No. 96-00003-15 (96th District Court, Tarrant County, Texas). Representing royalty and mineral owners in mass action against operator for royalty underpayments.
- Co-lead counsel: *In re: Asbestos, Catalyst, and Silica Toxic Dust Exposure Litigation*, Master Docket No. SX-15-CV-096 (U.S.V.I. Sup. Ct.). Representing several hundred individual workers exposed to asbestos while working in a refinery on St. Croix, U.S.V.I.
- Executive committee member: *In re: Domestic Airlines Antitrust Litigation* (D.D.C.). Representing millions of Americans who overpaid for airline tickets after the nation's largest carriers entered into an illegal conspiracy to fix prices and limit airline capacity.
- Co-lead counsel: *Bhatia et al v. 3M Company* (D. Minn.). Representing thousands of American dentists who purchased faulty material from one of the nation's largest dental manufacturers for use in dental crowns, which failed at unprecedented rates.
- Co-lead counsel: *In re: Crude Oil Commodity Futures Litigation* (S.D.NY.). Represented thousands of investors who lost money after rogue trading companies manipulated the market for crude oil. Burns Charest settled the case in 2015 and are administering the settlement.
- Lead counsel: *In re Automotive Parts Antitrust Litigation* (E.D. Mich.). On track to recover over \$700 million for indirect purchasers as part of an MDL accusing auto parts manufacturers of conspiring to fix prices on auto parts (Warren Burns was lead counsel while at Susman Godfrey and retained an interest in the case after founding Burns Charest).

# Daniel H. Charest

---

Burns Charest LLP  
900 Jackson Street, Suite 500  
Dallas | Texas | 75202  
Direct: (469) 904-4555  
Mobile: (214) 681-8444  
dcharest@burnscharest.com

Daniel Charest gets results for his clients in high-stakes litigation. His career reflects a history of big wins in the court room and high-profile settlement agreements. He achieves those results through a combination of smarts and daily hard work.

Daniel developed his trial-lawyer skills at a nationally-recognized litigation boutique, where he became a partner, tried cases, and ran his clients' cases. Over the years, he honed his skills into an effective, efficient approach that focuses on his client's needs and achieving the desired outcome. He left that firm to establish Burns Charest LLP. And, now, he attacks his clients' problems with skills, smarts and hard work.

Daniel's body of work reaches beyond any particular practice area. He has handled matters involving antitrust, breach of contract, oil & gas, financial-service company disputes, business torts, trade secret misappropriation and unfair competition, consumer protection, class actions, fraud, insurance bad faith, and wrongful death. His work has taken place across the United States: federal and state courts from coast to coast with plenty of places in between. Daniel's docket has involved procedural and jurisdictional challenges such as removal and remand, class certification, transfers, temporary restraining orders, temporary injunctions, and appeals. In all, the body of work is, simply, high-stakes litigation.

I recommend Daniel Charest without reservation for handling high-stakes litigation. Daniel is one of the hardest working, most talented, and easiest to work with trial attorneys I have come across.

-Jason Doughty  
Senior Vice President Kosmos Energy Ltd.

In addition to his legal experience, Daniel brings real-world experience developed from working in leadership roles in industry at a young age that involved travel all over the globe and required cooperation with all forms of culture and character. While maintaining his full workload, Daniel has served as a pro bono mediator in a program administered by the Dallas courts, called "Settlement Week." And, last but not least, he is a proud husband and father.



## Honors and Professional Involvement

Texas Lawyers' "Attorney of the Year 2020"

Lawdragon 500 Leading Plaintiff Consumer Lawyers, 2021

Lawdragon 500 Leading Plaintiff Financial Lawyers, 2021

2020 "Winning Litigator" by *National Law Journal*

Best Lawyers in America, 2017-2022

Texas Super Lawyers by Thomson Reuters (2019-2021)

"Local Litigation Star" by *Benchmark Litigation*

Best Lawyers in Dallas, *D Magazine* 2020-2021

Managing Editor of the *Tulane Law Review*, 2003-2004

Clerked for Hon. Edith Brown Clement on the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Fifth Circuit

Admitted to practice in the District of Columbia, Texas, Virginia (inactive), and the U.S. Virgin Islands, as well as many federal and appellate courts

## Representative Cases

### Chesapeake Barnett Royalty Litigation

Daniel currently serves as co-liaison counsel for royalty and mineral owners in a mass action against operators for royalty underpayment. Additionally represents many individual client groups within the MDL. Currently pending in Tarrant County District Court.

### In re Upstream Addicks-Barker (Texas) Flood-Control Reservoirs

Daniel was recognized for his work as lead trial counsel in securing a landmark win for Houston-area property owners in the largest takings case in U.S. history. The U.S. Court of Federal Claims held the United States liable for flooding and property damage caused by the Army Corps of Engineers' management of Houston-area reservoirs during Hurricane Harvey in 2017. The ruling allows more than 10,000 property owners to recover significant flood-damage compensation for their Fifth Amendment taking claim.

"[Daniel is] the kind of lawyer I need in difficult, time constrained matters. Tenacious, aggressive but practical. [He is] looking out for client's interests at all times. Decisive and prepared, what else can I say?"

- David Brooks

Chief Operating Officer and General Counsel of Ashford Hospitality Trust, Inc.

## Oil & Gas Price Fixing

Daniel represents hundreds of Oklahoma property owners who entered into oil and gas leases with two of the nation's largest gas companies. Unbeknownst to his clients, those same companies had agreed to fix the prices they were offering on gas leases and allocate the market between them.

## Dental Crowns

Daniel represents thousands of American dentists who purchased faulty material from one of the nation's largest dental manufacturers. The dentists used the materials to create dental crowns, which failed at unprecedented rates. Plaintiffs are suing to recoup the damages they incurred to replace those crowns.

## Asbestos Exposure

Served as co-lead counsel on behalf of several hundred individual workers exposed to asbestos and other toxic dusts while working in a refinery on St. Croix, U.S.V.I.

## Securities Litigation

Defended client Kosmos Energy against plaintiff's motion to certify a class in a securities action set in the Northern District of Texas. Served as lead attorney on the case through completion.

# **EXHIBIT 2**

*Jane Doe, individually and on behalf of all others similarly situated, v. YouTube, Inc.*  
**Litigation Lodestar**

Burns Charest LLP  
 Inception through November 17, 2022  
 Current

Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Total
<b>Attorneys</b>			
Daniel Charest	\$1,050.00	83.60	\$87,780.00
Mallory Biblo	\$700.00	7.80	\$5,460.00
Patrick Murphree	\$750.00	182.6	\$136,950.00
Lydia Wright	\$500.00	1.20	\$600.00
Rick Yelton	\$700.00	24.30	\$17,010.00
<b>Professional Staff</b>			
Julianna Gravois	\$425.00	33.00	\$14,025.00
Hannah Lopez	\$225.00	8.10	\$1,822.50
<b>TOTAL</b>		<b>340.60</b>	<b>\$263,647.50</b>

# **EXHIBIT 3**

## Burns Charest LLP

## Time Report

*Jane Doe, individually and on behalf of all others similarly situated, v. YouTube, Inc.**Inception through November 17, 2022*

Date	SM/Task	Name	Description	Hrs	Amt	Rate	Narrative
05/27/2020	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.80	1,890.00	1,050.00	Confer with S. Williams re potential claims; confer with partnership re potential claims and next steps; organize case evaluation and file review; confer with trial team re case evaluation issues.
09/23/2020	A104	Wright, Lydia	Associate	0.40	200.00	500.00	Review complaint
09/23/2020	1135	Lopez, Hannah	Paralegal	1.10	247.50	225.00	Reach out to Lori at JLSF for copy of case caption; pull and post complaint and judge assignment to slack channel; pull remaining docs and save to server; pull all docket entries, save to server, update calendar with CMC hearing date and CMC Stmt due date, create list server for matter, post to slack channel for group;
09/29/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Reviewed and edited California state court PHV application and supporting materials
09/29/2020	1135	Lopez, Hannah	Paralegal	2.50	562.50	225.00	Draft PHV docs based on Scola PHV filings; fwd drafts of all to team for final review; check docket for any new filings;
10/06/2020	1135	Lopez, Hannah	Paralegal	1.10	247.50	225.00	Finalize PHVs and confer with Chambers clerk on hearing date/time; confer with Heaven at JLSF for YouTube service address
10/07/2020	1135	Lopez, Hannah	Paralegal	1.40	315.00	225.00	Finalize PHV filing documents; confer with clerk on hearing date, fwd final to Heaven at JLSF for filing; upload and pay CA AIMS Bar Fee for all attorneys on PHV
10/08/2020	1135	Lopez, Hannah	Paralegal	0.30	67.50	225.00	Reach out to Heaven at JLSF on PHV update;
10/12/2020	1135	Lopez, Hannah	Paralegal	0.60	135.00	225.00	Confer with JSLF Paralegal re PHV filings; look into CourtCall case association procedure, if any; confer with BC paralegals re court call login creds;
10/20/2020	A106	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.60	420.00	700.00	Speak over the phone with potential class rep A who had previously reached out to discuss her experiences and interest in participating, provide update to the team.
10/20/2020	1135	Lopez, Hannah	Paralegal	0.30	67.50	225.00	Reach out to Heaven at JLSF re PHV status;
10/21/2020	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Read Verge article re Google content moderation for factual background
10/28/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.60	255.00	425.00	Updating docket with notice of removal with exhibits, Youtube's disclosure statement, the assignment to the magistrate judge, the order setting initial case management conference and YouTube's certificate of service for the notice of removal; pulling and posting docket report; discussing case with H. Lopez.
10/28/2020	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.70	1,785.00	1,050.00	Confer with co-lead counsel re file status, task assignments, and next steps; confer with trial team re same; organize trial team; review file materials.
10/28/2020	1135	Lopez, Hannah	Paralegal	0.80	180.00	225.00	Confer with D. Charest re my assignment on the matter; finalize switch to new paralegal (Julianna Gravois) in advance of job separation, update new Paralegal on PHV status
10/30/2020	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	1.10	467.50	425.00	Researching applying for admission PHV in ND Cal.; drafting on forms for D. Charest, L. Wright, M. Biblo, P. Murphree and R. Yelton; pulling current certificates of good standing to D. Charest, M. Biblo and R. Yelton; ordering certificates of good standing for L. Wright and P. Murphree; emailing with H. Haile.
11/03/2020	A106	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.70	490.00	700.00	Speak over the phone with potential class rep B; provide update to the BC team following the call.
11/05/2020	A106	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.30	210.00	700.00	Prepare and send email in follow-up to conversation with potential class rep B
11/06/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Call with Louisiana Supreme Court re certificates of good standing for L. Wright and P. Murphree (vm).
11/18/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Registering L. Wright, M. Biblo, P. Murphree and R. Yelton for ECF in ND Cal. and discussing same.
11/19/2020	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.60	255.00	425.00	Finalizing and filing applications for admission pro hac vice for D. Charest, L. Wright, M. Biblo, P. Murphree and R. Yelton and circulating to team.
11/23/2020	1137	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.90	630.00	700.00	Speak over the phone with new potential class rep C, and follow up with email to him and also update to the BC team.
11/24/2020	A106	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.10	70.00	700.00	Communicate with potential class rep B to set up phone call.



11/25/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.70	490.00	700.00	Speak over the phone with potential class rep B about her potential role in the class action and other people she may know who are interested.
12/01/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.10	42.50	425.00	Reviewing and circulating order granting admission PHV for D. Charest;
12/02/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.50	1,125.00	750.00	Read motion to dismiss and preliminary identified potential responses and avenues of research.
12/02/2020	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Review file materials; confer with trial team re motion to dismiss; confer with trial team re organizational issues.
12/02/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.10	42.50	425.00	Reviewing and circulating YouTube's motion to dismiss and proposed order
12/02/2020	1141	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.60	420.00	700.00	Initial reading and analysis of Youtube MTD filed this day; coordinate internally for response.
12/03/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	3.60	2,700.00	750.00	Carefully read complaint and motion to dismiss. Developing potential avenues of counterarguments and structure for motion and began research to develop those arguments
12/03/2020	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with R. Yelton re prospects for signing on a class rep that is a current content mod
12/03/2020	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with leadership re litigation strategy and case management; review file materials; confer with trial team re task assignments and next steps.
12/03/2020	1141	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.90	630.00	700.00	Read through and analyze the arguments made by YT in the MTD; re-read memo drafted previously on related UCL application issues.
12/03/2020	1141	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.80	560.00	700.00	Analyze the role of standing for injunctive relief, both under the UCL and in federal court; analyze the 9th circuit caselaw requiring remand when such a difference exists; discuss same with P Murphree and L Wright.
12/04/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	2.80	2,100.00	750.00	Researched choice of law issue for motion to dismiss response
12/04/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Brainstormed ideas re conflict of law issue in motion to dismiss
12/04/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	2.40	1,800.00	750.00	Researched standing issue re injunctive relief claim and identified possible courses of action
12/04/2020	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re team organization and task assignments; review file materials.
12/04/2020	A106	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.50	350.00	700.00	Speak with potential class rep B about current moderators; follow up internally regarding same; correspond internally with P Murphree and L Wright regarding strategy in light of client contact.
12/05/2020	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.90	945.00	1,050.00	Review recent filings; confer with trial team re same; confer with leadership re task assignments and litigations strategy; confer with trial team re same; confer with trial team re potential class representatives and related issues.
12/06/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	3.10	2,325.00	750.00	Researched conflict of law issues for response to motion to dismiss
12/07/2020	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.80	600.00	750.00	Participated in telephone conference with BC trial team re next steps towards amended complaint
12/07/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.20	900.00	750.00	Researched re potential solutions to jurisdictional issues in case in federal court
12/07/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.40	1,050.00	750.00	Researched availability of attorney fees under California general PAGA action
12/07/2020	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.80	560.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
12/07/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating orders granting admission PHV for L. Wright, M. Biblo, P. Murphree and R. Yelton.
12/07/2020	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.20	1,260.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re removal, remand, and responses to motion to dismiss; review file materials; confer with leadership re pleading issues and litigation strategy.
12/07/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	1.60	1,120.00	700.00	Prepare for internal meeting by researching locations of Collabera content moderators and other moderators working as vendors for YT; read and analyze the memo produced by P Murphree re: standing.
12/07/2020	1135	Wright, Lydia	Associate	0.80	400.00	500.00	Following research, participate in internal call with team to discuss possible amendment and responding to MTD.
12/07/2020	1135	Wright, Lydia	Associate	0.80	400.00	500.00	Participated in telephone conference with BC trial team re next steps towards amended complaint
12/08/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.80	600.00	750.00	Prepared brief memo/analysis re California private attorney general statute
12/08/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.10	42.50	425.00	Calendar weekly call and discussing same with P. Murphree;

12/08/2020	A107	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.60	420.00	700.00	Speak with W. Most about possible termination claim for potential class rep C; call C and leave message regarding same; when C called back, speak with him about status of the case and other updates; email W Most and C to connect the two.
12/10/2020	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Participated in telephone conference with BC trial team re next steps towards amended complaint
12/10/2020	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.40	280.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
12/10/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Attend weekly call;
12/10/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	1.00	700.00	700.00	In preparation for weekly internal call, review the memo circulated by P. Murphree on the PAGA civil rule and also review my previous memo on the PAGA statute; Participated in telephone conference with BC trial team re next steps towards amended complaint
12/11/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	1.10	770.00	700.00	Respond to two emails from JSLF team; review the PTSD acknowledgement form to ensure it is devoid of personal information and update team internally of its ability to be sent to CBS; coordinate time for strategy call with JSLF; follow up with email correspondences with JSLF on the issue of UCL and Article III standing.
12/14/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Reviewing and saving notice of appearance of K. Levy on behalf of plaintiffs; reviewing and circulating joint stipulation and proposed order on the motion to dismiss briefing schedule.
12/14/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.10	70.00	700.00	Email with K Malone from the JSLF team to coordinate team meeting.
12/15/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating order granting joint stip re MTD briefing schedule; updating calendar.
12/15/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Coordinate with emails to arrange for teamwide call on the next day.
12/16/2020	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.60	450.00	750.00	Participated in call with JLSF re finding new plaintiffs + strategic plan for opposing MTD
12/16/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Researched re viability of our causes of action in current procedural posture with Jane Doe plaintiff in Federal court
12/16/2020	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.60	420.00	700.00	Participated in call with JLSF re finding new plaintiffs + strategic plan for opposing MTD
12/16/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.60	255.00	425.00	Attend call with JLSF re motion to dismiss;
12/16/2020	A107	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.70	490.00	700.00	Prepare for meeting with co-counsel on responding to to MTD; Participated in call with JLSF re finding new plaintiffs + strategic plan for opposing MTD
12/16/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Email marketing team to set up a call on the issue of outreach to moderators.
12/17/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	3.00	2,250.00	750.00	Composed memo summarizing research on standing and equitable relief issues and predicting likelihood of success on claims.
12/17/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Edited for circulation memo re current status of case with Jane Doe plaintiff proceeding as anonymous plaintiff in federal court
12/17/2020	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Participated in internal BC telephone conference re case status and next steps
12/17/2020	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.30	210.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
12/17/2020	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Attending weekly call;
12/17/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.60	420.00	700.00	Prepare for phone call with Bria Burk at Androvet about reaching out to content moderators, participate in call, follow up with email.
12/18/2020	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Researched re applicable CAFA exceptions if we brought a California-only class
12/21/2020	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed and edited ad copy and search terms for search for content mods
12/23/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.50	350.00	700.00	Speak over the phone with K. Malone regarding the plan for responding to MTD.
12/28/2020	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Met with R Yelton and M Biblo re approach to JSLF re response to MTD
12/28/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.80	560.00	700.00	Participate in brief internal call regarding strategy for responding to MTD; analyze outline prepared by JSLF and forward to the team.
12/29/2020	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Participated in meeting w/ JLSF re planning for drafting opposition to MTD
12/29/2020	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Telephone conference with R Yelton and P Murphree regarding strategy moving forward

12/29/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Coordinate a call with JSLF.
12/29/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.90	630.00	700.00	Prepare for conversation with JSLF team and coordinate same; participate in call; follow up with correspondences internally regarding the next steps.
12/31/2020	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.30	210.00	700.00	Analyze email sent by D. Charest, and email B Burk to move forward with Androvett campaign.
01/01/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	3.20	2,400.00	750.00	Reviewed relevant Texas law, read negligence cases cited by D, and prepared counterargs to use in opposition to MtD
01/04/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	2.50	1,875.00	750.00	Read Texas cases cited by YT in MtD and prepared responsive arguments for use in opposition brief
01/05/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.70	297.50	425.00	Reviewing and circulating ADR Certification; emailing with Androvett; reviewing intake forms to prepare for moderator calls;
01/05/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	3.10	2,325.00	750.00	Drafted and edited response to motion to dismiss
01/05/2021	A103	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.40	280.00	700.00	Review and revise leads website
01/05/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re MTD briefing and litigation strategy; review file materials.
01/06/2021	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.70	490.00	700.00	Analyze the SJ order in the Washington case, review safeguards program set up in Scola for use in this case; share those documents with D. Charest.
01/06/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Edited response to motion to dismiss
01/06/2021	A103	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	1.40	980.00	700.00	Review and revise ads; telephone conference with B. Burk regarding same
01/06/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.70	525.00	750.00	Began to draft additional section of response to motion to dismiss re UCL claims
01/07/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Participate in weekly call;
01/07/2021	A107	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.70	490.00	700.00	Participate in videoconference with counsel in other case representing content moderators to discuss the standard of care aspect of these cases.
01/07/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.60	1,200.00	750.00	Drafted additional sections and edited response to MtD
01/07/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
01/07/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Participated in weekly internal BC call re status of case
01/07/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re file status, task assignments, and litigation strategy; review file materials.
01/08/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	2.60	1,950.00	750.00	Edited and checked case citations in response to MtD
01/11/2021	1141	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.40	280.00	700.00	Review draft opposition assembled by P Murphree on the issue of UCL, workers' compensation exclusivity, and negligence; review cases cited therein.
01/11/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Prepared final document of BC portion of response to MtD for circulation
01/11/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re briefing status for opposition to motion to dismiss; confer with trial team re outreach efforts; confer with leadership re same.
01/14/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Attend weekly call.
01/14/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
01/14/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Participated in weekly internal BC call re status of case
01/15/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Brainstormed new language for ad seeking potential clients with M Biblo
01/15/2021	A104	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.70	490.00	700.00	Review and revise ads
01/21/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Editing YouTube forms for intake; participating in weekly call;
01/21/2021	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.50	350.00	700.00	Participate in weekly BC call to discuss updates on drafting and identifying class reps; reach out to connections and arrange for call on the next day.
01/21/2021	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Coordinate with team to obtain the updated firm resume and send same to JSLF for purposes of mtn to be named class counsel.
01/21/2021	A103	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
01/21/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Participated in weekly BC meeting re organizing process on case
01/21/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with leadership re file status and opposition to motion to
01/22/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	1.10	467.50	425.00	Preparing YouTube content moderator form and excel spreadsheet; call with content moderator D (vm);
01/22/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Had call with K Malone re strategic structure of response to MtD
01/22/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Read current draft of response to MtD

01/22/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Had second call with K Malone re strategy for editing response to MtD
01/22/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	6.90	5,175.00	750.00	Redrafted and edited response to MtD
01/22/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Had third call with K Malone at JLSF re status of opposition brief re motion to dismiss and coordinating handoffs of same
01/24/2021	1141	Yelton, Rick	Associate	1.80	1,260.00	700.00	Review the draft opposition to MtD that was circulated by P. Murphree; make edits and recirculate.
01/24/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	2.90	2,175.00	750.00	Edited brief in opposition to MtD
01/24/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Drafted notice of dismissal of strict liability claim
01/25/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Researched re ability to use Rule 41 to dismiss some but not all of the claims
01/25/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Talked with K Malone of JLSF re strategy of including or not including detailed California law in brief
01/25/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed opposition brief to MtD
01/26/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and saving plaintiff's opposition to defendant's motion to dismiss;
01/28/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Participated in weekly BC call re status of case and strategy going forward
01/28/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.30	210.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
01/28/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Attend weekly call; calendaring hearing on motion to dismiss;
02/02/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.90	382.50	425.00	call with potential class rep F re CM intake; call with potential class rep D re CM intake (vm); preparing email to team;
02/03/2021	A106	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.40	280.00	700.00	Speak over the phone with person with knowledge of case who anonymously reached out to me.
02/04/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Attend weekly call;
02/04/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
02/04/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Participated in BC planning/strategy meeting re clients
02/11/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.10	70.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
02/11/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Participated in weekly BC meeting re status of case and strategy moving forward
02/11/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Attend weekly call; calling lead for content moderator (S. Ricke) (vm);
02/18/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward; email Androvett regarding LinkedIn ads.
02/18/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Participated in weekly BC meeting re status of case and strategy moving forward
02/18/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Attend weekly call;
02/23/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.20	900.00	750.00	Read and analyzed reply to motion to dismiss in light of response to determine necessity of filing sur-reply
02/23/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Review recent filing; confer with trial team re same.
02/23/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating YouTube's reply ISO motion to dismiss; Speak with possible class rep lead; in light of conversation, follow-up with an employment law contact to get list of possible attorneys to represent the client.
03/05/2021	1137	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.80	560.00	700.00	
03/08/2021	1143	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Prepped for oral argument with K Malone
03/11/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Attend weekly call;
03/11/2021	A105	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.30	210.00	700.00	Participate in weekly internal phone call.
03/11/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.30	210.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
03/11/2021	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.90	1,425.00	750.00	Prepared outline of hot questions for oral argument on MtD to assist K Malone's prep for oral argument
03/11/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Participated in weekly BC meeting re status of case and strategy moving forward
03/12/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Call with former content mod for Facebook re referral for content mods for this case;
03/16/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Researched re possibly way to use California Civil Code to make negligence a statutory cause of action
03/17/2021	A106	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.30	210.00	700.00	Speak over the phone with potential class representative about his employment law claim and send the name of referred attorneys.
03/18/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Attending weekly call;
03/18/2021	A105	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.30	210.00	700.00	Participate in weekly BC teamwide call.

03/18/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Telephone conference with team regarding strategy moving forward
03/18/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Participated in weekly BC meeting re status of case and strategy moving forward
03/19/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating order vacating hearing on defendant's motion to dismiss and updating calendar;
03/29/2021	A108	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Send email to Androvett rep and also another to co-counsel regarding the status of identifying current moderator.
04/01/2021	A108	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.60	420.00	700.00	Phone conversation with Androvett representative discussing the current campaign and strategizing for better success in identifying current mods.
04/01/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.40	280.00	700.00	Email Androvett regarding updating website; in-person meeting with D Charest regarding same
04/02/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Discussing info@burnscharest.com email with R. Licon and emailing with team re same;
04/15/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating notice of firm name change;
04/21/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Reviewing 3 lead submissions; call with potential class rep G re intake and setting up call for later; call with potential class rep H re intake and leaving vm; updating team re same;
04/22/2021	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Participated in weekly BC meeting re status of case and strategy moving forward
04/22/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Call with potential class rep I re intake (vm);
04/26/2021	A104	Fairchild, Grace	Intern	0.00	0.00	0.00	[No Charge] Reviewing docket, active complaints, and factual assertions to get caught up on case
04/28/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Call with potential class rep G to set up call this evening; call with potential class rep H (vm); call with potential class rep I (vm).
04/29/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Updating team re contact with leads; call with potential class rep G
04/29/2021	A104	Fairchild, Grace	Intern	0.00	0.00	0.00	[No Charge] Researching relevant laws applicable to complaint; developing questions about jurisdiction
05/03/2021	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.40	280.00	700.00	Speak with D Charest about documents that may be useful to reporter; identify same and circulate.
05/04/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Redacting Accenture doc per R. Yelton and circulating same;
05/05/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Updating team re calls with leads;
05/06/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.50	212.50	425.00	Discussing incoming calls with B. Prewitt; discussing emails to info@burnscharest.com with R. Licon; emailing with B. Burk;
06/21/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with leadership re hearing date and related issues; confer with Google counsel re hearing date and potential settlement issues; confer with trial team re same.
06/22/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Reviewing and circulating clerk's notice setting the hearing on the motion to dismiss; calendaring hearing;
06/25/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.00	750.00	750.00	Participated in call re planning for oral argument with JSLF attorneys
07/11/2021	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.80	600.00	750.00	Reviewed briefing in prep for mootng K Malone for oral argument on MtD
07/11/2021	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.50	1,125.00	750.00	Mooted K Malone for oral argument on MtD
07/13/2021	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Had prep call with K Malone re oral argument on MtD
07/13/2021	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.30	975.00	750.00	Attended hearing re MtD
07/13/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Discussed next steps following hearing based on court's comments with K Malone
07/13/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Drafted email to BC team reporting results of hearing on motion to dismiss
07/13/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating clerk's notice re Zoom hearing with the Zoom link and information; updating calendar re same;
07/14/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed court order re amending complaint
07/14/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Messaged with BC and JSLF attorneys re plan for amending complaint
07/14/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating minute entry for hearing on motion to dismiss; reviewing and circulating order granting motion to dismiss with leave to amend and updating the calendar;
07/15/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Discussed strategy for responding to YT re amending complaint with R Yelton
07/15/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating transcript request form;
07/16/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Researched re issue of YT as special employer
07/20/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.80	340.00	425.00	Call and leave voicemail for potential class reps J, L, and L; call with L and discussing with team;
07/21/2021	A104	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Review Moderators Intake Form for potential class rep L

07/21/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re potential clients and related issues; review file materials.
07/22/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.20	140.00	700.00	Emails with team regarding potential class plaintiff; telephone conference with content moderator L (vm)
07/22/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.70	525.00	750.00	Participated in call with K Malone re strategy for amending complaint
07/22/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Had call with R Yelton re potential new client
07/22/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.80	600.00	750.00	Researched re standing under UCL for employee offered a job but who turned it down
07/22/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Call with potential class rep M re form submission re content moderation; updating team re same;
07/22/2021	1135	Yelton, Rick	Associate	0.70	490.00	700.00	Communicate with potential class representative; following the call, speak over the phone with P Murphree regarding potential for adding class rep who had recent opportunity to be employed by YT.
07/26/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Emailed and met with summer associates re material needs for project concerning standing of former employee who turned down YT job offer
07/28/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Call (vm) with potential class rep K; call (vm) with potential class rep J;
07/29/2021	1137	Biblo, Mallory	Associate	0.30	210.00	700.00	Discussions with team regarding strategy moving forward; telephone conference with potential class rep L (vm)
07/29/2021	A108	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Participated in call with YT counsel re discovery of agreements between YT and vendors
07/29/2021	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with K Malone re next steps following meeting with YT counsel
07/29/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.70	735.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re call schedule and related logistics; confer with Google counsel re file status, potential stipulations, and pleading deadlines; confer with trial team re same.
07/30/2021	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re potential new class reps and when to add to complaint
07/30/2021	A106	Yelton, Rick	Associate	1.10	770.00	700.00	Communicate with multiple contacts regarding addition of new class rep.; discuss strategy for same internally.
08/02/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating notice of transcript availability; reviewing PACER re Kirkland & Ellis involvement and reporting to D. Charest;
08/02/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating transcript order form;
08/05/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Reviewed research memo re former employee standing issues for use in amending complaint
08/06/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with K Malone re amending complaint
08/09/2021	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Participated in call with YT re possible settlement
08/09/2021	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Prepared summary of call with YT for BC team
08/09/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re stipulations and trial schedule; confer with YouTube counsel re same; review file materials.
08/09/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Reviewing and saving email agreements re potential amended and restated master services agreement and statement of work being highly confidential AEO; reviewing and circulating notice of withdrawal of counsel;
08/10/2021	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed and edited stipulation re extending time for amending complaint
08/16/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating joint stipulated request and proposed order to extend time to file complaint; reviewing and circulating order granting stipulation and calendaring deadline to file amended complaint;
08/24/2021	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Call with potential class rep N re intake as potential client; call with potential class rep O (vm) re intake as potential client; updating team on both;
08/25/2021	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.80	600.00	750.00	Read Google-Accenture contract to understand Google's retained authority for potential amendment to complaint
08/25/2021	1139	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and saving document production from Google-Youtube and discussing same with P. Murphree;
10/11/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with YouTube counsel re conference call logistics and settlement discussions; confer with leadership re same.
10/12/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with YouTube counsel re conference call logistics and settlement discussions; confer with leadership re same.
10/13/2021	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.00	1,050.00	1,050.00	Confer with leadership re settlement discussions, litigation strategy, and next steps; confer with trial team re same; review file materials; confer with leadership re litigation strategy.
12/29/2021	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed BC team re status of case

01/05/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Communicated with BC team re plans for responding to court order re compliance with amended complaint
01/10/2022	A107	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with D Charest and K Malone separately re plans for complying with court order for status update
01/10/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with leadership re settlement discussions and mediation plans; confer with trial team re same; review file materials.
01/11/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with K Malone re status of response to court order for status update
01/13/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.20	1,260.00	1,050.00	Confer with leadership re mediation and related issues; review file materials; confer with Google counsel re mediation; confer with leadership re litigation strategy and next steps; confer with trial team re same.
01/14/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed filing of status report with court
01/19/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with leadership re mediation logistics and preparation; confer with trial team re same; confer with Google counsel re mediation logistics.
01/20/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with leadership re mediation and related issues; confer with YouTube counsel re same; confer with trial team re same; prepare for mediation.
02/04/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.70	735.00	1,050.00	Confer with leadership re expert meeting and mediation preparation; coordinate same with trial team; review file materials.
02/07/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.90	945.00	1,050.00	Confer with experts re potential expert engagement and related issues; review file materials; confer with trial team re experts and settlement discussion.
02/07/2022	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Participated in call with our experts re initial information needed from Google to begin making recommendations
02/07/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Identified sample for retention agreement for experts (Watson and Norman)
02/08/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Prepared draft engagement letter for experts (Watson + Norman)
02/08/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.10	42.50	425.00	Reviewing and saving template expert agreement for P. Murphree; Confer with YouTube counsel re mediation issues and logistics;
02/09/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	confer with trial team re same.
02/09/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Discussing distro lists with P. Murphree; reviewing and saving draft of expert engagement letter;
02/10/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Edited engagement letters for experts Norman and Watson
02/10/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF and internally to arrange distribution list serv
02/10/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.90	945.00	1,050.00	Prepare for settlement conference; review file materials; attend settlement conference and mediation preparation session.
02/11/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Saving drafts of expert engagement letters; discussing email distribution lists with P. Murphree and T. Sanchez;
02/13/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with D Charest re plan for drafting mediation brief for Judge Westerfield
02/14/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Followed up with JLSF on approval for engagement letters for experts Norman and Watson
02/14/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Proofread and finalized expert engagement letters for Watson and Norman
02/14/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.60	255.00	425.00	Reviewing mediation confirmation letter and calendaring mediation and deadline to submit mediation briefing; formatting and revising expert engagement letters and discussing with P. Murphree;
02/16/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Finalized and sent engagement letters to experts Norman and Watson along with request for status update on their list of needed information from YT to build their plans to improve content moderators' working conditions
02/16/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re mediation plans and related logistics; confer with YouTube counsel re same.
02/16/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with Dr Norman, D Charest, and JLSF re Dr Norman rate increase
02/16/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Updating expert files for S. Norman and P. Watson with engagement letters;
02/17/2022	9901	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Updated Watson expert engagement letter to reflect new fee agreement
02/17/2022	9901	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Updated and recirculated Norman expert engagement letter

02/17/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and saving revised expert engagement letters for S. Norma and P. Watson;
02/18/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with Norman re expert engagement letter
02/18/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Updated BC and JLSF team on status of experts Watson and Norman
02/18/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Coordinated payment for invoice for mediation with JLSF
02/18/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.10	42.50	425.00	Reviewing and saving fully executed expert engagement letter from S. Norman;
02/22/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re info for mediation and info to send to experts
02/22/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed YT proposal for high-level settlement terms and shared with experts Norman and Watson for review
02/22/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed mediator with list of attendees for plaintiffs
02/24/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.70	735.00	1,050.00	Prepare for mediation; confer with trial team re same.
02/24/2022	A111	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re payment of invoice for JAMS
02/24/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.10	42.50	425.00	Reviewing and saving fully executed expert agreement for P. Watson;
02/25/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Prepare for mediation; confer with trial team re same; coordinate mediation logistics.
02/25/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed JLSF re plan for drafting letter in response to mediator's request
02/25/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.10	42.50	425.00	Reviewing mediation letters and updating calendar entry; discussing with P. Murphree;
02/28/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.70	525.00	750.00	Edited letter to mediator prior to first mediation
02/28/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed JLSF re letter to mediator and payment of mediator fees
02/28/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Proofread letter to mediator
03/01/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Discussing link for mediation with team and T. Sanchez (separately);
03/01/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.20	1,260.00	1,050.00	Prepare for mediation; review file materials; confer with trial team re mediation planning and related issues.
03/02/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	3.00	2,250.00	750.00	Participated in mediation session with Judge Westerfield
03/02/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with experts Norman and Watson re information needs in order to evaluate injunctive relief part of settlement
03/02/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Updating calendar entry with Zoom link and sending to T. Sanchez;
03/02/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	5.40	5,670.00	1,050.00	Prepare for mediation; review file materials; attend mediation; confer with trial team re mediation and litigation strategy.
03/03/2022	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with experts Norman and Watson re YT internal research on mods use of platform enhancements
03/03/2022	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed questions for YT provided by experts
03/04/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Edited list of questions provided by experts Norman and Watson to send to YT for help with evaluating injunctive relief portion of settlement
03/04/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed opposing counsel with obtaining answers to questions provided by experts Norman and Watson, the answers to which were requested to enable them to evaluate the settlement proposal
03/04/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed experts Watson and Norman re team call on Monday
03/07/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with expert S Norman re potential pre-mediation meeting
03/07/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.60	450.00	750.00	Participated in mediation prep session with experts, D Charest, and Steve W
03/07/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.40	1,470.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re mediation preparation and next steps; review file materials.
03/08/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed YouTube answers to questions posed by experts Normand and Watson in advance of mediation session
03/08/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed with experts Norman and Watson re YT's response to their questions in advance of mediation session
03/08/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed with D Charest and S Williams re YT response to employee numbers and answers to our questions from our experts
03/08/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	5.30	3,975.00	750.00	Participated in mediation session with Judge Westerfield
03/08/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	6.20	6,510.00	1,050.00	Prepare for mediation session; attend mediation session; confer with trial team re mediation session results and next steps.
03/09/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and saving settlement terms;
03/11/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Read ND Cal specific guidance for approval motions in class actions
03/11/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF and YT counsel re setting up meeting with YouTube's experts and Plaintiffs' experts re injunctive relief
03/11/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	2.00	2,100.00	1,050.00	Confer with leadership re settlement issues and approval standards; confer with trial team re settlement administrator and related issues.



03/14/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with opposing counsel and experts Norman and Watson re scheduling time for Plaintiffs' experts to meet with YT's experts
03/14/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF and experts Norman and Watson re meeting with YT experts
03/14/2022	1137	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.60	255.00	425.00	Emailing with C. Clapp (Angeion), S. Wallace (KCC), and O. Brown (BrownGreer) re settlement administration to set up calls with D. Charest; calendaring calls and discussing with T. Sanchez;
03/15/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.60	450.00	750.00	Met with YT counsel and Accenture counsel re getting number of class members and address and related info re class members
03/15/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged D Charest with recap of meeting with YT and Accenture
03/15/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re recap of status of preliminary approval paperwork and related matters
03/15/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with YT counsel re attendance at meeting of experts from both sides
03/19/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with experts Norman and Watson re meeting with YT experts
03/19/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with YT counsel re Wednesday meeting between Plaintiffs' experts and YT's experts
03/20/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with S Williams re questions on deadlines for finishing settlement work with YT
03/21/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.60	255.00	425.00	Call with C. Clapp from Angeion and D. Charest; call with S. Wallace from KCC and D. Charest; call with O. Brown from BrownGreer and D. Charest;
03/22/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Call with A. Palmer (Epiq) re settlement administration; attend call with J. Keough (JND) re settlement administration;
03/23/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and saving settlement admin bids from Brown Greer, Epiq (updated) and KCC;
03/23/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement issues and data requirements; attend expert conference re workplace conditions and related issues; confer with YouTube counsel re settlement issues, timeline, and next steps.
03/24/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed experts Norman and Watson re questions for YT and scheduling new meeting between Plaintiffs' experts and YT's experts
03/24/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re status of YT case after meeting of experts on 3/23
03/24/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with YT counsel and experts Norman and Watson re schedule and plans for upcoming call between Plaintiffs' and YT's experts
03/27/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re questions from experts Norman and Watson to YT
03/28/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Participated in call with YT re questions from experts to be answered before they can sign off on settlement
03/28/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Had call with expert Watson re call with YT re obtaining information needed for expert approval of settlement
03/28/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed D Charest and S Williams re Patricia Watson missing call and to report on my call with Dr Watson
03/28/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF to relay Dr Watson apology for missing scheduled call
03/28/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	3.30	2,475.00	750.00	Edited draft of settlement agreement circulated by YouTube
03/28/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re expert information exchange, settlement issues, and next steps; review file materials.
03/29/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re value of opt-out threshold
03/29/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Had call with JLSF re plans for next steps in settlement
03/29/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	1.40	595.00	425.00	Preparing comparison of KCC, Angeion, Epiq, and BrownGreer bids; emailing with J. Keough re JND bid;
03/30/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.90	675.00	750.00	Researched re disclosing or not disclosing or limited disclosure of opt-out threshold in class settlements
03/30/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re Judge Rogers concerns with making existence of side agreements clear
03/30/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed S Williams edits to YT proposed settlement agreement
03/30/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.00	750.00	750.00	Reviewed proposals and costs from settlement administrators
03/30/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Edited proposed settlement agreement in preparation for returning it to YT
03/30/2022	1142	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Reviewing bids; emailing with J. Keough;

							Confer with trial team re class administrator bids and related issues; confer with trial team re settlement agreement draft review, motion papers, and next steps; review file materials.
03/30/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	
03/31/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed YT counsel with comments on settlement agreement draft
03/31/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re question about scope of NDAs and whether to include in settlement agreement
04/10/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.10	825.00	750.00	Reviewed and commented on YT edits to settlement agreement
04/11/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed S Williams re responding to YT proposal re settlement agreement
04/12/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed JLSF re settlement administrator selection
04/12/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed YT counsel re settlement agreement review
04/17/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed BC and JLSF re meeting re selecting administrator and subpoenaing records from YT vendors
04/19/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re meetings internally and with YouTube this week
04/19/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed YT proposed supplemental agreement and material re platform enhancements
04/20/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re expert evaluation and settlement issues; review file materials.
04/20/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed YT counsel re question about answer to Plaintiffs' experts' questions and scheduling meeting
04/20/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Prepared comparisons for proposed injunctive relief for experts Norman and Watson
04/20/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed experts re YT answers to questions re platform enhancements and to request input on injunctive relief
04/20/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Edited supplemental confidential agreement
04/20/2022	A111	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Worked with IT to resolve issue preventing attachment of files to share with experts Norman and Watson
04/20/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re edits to supplemental confidential agreement
04/20/2022	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.90	675.00	750.00	Reviewed material re platform enhancements and need for same shared by YT
04/20/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed JLSF and BC counsel re summary of key points of documents circulated by YT re platform enhancements
04/21/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement issues and progress; review file materials.
04/21/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re scheduling meeting on various issues to discuss (administrators, YT responses to requests, number of class members)
04/22/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with Sonya Norman re response to YT answers re tech enhancements
04/24/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re meeting re case
04/24/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed summary of status of ongoing issues to BC and JLSF attorneys in advance of meeting
04/25/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.60	1,680.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement administration, settlement issues, and task assignments; confer with settlement administrators re vendor bids and adjustments; review file materials.
04/25/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Had call with JLSF re next steps in YT case and settlement
04/25/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Drafted email to YT counsel re questions from Plaintiffs' experts re injunctive relief
04/25/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re NDA provision in settlement agreement
04/25/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with counsel for YT re edits to confidential supplemental agreement
04/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Researched to compare proposals for settlement administrators around case/project management costs to identify differences contributing to price difference
04/25/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed back and forth with BC and JLSF re settlement administrator selection
04/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed KCC re work as settlement administrator
04/26/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with Plaintiff team and YT counsel re settlement
04/28/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed back and forth with JLSF and YT re status of settlement
04/28/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed to schedule meet and confer with YT and JLSF
04/28/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed Patricia Watson re position on YouTube injunctive relief in advance of meeting with YT
04/28/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	3.50	2,625.00	750.00	Edited draft of preliminary approval motion

04/29/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with P Watson re research on appropriateness of YT SRT
05/01/2022	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed material provided by expert P Watson in advance of call with YT
05/02/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.40	1,470.00	1,050.00	Confer with YouTube counsel re settlement draft and related issues;
05/02/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	confer with trial team re same.
05/02/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.00	750.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re meeting with YT re settlement agreement
05/02/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.70	525.00	750.00	Participated in call re settlement agreement with YT counsel
05/02/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Edited settlement agreement to incorporate changes discussed at meeting with YT counsel
05/02/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re next steps following meeting with YT
05/02/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed experts Norman and Watson to update on status of negotiations following call with YT re settlement
05/03/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement administrator; confer with KCC re settlement administration and engagement issues; review file materials.
05/03/2022	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Had call with JLSF re YT settlement agreement and paperwork
05/03/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed D Charest and S Williams re YT request for preliminary approval papers
05/04/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re draft preliminary approval papers, comments to same, and related issues; confer with trial team re settlement issues and next steps.
05/04/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Edited draft preliminary approval motion and brief
05/08/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with contact at KCC re update on status of settlement
05/09/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re Accenture in-house counsel
05/09/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed material provided by YT re class members
05/09/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Emailed back and forth with JLSF and BC re YT info re class members and unresolved issues before filing for preliminary approval
05/10/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.70	735.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement issues and class size; confer with YT counsel re same; coordinate settlement agreement draft edits and related issues.
05/10/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Participated in call with YT re settlement
05/10/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Edited settlement agreement and supplement per call with YT
05/10/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed experts Norman and Watson re approving settlement injunctive relief
05/10/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re approval of settlement agreement before circulation to YT
05/10/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re response to YT re timing for settlement agreement
05/10/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed YT counsel re settlement agreement draft and expert questions
05/10/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed proposed edits to proposed injunctive relief provided by expert Watson
05/10/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with D Charest and JLSF re response to YT and expert Watson re expert comments on injunctive relief
05/11/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Drafted email to experts Norman and Watson re injunctive relief for settlement
05/11/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed BC and JLSF re expert positions on injunctive relief
05/11/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with experts Norman and Watson re YT settlement
05/11/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with expert Watson re YT settlement
05/11/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with D Charest and JLSF re plans for approach YT following expert sign off on the settlement
05/11/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed with experts and BC and JLSF attorneys re scheduling call re settlement
05/12/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Emailed multiple times with JLSF, BC, and experts Norman and Watson re meeting to discuss injunctive relief
05/12/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Prepared for call with experts Norman and Watson re YT settlement
05/12/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Had call with experts re views on settlement and answer their questions re injunctive relief
05/12/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Sent recap email to JLSF following call with experts Norman and Watson
05/15/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed YT edits to settlement agreement and compare to prior conversations

05/15/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re response to YT re edits to settlement agreement
							Confer with YouTube counsel re settlement agreement and related issues; revise and edit draft settlement agreement; confer with trial team re same.
05/16/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.50	1,575.00	1,050.00	
05/16/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.60	450.00	750.00	Had call with Dan C and JLSF re responding to YT edits to settlement
05/16/2022	1139	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Edited subpoena to accenture re content moderator numbers
05/16/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re subpoena for Accenture
05/18/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Confer with Google counsel re settlement agreement confer with trial team re same; review file materials.
05/18/2022	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Read expert recommendation document prepared by Drs Watson and Norman before circulation to YT
05/18/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Read Google confidentiality agreement for potential inclusion in settlement agreement
05/18/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed YT edits to settlement agreement
05/18/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF and D Charest re additional onsite counseling provision in settlement agreement
05/19/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.30	1,365.00	1,050.00	Confer with Google counsel re settlement agreement and related issues; confer with trial team re finalization of settlement agreement, expected filings, and next steps; review file materials.
05/19/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Participated in settlement discussion with YT
05/19/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Reviewed settlement agreement carefully for language about timing or approval of announcements
05/20/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	2.60	2,730.00	1,050.00	Confer with Google counsel re settlement agreement and related issues; confer with trial team re finalization of settlement agreement and report to court.
05/20/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed back and forth with JLSF and YT re joint status report
05/20/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed YT edits to settlement agreement and checked accuracy of changed math
05/20/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re status of signed settlement agreement
05/23/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement papers, finalization of settlement, and related issues; review file materials.
05/24/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement papers, finalization of settlement, and related issues; review file materials; confer with Google counsel re settlement and related issues.
05/25/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating the joint status report and proposed order;
06/13/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed emails from Accenture counsel re class member data and numbers
06/14/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.80	600.00	750.00	Reviewed class member data produced by Accenture for accuracy with estimates, comparison to previously produced data, and potential inaccuracies within the data
06/14/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re Accenture data production of class members
06/14/2022	1139	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Reviewing and saving Accenture's production and discussing with P. Murphree; reviewing and saving YT's content mod roster and discussing with P. Murphree;
06/16/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Had call with Steve Williams re Accenture's class roster produced
06/16/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with YT counsel re Accenture roster of class members
06/16/2022	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with YT counsel and JLSF re arranging meetings
06/17/2022	1136	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Participated in call with S Williams and YT counsel re class data list
06/17/2022	1136	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Had call with S Williams re remaining materials to assemble for prelim approval motion
06/17/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Researched timing of engagement of settlement administrator
06/17/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed KCC re engagement terms as settlement administrator
06/17/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed JLSF and BC attorneys re KCC
06/17/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with experts Norman and Watson to update them on status of preliminary approval motion and declarations
06/17/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed BC and JLSF re final steps for preparing preliminary approval motion
06/17/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement issues and administrator issues; review file materials; coordinate settlement administrator retention and related issues.
06/18/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with settlement administrator re engagement agreement
06/18/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re engagement agreement with settlement administrator

06/20/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement issues and next steps; confer with Google counsel re same; review file materials.
06/21/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	2.90	2,175.00	750.00	Edited motion for preliminary approval to conform to ND Cal Guidance
06/21/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	1.50	637.50	425.00	Reviewing Scola settlement filings and discussing with P. Murphree; compiling data on class size and class notice per P. Murphree and discussing same with P. Murphree;
06/22/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Drafted email to Epiq re info needed about Facebook settlement for use in prelim approval mtn in this case to conform with ND Cal guidance
06/22/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.30	975.00	750.00	Edited motion for preliminary approval
06/23/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Edited motion for preliminary approval
06/23/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with Epiq and with JLSF re information for motion for preliminary approval
06/23/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.10	1,155.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement issues and next steps; revise and edit draft motion for preliminary approval; confer with trial team re same.
06/29/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed expert Watson re Declaration
07/03/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed S Williams re declarations ISO mtn for preliminary approval
07/03/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Edited short and long form notices
07/03/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed D Charest and S Williams re final prep for filing motion for preliminary approval
07/03/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.70	735.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re notice program, settlement issues, and preliminary approval filing; review file materials; revise and edit draft approval submission.
07/04/2022	1136	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed S Wallace at KCC re potential declaration ISO mtn for preliminary approval
07/04/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	2.20	1,650.00	750.00	Edited motion for preliminary approval
07/04/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.60	450.00	750.00	Drafted Declaration for Dan Charest ISO mtn for preliminary approval
07/04/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed D Charest and S Williams re status of work on motion for preliminary approval
07/04/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed expert Sonya Norman re executing declaration ISO motion for preliminary approval
07/04/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.00	750.00	750.00	Prepared proposed order granting motion for preliminary approval
07/04/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.20	900.00	750.00	Cross checked notice, motion for preliminary approval, and order to ensure compliance with ND Cal Procedural Guidance for Class Action Settlements
07/04/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Edited preliminary approval motion, order, notices, and D Charest declaration per S Williams comments
07/04/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed S Williams re changes to settlement paperwork and communication with YouTube counsel
07/04/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed YT counsel re drafts of settlement paperwork (motion, order, notices)
07/04/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re notice program, settlement issues, and preliminary approval filing; review file materials.
07/05/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Had call with S Williams re finalizing the preliminary approval package
07/05/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with S Williams and KCC re edits to notices
07/05/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with S Williams re final versions of executed declarations ISO motion for preliminary approval
07/05/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re execution of declaration ISO mtn for preliminary approval
07/05/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Worked on updated and making consistent settlement motion paperwork
07/05/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed expert Norman re declaration ISO motion for prelim approval
07/05/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.90	675.00	750.00	Proofread, assembled, and crosschecked package of materials for motion for preliminary approval
07/05/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged Dan C and Julianna G re BC work on preliminary approval motion
07/05/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Edited administrative motion to seal Exhibit 2 (confidential supplemental agreement)
07/05/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed formatting of ToC in motion for preliminary approval
07/05/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed final draft of motion for preliminary approval

07/05/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed and messaged with S Williams and D Charest re final approval to file motion for preliminary approval
07/05/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Emailed multiple times with JLSF and BC re filing of motion for preliminary approval
07/05/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re draft approval briefs and related issues; review file materials.
07/06/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re opposing counsel email re filing of motion for preliminary approval
07/06/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with BC re providing KCC info to YouTube for settlement purposes
07/06/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re providing word version of settlement materials to court
07/06/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and saving admin motion to file under seal exhibit for motion for preliminary approval and supporting docs; reviewing NDCA local rules;
07/06/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.90	945.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement approval issues; confer with Google counsel re same; review file materials.
07/07/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed JLSF re copying Ds on emails to the court
07/07/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed Juliana G re info to provide to KCC re settlement
07/07/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Emailing with P. Murphree re motion for preliminary approval filing; emailing motion and exhibits to S. Wallace;
07/11/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re info needed for YT to complete transfer of funds
07/12/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with S Wallace re CAFA notice
07/13/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re attendance on BC behalf at preliminary approval hearing
07/13/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Reviewing and circulating plaintiffs' corrected admin motion for leave to seal ex. 2 to motion for preliminary approval; reviewing and circulating motion for preliminary approval and exhibits thereto; reviewing and circulating certificate of service re corrected admin motion;
07/14/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed YT counsel re KCC wire instructions
07/23/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with YT counsel re wire info and W9 for settlement administrator
07/23/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re YT questions re wire instructions
07/23/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re BC attendance person at preliminary approval hearing
07/25/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with S Wallace and YT counsel re account for placing settlement fund
07/25/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Reviewing and circulating YT's notice of non-opposition to the motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement; creating hearing prep folder and discussing with P. Murphree;
07/31/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Investigated payment arrangements for Dr Norman
07/31/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re payment for Dr Norman
07/31/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with Dr Norman re payment for expertwork
08/12/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed S Williams re planning for prelim approval hearing attendance
08/15/2022	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	7.90	5,925.00	750.00	Traveled from New Orleans to Oakland for preliminary approval hearing
08/15/2022	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.20	900.00	750.00	Reviewed preliminary approval papers in preparation for preliminary approval hearing
08/16/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re hearing results and next steps.
08/16/2022	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.70	525.00	750.00	Prepared materials to argue at preliminary approval hearing
08/16/2022	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Traveled to and from preliminary approval hearing
08/16/2022	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Attended preliminary approval hearing
08/16/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Met with JLSF to address concerns following preliminary approval hearing that was continued
08/16/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed JLSF re plans for complying with court requirements for supplementing preliminary approval papers
08/16/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.80	600.00	750.00	Prepared punch list for court's requirements for supplementing preliminary approval paperwork for organizing work with JLSF
08/16/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JSLF associates re identifying final documents to use as base for editing to conform with court specifications
08/16/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Edited settlement agreement and confidential settlement agreement to conform with court instructions

08/16/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JSLF associates re plan for submitting settlement agreement edits to Ds
08/16/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re expert declarations for supplementary motion for preliminary approval
08/16/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed JSLF attorneys re location of word version of Expert Dr Watson declaration
08/16/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.80	600.00	750.00	Drafted additional suggestions for Norman declaration to address concerns raised by court re adequacy of explanation in the declaration
08/16/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re coordinating who will send revised settlement agreement to YT for approval to avoid duplicative emails or drafts
08/16/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re plan re submitting settlement agreement versus agreement plus amended complaint to YT and strategic considerations therein
08/16/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating supplemental declaration of S. Williams ISO motion for preliminary approval of class settlement and settlement agreement;
08/17/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	3.70	3,885.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re supplemental briefing and related issues; revise and edit draft supplemental briefing materials; review file materials.
08/17/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with experts Norman and Watson re supplemental declarations for preliminary approval
08/17/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.70	525.00	750.00	Drafted and edited Watson Supplemental Declaration
08/17/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed BC and JLSF re Watson supplemental declaration
08/17/2022	1138	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	7.10	5,325.00	750.00	Traveled from Oakland to New Orleans after preliminary approval hearing
08/17/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	5.10	3,825.00	750.00	Researched CA9 law re class action approval and redrafted motion for preliminary approval to accord with court's comments at 8/16 hearing
08/17/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Assembled and annotated list of preliminary approval paperwork to update team on status of all moving pieces
08/17/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed JLSF associates re coordinating plans for work on preliminary approval papers over Thursday and Friday
08/17/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.70	297.50	425.00	Reviewing and circulating minute entry; calendaring deadline for plaintiffs to file supplemental papers; calendaring hearing; reviewing and saving drafts of supplemental declarations and settlement agreement; reviewing docket for Facebook case re injunctive relief paragraph in S. Watson's declaration;
08/18/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.70	735.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re supplemental briefing and related issues; revise and edit draft supplemental briefing materials; review file materials.
08/18/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.10	825.00	750.00	Edited and redrafted amended complaint
08/18/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Edited and added new allegations to Dan Charest declaration ISO preliminary approval
08/18/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Edited draft of amended motion for preliminary approval
08/19/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re supplemental briefing and related issues; revise and edit draft supplemental briefing materials; review file materials.
08/19/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re edits to expert declarations
08/19/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Had call with experts Norman and Watson re supplemental declarations ISO preliminary approval
08/19/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.50	375.00	750.00	Made edits to complaint and expert declarations ISO motion for preliminary approval
08/19/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Had call with JLSF associate re edits to expert declarations ISO mtn for preliminary approval
08/19/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Cgarest re approval of materials for to send to YouTube re motion for preliminary approval
08/19/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Had call with JSLF associates re edits to amended complaint
08/19/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Reviewed and edited amended complaint before sending to YT counsel
08/19/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF and Dr Norman re approval of edits to declaration ISO mtn for preliminary approval
08/19/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed edits made by Sonya Norman to her declaration ISO mtn for preliminary approval
08/19/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Prepared final declaration for Dan Charest ISO mtn for preliminary approval

08/19/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest and S Williams re plans for filing motion ISO preliminary approval
08/19/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Reviewed papers prior to filing mtn for prelimin approval
08/19/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged BC attorneys re filing of preliminary approval papers
08/19/2022	9901	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	4.20	3,150.00	750.00	Remained BC attorney on call through process of filing amended motion for preliminary approval and associated paperwork
08/22/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	2.60	2,730.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement approval issues and YouTube comments to supplemental filings; confer with YouTube counsel re settlement approval and related issues; confer with trial team re same.
08/22/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Had call with Dan C re YT position on settlement
08/22/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and saving amended complaint; reviewing and saving supplemental briefing, S. Williams declaration, D. Charest declaration, S. Watson declaration, P. Norman declaration, and the proposed order; reviewing and circulating notice re filing error fixed by clerk;
08/23/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.90	945.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement approval issues and YouTube comments to supplemental filings; confer with YouTube counsel re settlement approval and related issues; confer with trial team re same.
08/23/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Met with A Klevern and K Nelson re status of supplemental motion for preliminary approval
08/23/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re which attorney to attend 9/20 hearing
08/23/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating 2nd supp declaration of S. Williams ISO motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement and draft settlement agreement;
08/31/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Prepare for preliminary approval hearing; confer with trial team re same; confer with trial team re approval papers and recent developments.
09/08/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.10	1,155.00	1,050.00	Confer with YouTube counsel re settlement agreement and related issues; confer with trial team re same; coordinate settlement signing and related issues.
09/08/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Participated in call with YT counsel re executing settlement agreement
09/09/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating notice of filing executed settlement agreement;
09/12/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re court request re settlement; review file materials.
09/19/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with Dan C re court order vacating hearing
09/19/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing and circulating order vacating hearing; updating calendar; Review order on preliminary approval; confer with trial team re same; confer with YouTube counsel re same; coordinate corrective action.
09/28/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Read court order granting motion for preliminary approval
09/29/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed JLSF re typo/mistake in court order granting preliminary approval
09/29/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed KCC re court order granting preliminary approval
09/29/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed KCC re court order granting preliminary approval
09/30/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.30	225.00	750.00	Messaged and emailed with JLSF and YT counsel re notifying court of typo/mistake in preliminary approval order
09/30/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.80	340.00	425.00	Calls A. Garcia (courtroom deputy for Judge) re typo and mistake in order; discussing with P. Murphree and D. Charest; emailing with A. Garcia and all counsel re correct number of class members; reviewing and circulating amended order granting preliminary approval of class action settlement; running compare report of exhibit B (as filed) and exhibit B (as ordered) and discussing with P. Murphree;
09/30/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed order entered by court amending order granting preliminary approval to confirm changes made
09/30/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with settlement administrator re amended preliminary approval order
09/30/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with YouTube re class member data for administrator
09/30/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Compared court Exhibit B to draft of long form notice to identify differences before sending to KCC
09/30/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re notices and other materials necessary for notice plan and website
10/01/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed experts re grant of preliminary approval



10/04/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.60	630.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re post-approval process and class information; confer with YouTube counsel re same.
10/04/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Calendarizing deadlines in order granting preliminary approval;
10/06/2022	1140	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Researched re contact info for Accenture counsel
10/06/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Confer with Accenture counsel re class list and updates to same;
10/06/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	confer with trial team re same.
10/06/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Messaged with D Charest re Accenture counsel
10/11/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewing class member info required to send to settlement admin;
10/11/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	discussing with D. Charest; emailing with D. Charest re same;
10/12/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Checked proposed schedule against court order for settlement administration for accuracy
10/13/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Emailed YT counsel and settlement admin re schedule in light of dates set in court order
10/17/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with Dan C re meeting with YT re size of class
10/17/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Confer with trial team re settlement approval, class size data, and related issues; review file materials.
10/17/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.80	840.00	1,050.00	Participated in call with YT re increased number of class members
10/18/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.30	1,365.00	1,050.00	Calculated pro rata increase in settlement amount necessary to account for increase in class members
10/18/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Confer with trial team re class size, settlement approval, and related issues; confer with YouTube re class size and settlement agreement; review file materials.
10/21/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Confer with leadership re settlement issues, approval process, and fee application; confer with trial team re same; coordinate approval issues; review file materials; confer with YouTube counsel re amendment to settlement for increased class size and related issues; confer with leadership re same.
10/21/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Discussing fee motion and collecting time reports with D. Charest;
10/24/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	discussing time entry confirmation with team;
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with YT counsel, BC, and JLSF re answers to questions posed by KCC
10/25/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed drafts of notices for accuracy and conformance with approved versions by court
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed with Dan C and Steve W re questions from KCC
10/25/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re readiness of settlement website
10/25/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with BC and co-counsel re approaching deadlines for class notice
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed revised drafts of notices
10/25/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with Steve Williams re post-approval notification and dealing with duplicate class members
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re settlement website, post-approval notice, and duplicate class members.
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed list of duplicate class members
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re list of duplicate class members
10/25/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re updating class size with court
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re plan for dealing with class members with multiple email addresses
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed proposed supplemental agreement sent by YT and checked for accuracy against settlement agreement and confidential supplemental agreement
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with D Charest and S Williams re potential issues with YT's proposed supplemental settlement agreement
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed KCC settlement website to conform with accuracy and accessibility for class members
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re issues with current version of settlement website to correct and include accurate documents
10/25/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re issues with current version of class website and changes to be made re increased settlement amount in light of increase in numbers of class members
10/25/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed back and forth with JLSF re finalizing supplemental settlement agreement amount re increased clas size
10/25/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Emailed multiple times with with BC and JLSF re approval of YT proposed language for supplemental settlement agreement and amounts therein

10/25/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	1.60	1,680.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re class size, settlement amendment, and related issues; confer with YouTube counsel re same; review file materials.
10/26/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	2.40	2,520.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re class size, settlement amendment, and related issues; confer with YouTube counsel re same; review file materials; draft notice re settlement amendment and next steps; confer with trial team re same; confer with YouTube counsel re same.
10/26/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Edited notice to court re increased settlement
10/26/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with YT re notice to court re increased settlement
10/26/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Proofread notice to court re increased settlement amount
10/26/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Drafting notice shell for D. Charest; discussing same with D. Charest; emailing with A. Jensen re filing; discussing paralegal change at JSLF with team; emailing recent version to JSLF;
10/27/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Reviewing and circulating notice regarding class size and increase in settlement amount; emailing with R. Vazquez-Ponce;
10/28/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re finalizing plans for sending notice to class members
10/28/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re use of notice of increased class size and settlement amount in communication with class members
10/28/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC and with JLSF re updating info on settlement website re increased settlement amount
10/28/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with BC attorneys and staff re class notice being sent, posting of notice of increased class size and settlement, and need to begin actively checking the class website
10/28/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.50	525.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re class notice, notice program, and settlement issues; review file materials.
10/31/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged D Charest re responsible firm for motion for attorney fees
11/01/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re responsibility for drafting motion for attorney fees
11/02/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.20	85.00	425.00	Reviewing KCC website and logging visit to same;
11/04/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed KCC re providing updates to class counsel and addressing YT issue with being able to transfer funds to KCC's account
11/07/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.10	42.50	425.00	Reviewing KCC notice website and filling out log;
11/08/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed Steve Williams re materials needed for motion for attorney fees
11/09/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re update on status of notice, website, etc.
11/09/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with Dan C and JLSF re call to discuss motion for attorney fees
11/09/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re class members with bounceback emails
11/10/2022	1135	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.30	127.50	425.00	Emailing with accounting re time report and discussing with P. Murphree;
11/10/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Had call with Steve Williams re dividing work for motion for fees
11/10/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.70	525.00	750.00	Reviewed firm time entries and clarified text descriptions in preparation for motion for fees
11/12/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	1.60	1,200.00	750.00	Edited and clarified time report from BC attorneys and staff for use in motion for approval of fees
11/12/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with R Yelton and J Grevois re clarification of a few potentially misfiled time entries while preparing motion for fees
11/13/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed preliminary approval ruling for content of documentation to provide ISO mtn for fees
11/14/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	0.70	735.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re file status, settlement issues, and fee application; review file materials; coordinate scheduling and task assignments.
11/14/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Emailing with P. Bruns re updated time report and expense report; discussing with P. Murphree;
11/14/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.60	450.00	750.00	Prepared draft declaration by D Charest ISO mtn for attorney fees
11/14/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with KCC re contact info for class members that did not receive notice
11/14/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed spreadsheet of class members without emails or mailing addresses and emailed YT counsel re same to determine if YT or Accenture may have additional contact information
11/14/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	information from Accenture re class members without email or physical addresses on file and suggested potentially useful pieces of info

11/14/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Updated time entries to remove misfiled entries after discussion with BC attorneys and staff in preparation for preparing time for motion for fees
11/14/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re class rep info to provide to KCC and timing for submission of motion for fees and expenses
11/14/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with J Gravois and P Bruns re additional records needed for expense and time reports for use in motion to fees and expenses
11/15/2022	1135	Charest, Daniel	Partner	2.30	2,415.00	1,050.00	Confer with trial team re file status, settlement issues, and fee application; review file materials; revise and edit draft declaration; confer with trial team re same; confer with YouTube counsel re class contact information issues; confer with trial team re same.
11/15/2022	1141	Gravois, Julianna	Paralegal	0.40	170.00	425.00	Call with P. Murphree re tasks for motion for attorney's fees; emailing with P. Bruns re updated reports; updating draft folder with firm bio and discussing with P. Murphree;
11/15/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Edited declaration of D Charest ISO mtn for fees and expenses
11/15/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Met with J Gravois re items needed to complete BC work on motion for fees
11/15/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed and accepted edits to declaration made by Dan Charest
11/15/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Reviewed new information provided by YT counsel re 6 class members with no contact info
11/15/2022	1142	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed and messaged with BC staff re research to identify contact info for 6 class members with no contact info
11/15/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Had call with Steve Williams re planning for motion for fees and deciding approach to setting fee amount in motion to court
11/16/2022	1136	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with BC staff re most up-to-date time and expense records for use in motion for fees
11/16/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with BC staff re assembling info for expenses and updated time for use ISO mtn for fees and expenses
11/16/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.40	300.00	750.00	Prepared updated report of expenses and showing time through 11/16/22 for use ISO mtn for attorney fees
11/16/2022	1137	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.20	150.00	750.00	Reviewed draft motion for fees and declaration of S Williams ISO motion
11/16/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Emailed with JLSF re draft motion and declaration of S. Williams
11/16/2022	1135	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	0.10	75.00	750.00	Messaged with D Charest re plan for review of motion and declaration of S. Williams
11/17/2022	1141	Murphree, Patrick	Associate	4.30	3,225.00	750.00	Edited, redrafted, and proofread motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and service award
<b>TOTAL</b>				<b>340.60</b>	<b>263,647.50</b>		

# **EXHIBIT 4**

*Jane Doe, individually and on behalf of all others similarly situated, v. YouTube, Inc.*  
**Litigation Costs**

Burns Charest LLP  
Inception through November 17, 2022  
Current

Description	Amount
<b>Expert Services</b>	7,450.00
Lodging	803.39
Meals	113.86
Other	34.20
Ground Transportation	143.45
Airfare	897.20
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>9,442.10</b>