

EXHIBIT B

1 Steven N. Williams (State Bar No. 175489)
2 **STEVEN WILLIAMS LAW, P.C.**
3 201 Spear Street, Suite 1100
4 San Francisco, CA 94105
5 Telephone: (415) 697-1509
6 Email: swilliams@stevenwilliamslaw.com

7 Daniel H. Charest (admitted *pro hac vice*)
8 **BURNS CHAREST LLP**
9 900 Jackson Street, Suite 500
10 Dallas, TX 75202
11 Telephone: (469) 904-4550
12 Facsimile: (469) 444-5002
13 Email: dcharest@burnscharest.com

Patrick D. Murphree (admitted *pro hac vice*)
Harry R. Yelton (admitted *pro hac vice*)
BURNS CHAREST LLP
365 Canal Street , Suite 1170
New Orleans, LA 70130
Telephone: (504) 799-2845
Facsimile: (504) 881-1765
Email: pmurphree@burnscharest.com
ryelton@burnscharest.com

14 *Attorneys for Plaintiff and the Proposed Class*

15 UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
16 NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA

17 **JANE DOE**, individually and on behalf of all others
18 similarly situated,

19 *Plaintiff,*

20 v.

21 **YOUTUBE, INC.,**

22 *Defendant.*

Civil Case No. 4:20-CV-07493-YGR

**DECLARATION OF DANIEL H.
CHAREST IN SUPPORT OF INTERIM
POST-DISTRIBUTION ACCOUNTING**

Date: April 8, 2024

Time: 9:01 a.m.

Judge: Hon. Yvonne Gonzalez Rogers

Location: Courtroom 1

1 I, Daniel H. Charest, declare and state as follows:

2 1. I make this declaration in support of the Interim Post-Distribution Accounting. I am over
3 18 years of age, and I have personal knowledge of the facts set forth herein. If called as a witness, I
4 could and would testify competently to them. I make this declaration pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746.

5 2. I am an attorney licensed to practice in Texas, Virginia (inactive), the District of
6 Columbia, and the U.S. Virgin Islands. I have been admitted *pro hac vice* in this case. I am a co-founder
7 and managing partner of Burns Charest LLP (“Burns Charest”) in Dallas, Texas. I serve as co-counsel
8 for Jane Doe (“Plaintiff”) in this action. On September 30, 2022, the Court appointed Burns Charest
9 and Joseph Saveri Law Firm (“JLSF”) as Class Counsel in this case. ECF No. 63.

10 3. On May 15, 2023, this Court granted final approval to the Settlement reached in this
11 action. Doc. 81.

12 4. During settlement negotiations, Class Counsel served a subpoena on Accenture, the
13 vendor that provided content moderators for Defendant YouTube, Inc. (“YouTube”).

14 5. Accenture responded to the subpoena by providing a spreadsheet listing individuals that
15 met the class definition.

16 6. Class Counsel was subsequently informed that Accenture had identified additional
17 individuals that met the class definition. These individuals were provided notice and included in the
18 Class. The Settlement Amount was increased pro rata to ensure that all Class Members would be treated
19 the same.

20 7. At the time of final approval, 1,432 Class Members had been identified based on the
21 information provided by Accenture in response to Class Counsel’s subpoena.

22 8. This list of 1,432 Class Members was used to provide notice of final approval to Class
23 Members, to provide them an opportunity to elect a form of electronic payment or to change their
24 mailing address, and to make the Per Capita Payments to 1,422 Class Members. Payments could not be
25 made to 4 Class Members because Class Counsel had only their email addresses and these Class
26 Members did not provide either electronic payment instructions or mailing addresses in response to
27 notice; these Class Members were included in the distribution so that payments could be made later if
28 they provided the necessary information. Six Class Members records were determined to be duplicates.

1 9. Although a small number of reissued checks remain uncashed and unexpired, the Per
2 Capita Payment process is substantially complete.

3 10. While the process of making the Per Capita Payments was ongoing, 67 individuals
4 contacted Class Counsel and/or the Settlement Administrator, asserting that they believed that they
5 were members of the class but that they had not received a payment.¹

6 11. Over the course of multiple communications and efforts to investigate from mid-October
7 2023 through the present, Class Counsel provided counsel for YouTube and for Accenture with the
8 names of these individuals and what information Class Counsel was able to obtain from them regarding
9 their employment. This information included, where available, information specifically requested by
10 Accenture.

11 12. Three of the individuals were determined to have been on the list of 1,432 Class
12 Members, but to have not received checks because the checks were sent to outdated addresses. Checks
13 were reissued to these Class Members at updated addresses.

14 13. One of these individuals was determined to have, in fact, received a Per Capita Payment.

15 14. The remaining individuals did not appear on the list of Class Members provided by
16 Accenture.

17 15. On October 27, 2023, counsel for Accenture informed Class Counsel that 6 of these
18 individuals had been “inadvertently excluded” from the list of 1,432 Class Members.

19 16. On November 7, 2023, counsel for Accenture revised that number and indicated that
20 only 1 of those 6 individuals had been inadvertently excluded and that the other 5 did not meet the class
21 definition. No action has yet been taken with respect to this individual.

22 17. Class Counsel, Accenture, and YouTube are continuing to investigate the remaining
23 individuals to determine if they should have been included in the list of Class Members.

24 18. Class Counsel, Accenture, and YouTube are also continuing to investigate whether
25 additional individuals met the criteria for membership in the class but were not included in the list
26 provided by Accenture and used for notice and payment of the Per Capita Payments.

27
28 _____
¹ The names of some of these individuals were provided indirectly by other individuals who contacted Class Counsel.

1 19. On November 21, 2023, counsel for Accenture indicated that it had identified additional
2 individuals who may have met the class definition but had not been included in the original list
3 provided by Accenture. Counsel for Accenture also indicated that additional information regarding
4 these individuals and the methodology used to identify them will be provided to Class Counsel by
5 December 1, 2023.

6 20. Following final approval, Burns Charest, in conjunction with JLSF, engaged in
7 additional work to ensure that the distribution process was completed. This work included:

- 8 a. working with the Settlement Administrator to resolve minor discrepancies in the list of
9 Class Members (e.g., multiple Class Members requesting that electronic payment be
10 made to the same account) and overseeing the distribution process;
- 11 b. communicating with individuals claiming membership in the Class but who had not
12 received a Per Capita Payment;
- 13 c. working with YouTube and Accenture to investigate the claims of these individuals to
14 determine whether or not they met the class definition;
- 15 d. working with YouTube and Accenture to identify any additional individuals that were
16 incorrectly excluded from the class list originally provided by Accenture;
- 17 e. preparing the Notice Regarding Interim Post-Distribution Accounting and Notice of
18 Motion and Motion for Extension to Time to File Final Post-Distribution Accounting;
- 19 f. preparing the Interim Post-Distribution Accounting.

20 21. The schedule attached as **Exhibit 1** is a summary chart indicating the amount of time
21 spent by the attorneys and other professional support staff at Burns Charest who were involved in this
22 litigation and the lodestar calculation based on my firm's billing rates for the period from May 1, 2023,
23 through November 28, 2023. The schedule was prepared from contemporaneous, daily time records
24 regularly prepared and maintained by my firm and which are attached for the Court's review as **Exhibit**
25 **2.**² The total lodestar amount for this period of time for my firm's work at current rates is **\$87,100** based
26 upon **119.3** hours billed.

27 _____
28 ² Individual actual or potential Class Members to whom Burns Charest attorneys and staff have spoken
have been anonymized in these records.

1 22. Burns Charest reasonably anticipates expending additional time and incurring additional
2 expenses in the case in the future, including with respect to settlement administration, investigating the
3 claims of the individuals described above that did not appear on the class list provided by Accenture or
4 receive Per Capita Payments, and addressing inquiries from Class Members regarding the settlement
5 and settlement administration. This additional time is not included in this declaration, the attached
6 exhibits, or the Interim Post-Distribution Accounting.

7 I declare under penalty of perjury and the laws of the United States that the foregoing is true
8 and correct, and this declaration is executed in Dallas, Texas on November 30, 2023.

9
10 By: _____



Daniel H. Charest

EXHIBIT 1

Jane Doe, individually and on behalf of all others similarly situated, v. YouTube, Inc.

Litigation Lodestar

Burns Charest LLP

May 1, 2023 through November 28, 2023

Current

Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Total
Attorneys			
Daniel Charest	\$1,050.00	33	\$34,650.00
Patrick Murphree	\$750.00	45	\$33,750.00
Professional Staff			
Julianna Gravois	\$425.00	44	\$18,700.00
TOTAL		119.3	\$87,100.00

EXHIBIT 2

Date	SM/Task	Name	Hrs	Amt	Rate	Narrative
05/01/2023	1141	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Edited KCC Declaration ISO final approval
05/01/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed BC and JLSF re approval of draft of KCC Declaration
05/01/2023	1137	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re updated information for declaration ISO final approval
05/01/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	Review and edit draft final approval papers; cover with trial team re same.
05/01/2023	1141	Gravois, Julianna	0.20	\$65.00	\$425.00	Compiling materials in prep for final approval hearing; emailing with P. Bruns re time and expenses;
05/02/2023	1141	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Reviewed itemized time report for submission in advance of final approval hearing
05/03/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re data items needed for completing declarations ISO mtn for final approval
05/03/2023	1141	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Prepared and edited materials needed as exhibits and support for D Charest declaration ISO mtn for final approval
05/03/2023	1141	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed draft of materials ISO D Charest declaration ISO mtn for preliminary approval
05/03/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with D Charest re final draft of declaration ISO final approval
05/03/2023	1141	Gravois, Julianna	1.80	\$585.00	\$425.00	Working/drafting on time report, cost report, and related tables for final approval; emailing with P. Murphree re same;
05/04/2023	1141	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Edited draft of KCC declaration ISO final approval and emailed KCC re same
05/04/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Prepared materials for meeting with KCC re planning for activities following final approval
05/04/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.20	\$65.00	\$425.00	Pulling KCC's proposal for settlement notice and emailing with P. Murphree re same;
05/05/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.40	\$300.00	\$750.00	Had meeting with BC, JLSF and KCC re planning for post final approval
05/05/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Drafted email to KCC and JLSF summarizing meeting
05/05/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.70	\$735.00	\$1,050.00	Prepare for hearing on motion for final approval; corner with administrator re preparatory issues and next steps; revise and edit supplemental filings for approval.
05/05/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.60	\$195.00	\$425.00	Call with D. Charest, S. Williams, P. Murphree, and KCC administrator re settlement notice; discussing with P. Murphree and emailing him with set deadlines;
05/08/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed and messaged with D Charest re signature on declaration ISO final approval
05/08/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re declaration ISO final approval
05/08/2023	1141	Gravois, Julianna	0.30	\$97.50	\$425.00	Finalizing D. Charest's declaration and exhibits; emailing with team re same;
05/09/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed final draft of KCC declaration
05/09/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re final draft of KCC declaration and updates to website
05/09/2023	1141	Gravois, Julianna	0.20	\$65.00	\$425.00	Reviewing and circulating plaintiffs' administrative motion to file declaration of J. Doe under seal;
05/10/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	Prepare for hearing on final approval; review file materials; confer with trial team re final approval issues and next steps.
05/10/2023	1137	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with S Williams re declarations
05/10/2023	1137	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Had call with S Williams re declarations ISO the final approval
05/11/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	4.50	\$4,725.00	\$1,050.00	Travel from Dallas to San Francisco; prepare for hearing on final approval; review file materials; confer with trial team re hearing preparations and related issues.
05/11/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed sample website for navigability
05/11/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re status of website for class members

05/11/2023	1141	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed filing by JLSF of declarations
05/11/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Had call with S Williams re prep for hearing
05/11/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re posting materials to class website Reviewing and circulating supplemental declaration of S. Williams and exhibits and the supplemental declaration of D. Charest and exhibits; compiling for D. Charest in prep for hearing; doing same for
05/11/2023	1141	Gravois, Julianna	0.30	\$97.50	\$425.00	KCC for posting on website; Travel from San Francisco to Oakland; confer with trial team re final approval hearing and related issues; attend final approval hearing; confer with trial team rehearing results and next steps; travel from Oakland to Dallas.
05/12/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	10.50	\$11,025.00	\$1,050.00	
05/13/2023	1137	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re result of final approval hearing
05/15/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re court order re final approval
05/15/2023	1141	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Reviewed court order granting final approval Reviewing and circulating minute order granting final approval and motions for attorneys fees; drafting transcript order form and emailing with JSLF re same;
05/15/2023	1141	Gravois, Julianna	0.40	\$130.00	\$425.00	
05/16/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Calculated new deadlines for YT settlement process Emailed with KCC re notice going to class members re final approval and updates to addresses or payment info
05/16/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re notices to go to class members
05/17/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re notices going out to class
05/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re approval of notices to class members
05/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re notices to be sent to class
05/22/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed ND Cal post-distribution accounting procedures Prepared draft of post-settlement accounting procedures document
05/22/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	
05/23/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed revised drafts of notices re final approval
05/24/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re notices
05/24/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Had call with KCC re settlement notices Emailed with BC and JLSF re settlement website issues and call from KCC
05/24/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re settlement costs and tracking data for required accounting to ND Cal
05/25/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed and messaged with BC and JLSF re response to class members calling with questions
05/25/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	
06/06/2023	1141	Gravois, Julianna	0.20	\$65.00	\$425.00	Emailing with R. Vazquez-Ponce re hearing transcript;
06/07/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re number of class members reaching out
06/12/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re notices following bouncebacks
06/14/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed KCC with notices following bouncebacks
06/14/2023	1137	Gravois, Julianna	0.20	\$65.00	\$425.00	Emailing with ██████████ re questions re settlement and case; Emailed internally re questions from Scola class member re membership in YT class
06/15/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Call with ██████████ re questions about settlement; emailing with team to memorialize same;
06/15/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.60	\$195.00	\$425.00	
06/20/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.30	\$97.50	\$425.00	Emailing with R. Ponce re transcript from final approval hearing;

06/21/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC re outreach from class member who did not receive notice
06/21/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.60	\$195.00	\$425.00	Emailing with R. Ponce re transcript from final approval hearing; call with ██████ re class member status and details and emailing with team and administrator re same;
06/22/2023	1141	Gravois, Julianna	0.20	\$65.00	\$425.00	Reviewing and circulating transcript from final approval hearing;
06/22/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.50	\$162.50	\$425.00	Call with ██████ and emailing with team re same;
06/22/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.70	\$735.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re YouTube employee and exclusion from class; coordinate underlying investigation; confer with leadership re same; review file materials.
06/23/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed contracts provided by potential class member who did not receive notice
06/23/2023	1137	Gravois, Julianna	0.70	\$227.50	\$425.00	Calls and emailing with ██████ re class settlement; emailing with S. Williams re same; emailing with team re ██████ contract with Accenture;
06/24/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re reaching out to YT re new class members
06/24/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed and messaged with BC and JLSF re class member outreach
06/24/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.70	\$735.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with leadership re potential excluded class member; confer with trial team re same; confer with YouTube counsel re same.
06/26/2023	1140	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Researched class membership of potential member based on additional facts provided by potential member
06/26/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re class membership of potential class member that reached out to us
06/27/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.30	\$97.50	\$425.00	Scheduling call with ██████, S. Williams and D. Charest; emailing and call with ██████
06/28/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re closing down payment selection portal
06/28/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.30	\$97.50	\$425.00	Emailing and calls with ██████; discussing with D. Charest; emailing with L. Tyler and M. Kweik re scheduling call; call with ██████; calendaring S. Williams and D. Charest call with ██████ and emailing re same;
07/11/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.40	\$130.00	\$425.00	
07/14/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Reviewed material re dates of payouts for settlement fund
07/14/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re payout of settlement agreement
07/14/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with leadership re excluded content reviewer and related issues; review file materials; confer with leadership re fee issues and application timing.
07/17/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re payment of settlement funds
07/17/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams and D Charest re settlement payout issues with KCC
07/17/2023	1140	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Researched re treatment of tax issues in settlement agreement
07/17/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re setting call
07/17/2023	1137	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF re contact from class member
07/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re call re YT settlement
07/18/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Had call with S Williams re meeting with KCC
07/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Edited check letter for KCC
07/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re settlement check letter
07/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Had call with D Charest re meeting with KCC and outreach to YT re settlement agreement
07/18/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.60	\$450.00	\$750.00	Sent emails, researched deadlines for funding settlement and paying class, and prepared for KCC call re same
07/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams re funding date for YT

07/18/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with D Charest and S Williams re deadlines and communication thereof to KCC
07/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Had call with KCC re settlement distribution
07/18/2023	1137	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with opposing counsel re final judgment
07/18/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re KCC positions on making payouts
07/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Had call with M Murray at KCC re settlement distribution
07/18/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re need for call with KCC higher ups
07/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Had call and the zoom with S Williams re KCC settlement issues
07/18/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams and D Charest re availability for call with KCC
07/18/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and KCC re scheduling call
07/18/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.60	\$630.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re settlement funding issues; coordinate administration of class funding; confer with trial team re same. Emailing with P. Murphree re deadlines for settlement administrator to pay class members; call with class member
07/18/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.70	\$227.50	\$425.00	(b) re payment and other questions;
07/19/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Participated in call with KCC re payment to class members
07/19/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Researched re reporting requirements for settlement administrators
07/19/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Had call with S Williams re approach to KCC
07/19/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Edited language for website and in FAQ for call center re timing of distribution
07/19/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re language for FAQ and website and request for meeting
07/19/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re setting meeting with KCC
07/19/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re issues re KCC and settlement payouts
07/19/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re arranging call
07/19/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.70	\$227.50	\$425.00	Attending call with KCC, S. Williams, and P. Murphree re distribution issues; reviewing IRS website re taxing settlement proceeds;
07/20/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Met with KCC re settlement payouts
07/20/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams re class member contact info
07/20/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.40	\$300.00	\$750.00	Reviewed class contact info counts for YT class
07/20/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re class member electronic payment selection
07/20/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re settlement distribution issues
07/21/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re settlement payments and KCC position
07/21/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re position of settlement payments
07/21/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re status of KCC distribution of class funds
07/26/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Participated in call with KCC and JLSF re disbursing settlement
07/26/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Had call with S Williams re class settlement distribution
07/26/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re next steps for distribution

07/26/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re payments to class
07/28/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re YT payment of settlement fund
08/02/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re problems with YT returned funds and wire instructions
08/03/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re approval of distribution amounts
08/04/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Reviewed dispersal calculation
08/04/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re dispersal calculation
08/04/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Reviewed computation of disbursement to identify source of discrepancies
08/04/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed JLSF and KCC re amounts of settlement disbursement
08/07/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re settlement disbursement
08/08/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed KCC estimate of final costs
08/08/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re estimate of final costs
08/08/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with D Charest and S Williams re final approval of settlement amounts with KCC
08/08/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re status of settlement payouts
08/10/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC and messaged with D Charest re timing of YT payment
08/10/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed email from KCC re issues with class members preventing distribution
08/10/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re 11th hour issues with class members preventing distribution
08/11/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.40	\$300.00	\$750.00	Reviewed questions from KCC re distribution, D Charest comments, and analyzed same
08/11/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re action items needed to finalize distribution
08/11/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Emailed and messaged with BC, JLSF, and KCC re settlement payments
08/11/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re class members
08/11/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re settlement payments to members
08/11/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	Computed funds for each firm, resolved discrepancies, and emailed with BC and JLSF and KCC re same
08/11/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Emailed and messaged with KCC and D Charest re classmembers asking for payment to same paypal handle
08/11/2023	1142	Gravois, Julianna	0.80	\$260.00	\$425.00	Researching class members and emailing with team re same; emailing with accounting and KCC re wiring instructions;
08/11/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re distribution calculations and related issues; review file materials.
08/12/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with D Charest re KCC response to problems with settlement administration process
08/14/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Had call with class members re PayPal payment
08/14/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re class members' PayPal payments
08/14/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.70	\$227.50	\$425.00	Emailing with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re setting up call to confirm distributions; discussing same with P. Murphree; attend call;
08/15/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and KCC re payment for class members
08/16/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Cross checked distribution plan for class members
08/16/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Confirmed settlement payments amounts for class members

08/16/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with D Charest and JLSF re approval for giving KCC greenlight on distribution
08/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re timing of distribution
08/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re attorney fee and cost payments
08/18/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.40	\$300.00	\$750.00	Reran calculations for division of fees and costs and emailed KCC re same
08/24/2023	1137	Gravois, Julianna	0.90	\$292.50	\$425.00	Reviewing email from ██████████ re distribution amounts and emailing with the team re same; reviewing correspondence with KCC re amounts for distribution; call with ██████████ and ██████████ emailing with team re same;
08/24/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re distribution questions and class member inquiries; review file materials.
08/28/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re class payments
08/28/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re class members question re mailing of checks
08/28/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.50	\$162.50	\$425.00	Call with ██████████ regarding payment; emailing with team re same; call with ██████████ re same;
08/30/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re report on failed electronic funds transfers
09/07/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams re person claiming to be content moderator but not in class
09/08/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Had call with S Williams re person claiming to be class member
09/08/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.50	\$162.50	\$425.00	Emailing with L. Tyler and K. Barron to coordinate call with ██████████; emailing with ██████████ re call next week; emailing with team re same;
09/08/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Coordinated call with content mod claiming to be class member
09/08/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re potential class members and status within the case; review file materials; coordinate investigation into excluded class members.
09/13/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with D Charest re class definition question
09/13/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	1.60	\$520.00	\$425.00	Calling ██████████; updating calendar re today's call; attend call with JSLF and ██████████ re class issue; discussing with D. Charest; call with ██████████ re class issue and setting up call with D. Charest;
09/13/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.50	\$375.00	\$750.00	Participated in call with excluded class member
09/13/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	2.00	\$2,100.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re potential class member and class definition; review file materials; confer with potential class member re factual background and work conditions.
09/15/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.90	\$292.50	\$425.00	Call with ██████████; emailing with ██████████; emailing with team re ██████████;
09/18/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	1.20	\$390.00	\$425.00	Preparing list/contact sheet of CMs that have not made the list of class members; emailing with ██████████, ██████████, and ██████████; emailing update to team;
09/19/2023	1140	Gravois, Julianna	2.70	\$877.50	\$425.00	Call with ██████████; emailing with ██████████, emailing with ██████████; emailing with ██████████; updating list of CMs left out of settlement; discussing case with L. Medrano; emailing team updated list of CMs; meeting with L. Medrano; emailing with ██████████; emailing with ██████████; discussing spreadsheet with D. Charest;
09/19/2023	1140	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Researched re Google v YouTube Trust and Safety
09/19/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	2.10	\$2,205.00	\$1,050.00	Prepare for call with class member; review file materials; confer with class member re work experience and background facts; confer with trial team re class scope, next steps, and related issues.

09/20/2023	1137	Gravois, Julianna	1.10	\$357.50	\$425.00	Emailing with ██████████; updating spreadsheet with contractor column per P. Murphree; updating spreadsheet with list of teams from ██████████, ██████████, and ██████████; updating spreadsheet with CMs from ██████████ list; creating list of teams/projects; call with ██████████;
09/20/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re class member not receiving a check
09/22/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed re class member with new address for check
09/22/2023	1137	Gravois, Julianna	1.20	\$390.00	\$425.00	Emailing with ██████████ re settlement class and updating spreadsheet; calls with ██████████ regarding settlement;
09/22/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with class administrator re class member payment issue and follow-up; confer with trial team re same; review file materials.
09/25/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re email from alleged class member
09/25/2023	1137	Gravois, Julianna	1.40	\$455.00	\$425.00	Emailing with D. Charest re ██████████ email; emailing with ██████████; updating spreadsheet with list from ██████████; emailing with L. Medrano re next steps; emailing with ██████████; call with ██████████ and updating spreadsheet;
09/25/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re potentially excluded class member and research tasks; review file materials.
09/26/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.50	\$162.50	\$425.00	Call with ██████████; discussing with P. Murphree; emailing with KCC;
09/27/2023	1137	Gravois, Julianna	0.70	\$227.50	\$425.00	Emailing with M. Murray re ██████████; emailing with ██████████ re settlement; emailing with ██████████ re settlement;
09/27/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.70	\$735.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re omitted class members and factual research; confer with trial team re strategy to include omitted class members; review file materials.
10/02/2023	1137	Gravois, Julianna	0.40	\$130.00	\$425.00	Emailing with M. Murray; emailing with ██████████ re update;
10/04/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with BC re list of class members and their issues
10/05/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed content moderator spreadsheet of individuals who did not receive payments
10/05/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re potential outreach to YT re missing class members
10/05/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.30	\$97.50	\$425.00	Reviewing updated spreadsheet and circulating to team with notes; discussing with P. Murphree;
10/08/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re approach to YT and Accenture re missing class members
10/13/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.60	\$630.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with leadership re excluded CMs and next steps; corner with trial team re same; confer with Accenture counsel and YouTube counsel re excluded CMs and related issues.
10/13/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.70	\$227.50	\$425.00	Discussing status of CMs contacted re settlement with D. Charest; emailing with Accenture and YouTube with list of names; emailing with S. Williams re info on CM handled by JSLF;
10/15/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re compliance deadline for post-distribution accounting
10/16/2023	1135	Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with leadership re CM contact and inclusion in class; corner with trial team re CM tracking and related issues.
10/16/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with class member re settlement website
10/16/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.20	\$65.00	\$425.00	Updating CM spreadsheet;
10/18/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.30	\$97.50	\$425.00	Emailing with ██████████ regarding settlement;
10/20/2023	1137	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with Accenture counsel re unpaid class members
10/20/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re unpaid class members
10/22/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re outreach to class members that did not receive checks but were on class list
10/23/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re class members not receiving checks

10/23/2023	1137	Gravois, Julianna	0.70	\$227.50	\$425.00	Emailing with [REDACTED]; emailing with [REDACTED], [REDACTED], and [REDACTED] regarding settlement; emailing with P. Murphree re same; updating spreadsheet;
10/24/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re class members missing payments
10/24/2023	1137	Gravois, Julianna	0.40	\$130.00	\$425.00	Emailing with [REDACTED] regarding settlement; emailing with KCC re class members missing checks;
10/27/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.70	\$227.50	\$425.00	Call with [REDACTED] regarding settlement; emailing with M. Murray and KCC re same;
10/31/2023	1135	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC team re letter from Accenture re missing class members
10/31/2023	1142	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re 3 class members were incorrect addresses
10/31/2023	1135	Gravois, Julianna	0.50	\$162.50	\$425.00	Emailing with [REDACTED] regarding settlement; emailing with M. Murray and KCC re same; emailing with [REDACTED]
11/01/2023		Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	regarding settlement; Confer with trial team re additional CMs and next steps; confer with YouTube counsel re same.
11/01/2023		Gravois, Julianna	1.40	\$455.00	\$425.00	Emailing with [REDACTED] re settlement; auditing our spreadsheet and comparing with Accenture's spreadsheet; emailing with team with questions and comments;
11/01/2023		Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed emails to Accenture outside counsel and YT counsel
11/02/2023		Gravois, Julianna	0.70	\$227.50	\$425.00	Reviewing spreadsheet and discussing with L. Medrano; discussing path forward with D. Charest; call (vm) with [REDACTED];
11/03/2023		Gravois, Julianna	0.20	\$65.00	\$425.00	Call with [REDACTED] (vm) and emailing re same; discussing status with D. Charest;
11/06/2023		Charest, Daniel	0.90	\$945.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re case schedule and relate issues; confer with trial team re omitted CMs and next steps.
11/06/2023		Gravois, Julianna	0.90	\$292.50	\$425.00	Emailing with [REDACTED] re settlement issues and information; updating the spreadsheet; discussing categories of content moderators with D. Charest; preparing list of content moderators with additional information for D. Charest to send Accenture; discussing with D. Charest and P. Murphree; emailing P. Murphree
11/06/2023		Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	operating spreadsheet; Messaged with D Charest re current status of issues surrounding absent class members
11/06/2023		Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams re status of class members not receiving payment as well as accounting due to court
11/07/2023		Charest, Daniel	1.20	\$1,260.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with Accenture counsel re CM status and research; confer with trial team re Accenture response and next steps; review file materials.
11/07/2023		Gravois, Julianna	1.20	\$390.00	\$425.00	Reviewing email from Accenture and updating spreadsheet; discussing with D. Charest; circulating to team; emailing with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] and updating spreadsheet; emailing with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] and updating spreadsheet; call with S. Williams, P. Murphree, and A. Bonillia; posting settlement agreement;
11/07/2023		Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Reviewed email from Accenture counsel and compared to list of potential CMs who have contacted us
11/07/2023		Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re email from Accenture
11/07/2023		Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with D Charest and S Williams re call to discuss Accenture issues
11/07/2023		Murphree, Patrick	0.40	\$300.00	\$750.00	Participated in call with BC and JLSF re approach to Accenture
11/07/2023		Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Participated in call with BC, JLSF, and YT counsel re issues with Accenture
11/07/2023		Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re contact by anyone claiming to be a class member
11/08/2023		Gravois, Julianna	1.10	\$357.50	\$425.00	Updating spreadsheet; emailing with [REDACTED]; updating spreadsheet with A. Bonillia's JSLF additions; circulating to team; attending call with M. Bopp, Z. Briers, L. Plack, and P. Murphree; discussing same with team;
11/08/2023		Murphree, Patrick	0.40	\$300.00	\$750.00	Had call with YT and Accenture counsel re class members inadvertently excluded

11/08/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re report of meeting with YT and Accenture counsel
11/08/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re contacts from potential class members
11/09/2023	Gravois, Julianna	0.70	\$227.50	\$425.00	Call with P. Murphree; updating spreadsheet; emailing with team with updated table of CMs Accenture needed more info for;
11/09/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re contact from individuals claiming to be CMs but not on class list
11/09/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Had call with J Gravois re info for potential class members that have contacted us re missing payment and assembling timeline of interactions with opposing counsel and others since final approval
11/09/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with D Charest and S Williams re follow up with Accenture Confer with trial team re potential additional CMs; review file material; confer with trial team re litigation strategy and task assignments.
11/10/2023	Charest, Daniel	0.60	\$630.00	\$1,050.00	Emailed with KCC re individuals who have contacted KCC but were not on class list
11/10/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with Accenture counsel re additional info re content moderators and Accenture plan for ensuring accuracy of class list
11/10/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re contacting Accenture counsel
11/13/2023	Gravois, Julianna	0.90	\$292.50	\$425.00	Updating spreadsheet; discussing with P. Murphree and D. Charest; emailing with [REDACTED]; call with [REDACTED] regarding update;
11/13/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re outreach to YT counsel re Accenture
11/13/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with YT counsel re Accenture compliance with need to confirm class members
11/13/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re contact with individuals asking why they were not members of class
11/14/2023	Gravois, Julianna	1.60	\$520.00	\$425.00	Preparing timeline of events from final approval order to the present; emailing with P. Murphree re same;
11/14/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re contact with Accenture
11/14/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re spreadsheet of out-of-class individuals contacting KCC
11/14/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re KCC list of out-of-class individuals that have contacted KCC
11/15/2023	Gravois, Julianna	1.20	\$390.00	\$425.00	Reviewing KCC's spreadsheet with names of people who contacted them about being left out of the settlement; conducting analysis and comparing to BC's spreadsheet; updating BC's spreadsheet; emailing with P. Murphree; discussing with team; discussing with P. Murphree;
11/15/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re individuals that have contacted them that were not on the class list
11/15/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Reviewed additional names provided by KCC re potential class members
11/15/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with Accenture counsel re additional names of potential class members
11/15/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.90	\$675.00	\$750.00	Drafted post-distribution accounting
11/16/2023	Gravois, Julianna	1.10	\$357.50	\$425.00	Updating spreadsheet and circulating to team; discussing plan with P. Murphree; emailing with 46 content moderators; call with [REDACTED]; emailing with [REDACTED]; updating spreadsheet; emailing spreadsheet to JLSF;
11/16/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re Accenture request for additional information
11/16/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Had call with S Williams re next steps in resolving issue of identifying all class members left off Accenture's list
11/16/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Coordinated with BC staff re outreach to individuals claiming to be class members
11/16/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re plan for accounting and for outreach to individuals claiming to be class members

11/16/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re call to discuss final accounting
11/16/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with Accenture counsel re its request for Accenture Enterprise ID numbers
11/17/2023	Gravois, Julianna	1.80	\$585.00	\$425.00	Reviewing emails and updating spreadsheet; calls with content moderators;
11/17/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re questions from potential class members
11/17/2023	Murphree, Patrick	2.00	\$1,500.00	\$750.00	Drafted preliminary final accounting and motion for extension
11/17/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Had call with KCC re info needed for final accounting
11/17/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re questions needing answering for final accounting
11/17/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with D Charest re new information from Accenture re employee IDs
11/17/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with Accenture counsel re new information received re employee IDs
11/17/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams re motion to court seeking extension of time for post-distribution accounting
11/17/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Edited motion for extension on final accounting
11/17/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re motion for extension of time and interim accounting
11/20/2023	Charest, Daniel	1.10	\$1,155.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with team re recent development, Accenture responses, and next steps; review draft filing; confer with trial team re same.
11/20/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Messaged with S Williams re call to discuss filing with court
11/20/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Had call with S Williams re motion to court for extension
11/20/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Edited motion for extension
11/20/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re motion for extension of deadline to file post-distribution accounting
11/20/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC re additional info from potential class members to share with Accenture
11/20/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with Accenture counsel re additional info re potential class members
11/20/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Edited motion for extension
11/20/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed BC and JLSF re motion for extension
11/21/2023	Charest, Daniel	0.50	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re draft motion to extend reporting deadline and related issues; review draft motion.
11/21/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with YT counsel re Accenture's lack of cooperation
11/21/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re motion for extension
11/21/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Had call with S Williams re motion for extension
11/21/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.50	\$375.00	\$750.00	Edited motion re extension of deadline for accounting
11/21/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Proofed motion for extension
11/21/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed and messaged with D Charest re conferring with YT counsel before filing motion
11/21/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with YT counsel re filing motion for extension
11/21/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re info needed for declaration
11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re information for accounting
11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Prepared guidance for KCC for drafting declaration ISO accounting

11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re declaration ISO accounting
11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re response to Accenture counsel
11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	2.10	\$1,575.00	\$750.00	Redrafted interim post-distribution accounting and associated supporting materials
11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re declaration ISO motion for extension
11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.50	\$375.00	\$750.00	Prepared draft declaration ISO mtn for extension
11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with Accenture counsel re number of potential additional class members
11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with co-counsel re timing of filing motion for extension
11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re obtaining declaration ISO accounting
11/22/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re declaration ISO accounting
11/24/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	REviewed draft of declaration from KCC
11/24/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re draft of declaration
11/24/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.40	\$300.00	\$750.00	Edited motion for extension and S Williams decl in support
11/24/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with JLSF and BC re motion for extension and declaration of S Williams in support
11/25/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Message with BC re materials needed for filing interim accounting
11/25/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams re filing motion for extension
11/25/2023	Murphree, Patrick	4.70	\$3,525.00	\$750.00	Prepared draft materials for interim accounting
11/25/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Drafted email to BC and JLSF re status of mtn for extension and interim accounting
11/26/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re declaration
11/26/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams re motion for extension
11/26/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Edited order for motion for extension
11/26/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams re filing of motion for extension and notice to court
11/27/2023	Charest, Daniel	0.60	\$630.00	\$1,050.00	Confer with trial team re motion to extend reporting deadline and related issues; confer with opposing counsel re same; attend clerk call re same.
11/27/2023	Gravois, Julianna	2.60	\$845.00	\$425.00	Coordinating call with S. Williams, D. Charest, P. Murphree, and Z. Briers with the clerk and discussing with P. Murphree; reviewing and saving plaintiffs' notice re interim post-distributing and motion for extension of time, S. Williams' declaration, and proposed order; emailing with content moderators omitted from settlement and updating spreadsheet; circulating spreadsheet to team; call with P. Murphree; updating spreadsheet; sending P. Murphree list of names without info on file; emailing with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re checks; reviewing and circulating order on the motion for extension of time and updating calendar;
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with S Williams and YT counsel re call to calendar clerk re motion for extension
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Message with D Charest re call with docket clerk re mtn for extension
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Had call with opposing counsel and docket clerk re timing of ruling on motion for extension
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Reviewed current status of potential class members contacts
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Met with J Gravois re planning for assembling materials for interim accounting

11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.50	\$375.00	\$750.00	Edited interim accounting and D Charest declaration ISO same
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Drafted email updating JLSF and BC re status of interim accounting.
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Edited KCC declaration ISO motion in support of interim accounting
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re declaration ISO interim accounting
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with J Gravois re potential class members without additional info
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.20	\$150.00	\$750.00	Edited KCC declaration ISO interim accounting
11/27/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with KCC re declaration ISO interim accounting
11/28/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.30	\$225.00	\$750.00	Edited interim accounting and D Charest declaration ISO
11/28/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with BC and JLSF re interim accounting documents
11/28/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with Accenture counsel re updated content moderator potential class member info
11/28/2023	Murphree, Patrick	0.10	\$75.00	\$750.00	Emailed with Accounting re time and expense records