

# **EXHIBIT 2**

**Joseph Saveri Law Firm, LLP**

601 California Street  
Suite 1000  
San Francisco, CA 94108

Telephone: 415-500-6800

Jane Doe  
Travis County, TX

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
Invoice No. 129  
Account No. 1086.01  
Page: 1

RE: YouTube

**Interim Statement****For Services Rendered from Through .**

					Hours	
05/26/2020	KQ	L190	A106	Communicate (with potential client) re Youtube class action.	3.20	1,360.00
	SW	L190	A106	Communicate (with potential client) re Youtube class action.	3.00	3,450.00
05/27/2020	KQ	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Kate Malone re Google/Youtube case	0.40	170.00
	KQ	L190	A102	Research youtube content moderators	0.20	85.00
	KM	L110	A104	Analyze client intake call notes, news articles, and relevant legal issues	4.10	2,562.50
	SW	L110	A104	Review/analyze client intake call notes, news articles, and relevant legal issues.	4.00	4,600.00
06/01/2020	KM	L210	A104	Analyze draft complaint and suggest revisions	1.40	875.00
	SW	L210	A104	Annalyze draft complaint and suggest revisions	1.00	1,150.00
06/04/2020	KQ	L190	A106	GOOGLE/YOUTUBE: Communicate (with client) re representation and complaint	0.80	340.00
06/08/2020	KQ	L210	A103	GOOGLE/YOUTUBE: Draft/revise complaint	0.70	297.50
06/17/2020	KQ	L210	A106	YouTube: Communicate (with client) re complaint	1.00	425.00
	KQ	L210	A103	YouTube: revise complaint	0.10	42.50
	SW	L210	A104	Revise complaint	1.00	1,150.00
07/09/2020	KQ	L210	A102	Research extraterritoriality of CA law for youtube complaint	0.30	127.50
07/10/2020	KQ	L210	A106	YOUTUBE: Communicate Potential Client re representation in YouTube matter		
	SW	L210	A104	Legal research re workers wage exemption	3.00	3,450.00
07/14/2020	KQ	L110	A106	Google/Youtube: Communicate with potential client re being a named plaintiff	0.50	212.50
07/15/2020	KQ	L190	A106	YOUTUBE/GOOGLE: Communicate with client [REDACTED] re potential case against YouTube/Google	0.20	85.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 2

					Hours	
07/18/2020	KQ	L110	A103	GOOGLE/YOUTUBE: Review, analysis and revisions to memo from Bram re DOE plaintiff	0.70	297.50
07/20/2020	KQ	L210	A103	GOOGLE/YOUTUBE: Review, analysis and revisions to memo from Bram re DOE plaintiff	0.50	212.50
07/27/2020	KQ	L210	A106	YOUTUBE: Communicate with client re fact investigation for complaint	1.70	722.50
07/28/2020	KQ	L210	A103	YouTube: Revise complaint to include information from client	1.70	722.50
07/29/2020	KQ	L210	A103	YOUTUBE: revise complaint	4.30	1,827.50
08/05/2020	KQ	L210	A103	YouTube: revise complaint	1.50	637.50
	SW	L210	A104	Review, analysis and revisions to complaint	2.00	2,300.00
08/06/2020	KQ	L110	A106	YOUTUBE: Communicate with client client re fact investigation	1.00	425.00
08/19/2020	KQ	L210	A103	YOUTUBE: continue drafting memo re potential claim for strict liability for ultrahazardous activity for youtube complaint	2.00	850.00
08/25/2020	KQ	L210	A103	YOUTUBE: Draft memo re filing complaint in San Mateo County Superior Court	1.70	722.50
	SW	L210	A104	Review and analysis of memo re venue	1.00	1,150.00
08/26/2020	KQ	L210	A103	YOUTUBE: revise complaint	3.10	1,317.50
	KQ	L210	A102	YOUTUBE: Research secondary trauma	0.40	170.00
	KQ	L210	A103	YOUTUBE: Draft/revise memo re filing complaints in Superior Court for San Mateo	0.60	255.00
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise formatted YouTube Content Moderator Complaint	1.00	385.00
	SW	L210	A103	Draft/revise Review and analysis of draft complaint.	1.00	1,150.00
08/27/2020	KQ	L110	A104	YOUTUBE: reviewed client docs	0.30	127.50
09/02/2020	RP	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation saved YouTube Content Moderator Complaint drafts	0.30	115.50
09/03/2020	HH	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation ECFs	0.35	96.25
09/15/2020	HH	L210	A103	Draft/revise initial documents	1.50	412.50
09/16/2020	HH	L210	A103	Make edits to initial documents	0.85	233.75
09/17/2020	KQ	L210	A103	Revise complaint	1.00	425.00
	KQ	L210	A106	Communicate with client [REDACTED], mother, and Katharine Malone re filing complaint	0.80	340.00
	KQ	L210	A103	Revise civil cover sheet, complex case designation form, and summons and returned to Heaven with edits	0.70	297.50
	HH	L210	A103	Draft/revise initial judicial counsel forms to be filed in San Mateo Superior	3.75	1,031.25

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 3

					Hours	
	SW	L210	A103	Draft/revise Review and analysis of draft complaint.	1.50	1,725.00
09/18/2020	KQ	L210	A103	Revise complaint	1.80	765.00
	HH	L210	A103	Review, proofread, format complaint	1.55	426.25
	HH	L210	A101	File initial documents with OneLegal	1.60	440.00
	HH	L210	A101	Get sign off on all complaint and judicial forms	1.90	522.50
09/21/2020	HH	L210	A101	Refile initial documents/complaint	0.50	137.50
09/22/2020	KM	L120	A106	Communicate (with client) re media strategy and training	1.00	625.00
09/23/2020	KQ	L190	A106	Communicate with client [REDACTED] re potential upcoming press coverage	0.60	255.00
	KM	L200	A102	Research most effective service method and confer re same	0.04	25.00
09/29/2020	HH	L190	A103	Draft a weekly call agenda using a template and dates in CMO 1	1.00	275.00
	KQ	L190	A103	Draft/revise agenda for weekly call tomorrow	0.30	127.50
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Attend to strategy re notice of assignment and discovery	0.60	375.00
09/30/2020	KQ	L190	A103	Revise agenda for weekly call	0.50	212.50
	HH	L190	A109	Internal weekly call	0.60	165.00
	SW	L190	A109	Appear for/attend Internal Weekly Call	0.60	690.00
	SW	L200	A104	Review/analyze Draft requests for production.	1.00	1,150.00
10/07/2020	HH	L210	A102	Research procedure on filing PHV	0.55	151.25
	HH	L210	A104	Prepare proof of service to file	0.15	41.25
	HH	L210	A103	Edit PHV applications, declaration, and proposed order for co-counsel	2.25	618.75
	KQ	L310	A103	Draft RFPS	1.50	637.50
	KQ	L250	A103	Revise BC Pro Hac Vice motion	0.60	255.00
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze draft requests for production	0.90	562.50
10/08/2020	KQ	L310	A103	Draft form ROGs		
	KM	L200	A108	Communicate (other external) with A. Bast (CBS News) re client interview	0.50	312.50
10/09/2020	KM	L200	A108	Communicate (other external) with A. Bast (CBS News) with client re complaint and claims	1.50	937.50
10/20/2020	KM	L190	A108	Communicate (other external) with A. Bast re complaint and third party non-disclosure agreements	0.50	312.50
	KM	L190	A104	Review/analyze email correspondence with K. Quackenbush re third party non-disclosure agreements	0.80	500.00
	KM	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams re case status	0.40	250.00
	SW	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) regarding case status with K. Malone.	0.40	460.00
10/21/2020	KM	L190	A108	Communicate (other external) with A. Bast re complaint and scheduling interview with other former moderators	0.80	500.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023

Invoice No. 129

Page No. 4

					Hours	
10/23/2020	KM	L190	A108	Communicate (other external) with A. Bast re complaint and scheduling interview with S. Williams	0.70	437.50
10/24/2020	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise email correspondence re notice of removal	0.40	250.00
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze notice of removal and email correspondence related thereto	1.00	625.00
10/26/2020	HH	L210	A103	Draft/revise proof of service for PHV applications	0.60	165.00
10/27/2020	HH	L210	A103	Make edits to PHV applications and related documents	4.00	1,100.00
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise correspondence re case deadlines and initial case forms	0.60	375.00
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze correspondence re case deadlines and initial case forms	0.30	187.50
10/28/2020	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze correspondence re case deadlines and initial case forms	0.60	375.00
	KM	L190	A108	Communicate (other external) with A. Bast (CBS News) re complaint with S. Williams	1.20	750.00
10/29/2020	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze scheduling stipulation and correspondence with Z. Briers and G. Stone	0.40	250.00
	SW	L200	A104	Review/analyze scheduling stipulation and correspondence with Z. Briers and G. Stone.	0.50	575.00
10/30/2020	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze stipulation re scheduling and related correspondence from opposing counsel	0.70	437.50
11/03/2020	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze order re reassignment	0.20	125.00
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze email correspondence re outreach of additional youtube content moderator	0.40	250.00
	SW	L210	A104	Review and analysis, and discussion w/potential client	2.00	2,300.00
11/04/2020	HH	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation ECFs	0.65	178.75
	HH	L190	A110	Send calendar dates to Jenel	0.20	55.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with K. Rayhill re experts	0.30	187.50
11/05/2020	HH	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation ECFs	0.30	82.50
11/06/2020	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise email correspondence to S. Norman case	0.30	187.50
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise email correspondence to P. Watson case	0.30	187.50
11/09/2020	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze email correspondence with G. Stone and S. Williams	0.10	62.50
	SW	L200	A104	Review/analyze email correspondence with G. Stone.	0.10	115.00
11/10/2020	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze case reassignment order	0.60	375.00
	KM	L200	A102	Research opinions of judge re published opinions on similar matters	1.10	687.50
	KM	L200	A108	Communicate (other external) with S. Norman re case engagement	0.90	562.50

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 5

					Hours		
11/11/2020	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze email correspondence with G. Stone and S. Williams	0.40	250.00	
11/12/2020	HH	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation	0.40	110.00	
11/19/2020	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze email correspondence with G. Stone and S. Williams	0.30	187.50	
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze motions for pro hac vice filed by co-counsel	0.40	250.00	
	SW	L200	A104	Correspondence w/defense counsel.	0.50	575.00	
12/02/2020	KQ	L240	A104	Review/analyze YouTube MTD	0.70	297.50	
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze motion to dismiss	1.20	750.00	
	SW	L200	A104	Review/analyze motion to dismiss.	2.00	2,300.00	
12/03/2020	KQ	L240	A102	Research cases cited in YouTube's MTD	0.50	212.50	
	KQ	L240	A105	Communicate (within legal team) write email to Steve Williams, Heaven Haile, Kate Malone re YouTube MTD and assignments	0.40	170.00	
	KAL	L190	A105	On-boarding w/ K. Malone and K. Quackenbush for case	0.90	495.00	
	KAL	L190	A104	Review and Analyze Filings - Complaint, attachments, expert analyses	5.70	3,135.00	
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze motion to dismiss in preparation for drafting response	2.20	1,375.00	
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze email correspondence re motion to dismiss	1.30	812.50	
	SW	L200	A104	Review/analyze Legal research re: motion to dismiss.	1.30	1,495.00	
	12/04/2020	KQ	L250	A103	Draft/revise stipulation re scheduling	1.40	595.00
12/04/2020	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze notice of appearance for K. Levy	0.50	312.50	
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze stipulation re scheduling	0.30	187.50	
	KM	L200	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) with G. Stone and Z. Briers re schedule of responsive briefs	0.40	250.00	
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze email correspondence re motion to dismiss and related filings	2.10	1,312.50	
	SW	L200	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) with G. Stone and Z. Briers re schedule of responsive briefs.	0.40	460.00	
	12/07/2020	HH	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation ECFs	1.40	385.00
	12/07/2020	KQ	L250	A103	Revise stipulation re schedule	0.10	42.50
KM		L200	A103	Draft/revise email correspondence re stipulation	0.80	500.00	
12/09/2020	KM	L120	A104	Review/analyze YouTube's motion to dismiss in preparation for discussion with co-counsel	0.70	437.50	
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise email correspondence re stipulation scheduling with co-counsel, opposing counsel, and internally	1.50	937.50	
	SW	L200	A104	Correspond w/defense counsel re scheduling	0.50	575.00	
12/10/2020	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise email correspondence to Z. Briers and G. Stone re stipulation on motion to dismiss schedule	0.30	187.50	
12/11/2020	KQ	L190	A103	Draft/revise weekly call agenda	0.30	127.50	
	HH	L250	A109	Appear for/attend weekly call.	0.50	137.50	
	HH	L250	A104	Format and edit stipulation and notice of appearance.	0.90	247.50	

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023

Invoice No. 129

Page No. 6

					Hours	
	HH	L140	A101	File ntc of appearance and stipulation.	1.30	357.50
	KAL	L190	A108	Conference call re: case strategy	0.50	275.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) email correspondence with K. Quackenbush and K. Levy re motion to dismiss response	0.40	250.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re scheduling stipulation and notice of appearance	1.60	1,000.00
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise scheduling stipulation and notice of appearance	4.10	2,562.50
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re strategy of motion to dismiss response	1.00	625.00
	KM	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams, K. Quackenbush, K. Levy and K. Rayhill re stipulation, motion to dismiss strategy and related action items	0.60	375.00
	KM	L200	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) email and phone correspondence with Z. Biers re stipulation	0.40	250.00
	SW	L250	A109	Appear for/attend Team meeting, prepare for same. Follow up.	1.50	1,725.00
12/13/2020	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) email correspondence with K. Quackenbush and K. Levy re motion to dismiss response strategy	0.50	312.50
12/14/2020	KQ	L240	A102	Research choice of law	3.30	1,402.50
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) email correspondence with R. Yelton re motion to dismiss response and strategy meeting	1.30	812.50
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze memorandum and materials on California choice of law	1.50	937.50
	SW	L200	A104	Review/analyze memorandum and materials on California choice of law.	0.75	862.50
12/15/2020	KQ	L240	A102	Research California choice of law for opposition to MTD	0.80	340.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) email correspondence re motion to dismiss response	0.20	125.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) email correspondence with R. Yelton re strategy meeting	0.50	312.50
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) email correspondence with K. Quackenbush re strategy meeting	0.30	187.50
12/16/2020	KQ	L240	A102	Research choice of law issue	3.40	1,445.00
	KQ	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) JSLF and BC weekly call. Discussed dispositive motion	1.00	425.00
	KAL	L190	A105	Co-counsel conference call re: case strategy	0.60	330.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with K. Quackenbush and K. Levy re strategy	0.60	375.00
	SW	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Prepare for and call w/co-counsel.	1.00	1,150.00
12/17/2020	KQ	L240	A103	Draft/revise memo re viability choice of law	0.80	340.00
	KAL	L320	A105	Conference call re: Case strategy	1.00	550.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re strategy for opposing motion to dismiss	1.00	625.00
	SW	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team)re motion to dismiss; Telephone call w/K. Levy re case status.	2.00	2,300.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 7

					Hours	
12/18/2020	KQ	L240	A105	Communicate (within legal team) regarding YouTube MTD	0.20	85.00
	KQ	L240	A104	Review/analyze BC Memo re opposition to MTD	0.60	255.00
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze memorandum on status of Doe case	0.70	437.50
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) email correspondence with K. Quackenbush re case status memorandum	0.30	187.50
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze materials related to California choice of law in preparation for drafting opposition	2.10	1,312.50
	SW	L240	A104	Review/analyze Review and analysis of MTD legal issues.	3.00	3,450.00
12/19/2020	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams re case status and strategy	0.50	312.50
	SW	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with K. Malone re case status and strategy.	0.50	575.00
12/21/2020	KQ	L240	A103	Revise memo re choice of law	3.30	1,402.50
	KM	L200	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) email correspondence with Z. Briers re discovery conference deadline	1.10	687.50
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze memorandum discussing plaintiff issues and case evaluation	1.00	625.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) email G. Aulkh re stipulation on case schedule	0.10	62.50
	KM	L200	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) with YouTube counsel team re 26(f) conference	0.10	62.50
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams re client outreach	0.10	62.50
	SW	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) w. K. Malone re client outreach.	0.10	115.00
12/22/2020	KM	L160	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Draft email S. Williams re ADR deadline	0.30	187.50
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) email to K. Quackenbush and K. Levy re memorandum revisions	0.70	437.50
12/23/2020	KQ	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) weekly call	3.80	1,615.00
	HH	L210	A103	Draft/revise shell for our response to Def's MTD	0.25	68.75
	KAL	L100	A103	Conference call with team re: case strategy for MTD	0.50	275.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with R. Yelton re client outreach and strategy for opposition brief	0.40	250.00
	SW	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Conference call w/team re: MTD strategy.	0.40	460.00
12/27/2020	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise outline of opposition brief to YouTube's motion to dismiss	4.20	2,625.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams re client outreach	0.10	62.50
	SW	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with K. Malone re client outreach; legal analysis of choice of law and workers comp issues.	2.10	2,415.00
12/28/2020	HH	L210	A110	Download and save ECfs	0.80	220.00
	KAL	L320	A101	Prepare and research case law for plaintiffs' MTD responses	4.10	2,255.00



Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 8

					Hours	
	KAL	L320	A105	Conferred w/ K. Malone re: MTD response strategy	0.80	440.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams re ADR and initial disclosures	0.60	375.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re opposition briefing outline and case law	1.10	687.50
	SW	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) communicate with K. Malone re AR & initial discovery.	1.00	1,150.00
12/29/2020	KQ	L240	A104	Review/analyze choice of law issues	1.90	807.50
	KAL	L320	A105	Co-counsel conference call re: case strategy	0.50	275.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re opposition briefing outline and case law on UCL claims	1.50	937.50
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze opposition briefing outline and case law on UCL claims	1.60	1,000.00
	SW	L320	A105	Communicate (within legal team) w/co-counsel re MTD.	1.00	1,150.00
12/30/2020	KQ	L240	A103	Draft/revise choice of law section for opposition to MTD	2.30	977.50
	KQ	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Kate Malone, H. Haile, Keydon Levy re opposition to MTD, Rule 26(f) conference and ADR filing	0.30	127.50
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) opposition briefing outline and case law on UCL claims	0.60	375.00
01/03/2021	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams re ADR and initial disclosures	0.10	62.50
	SW	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with K. Malone re ADR and initial disclosures.	0.10	115.00
01/04/2021	HH	L250	A103	Draft/revise ADR Cert.	0.40	154.00
	HH	L250	A102	Research page limit for Opposing counsel to MTD - 15 pages	0.10	38.50
	KQ	L240	A103	Draft/revise opposition to MTD	2.80	1,260.00
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise ADR form filing	0.50	312.50
	KM	L200	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) with YouTube counsel re ADR and initial disclosures	0.80	500.00
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze correspondence with YouTube counsel re ADR and initial disclosures	0.70	437.50
01/05/2021	KQ	L240	A103	Draft/revise choice of law section for opposition to MTD	4.30	1,935.00
	KM	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re early settlement negotiations	0.20	125.00
	SW	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Call re UCL & Equitable Relief Claims (Call w/SNW, Kate M. Dan Charest & Malloru Biblo)	0.50	575.00
	KM	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re equitable relief claims and UCL	0.70	437.50
01/06/2021	KAL	L320	A105	Communicated with K. Malone re: MTD brief outline and draft plan	0.80	500.00
	KAL	L320	A102	Research choice of law re: MTD	3.00	1,875.00
	KAL	L320	A104	Review and revise MTD section regarding choice of law	1.10	687.50
	KM	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re client outreach	0.40	250.00

Jane Doe  
Account No. 1086.01  
RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
Invoice No. 129  
Page No. 9

					Hours	
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re briefing on opposition to motion to dismiss	0.40	250.00
01/07/2021	KM	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re client outreach	0.30	187.50
01/11/2021	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze sections for motion to dismiss opposition briefing	1.70	1,062.50
01/13/2021	KAL	L320	A102	Researching Response to MTD	6.20	3,875.00
01/14/2021	KAL	L320	A102	Research and Draft Opposition to MTD	6.70	4,187.50
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze motion to dismiss briefing	2.40	1,500.00
	SW	L100	A105	Communicate with potential client	0.50	575.00
	SW	L100	A106	Communicate with legal team re potential client	2.40	2,760.00
01/15/2021	KAL	L320	A105	Conferred internally regarding potential client	0.10	62.50
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise opposition to motion to dismiss	6.10	3,812.50
	SW	L330	A109	Pre call re potential client	0.50	575.00
	SW	L330	A109	Call w/potential client	0.50	575.00
	SW	L190	A108	Pre call re potential client	0.50	575.00
	SW	L190	A108	Call w/potential client	0.50	575.00
01/18/2021	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise opposition to motion to dismiss	5.30	3,312.50
	KM	L200	A102	Research choice of law cases in connection with drafting opposition to motion to dismiss	2.70	1,687.50
	SW	L200	A102	Research -- Legal research re MTD	3.00	3,450.00
01/19/2021	HH	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re status of opposing counsel to MTD	0.15	57.75
	HH	L190	A102	Research opp to mtd requirements	0.40	154.00
	KQ	L250	A103	Draft/revise mtn to appoint as lead counsel	4.20	1,890.00
	KM	L200	A102	Research negligence law in connection with drafting opposition to motion to dismiss	4.00	2,500.00
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise opposition to motion to dismiss	3.40	2,125.00
01/20/2021	KQ	L250	A103	Draft/revise motion to appoint interim co-lead counsel	0.50	225.00
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise opposition to motion to dismiss	1.70	1,062.50
01/21/2021	HH	L210	A103	Draft/revise Leadership documents	3.90	1,501.50
	HH	L210	A103	Draft/revise notice of dismissal	0.40	154.00
	KQ	L250	A103	Draft/revise motion for appointment of leadership and accompanying documents	6.40	2,880.00
	KAL	L320	A103	Editing Lead counsel brief	1.10	687.50
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise opposition to motion to dismiss	12.50	7,812.50
	KM	L200	A102	Research strict liability case law in connection with revising opposition to motion to dismiss	1.60	1,000.00
01/22/2021	KQ	L240	A103	Draft/revise legal section for opposition to MTD	0.50	225.00
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise opposition to motion to dismiss; confer with P. Murphree re same	6.10	3,812.50
	SW	L330	A109	Call w/potential client	0.50	575.00
01/23/2021	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise opposition to motion to dismiss	5.20	3,250.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 10

					Hours	
01/24/2021	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise opposition to motion to dismiss	1.80	1,125.00
01/25/2021	HH	L210	A103	Format, cite check and run tables on opp to MTD	3.20	1,232.00
	GA	L210	A104	Review/analyze plaintiff's opposition to defendant's motion to dismiss for Ms. Haile	2.00	800.00
	KAL	L320	A104	Review and revise opposition to MTD for filing	3.10	1,937.50
	KM	L200	A103	Draft/revise opposition to motion to dismiss in preparation for filing	8.10	5,062.50
01/26/2021	KAL	L320	A108	Client Call w/potential client	1.60	1,000.00
	KAL	L320	A105	Debrief with team re: potential client	0.20	125.00
	SW	L100	A106	Call w/potential client	0.20	230.00
	SW	L190	A108	Call w/potential client	0.50	575.00
01/27/2021	KAL	L320	A101	Prepared summary of client meeting for distribution within team to determine next steps with potential client	1.70	1,062.50
	KM	L110	A104	Review/analyze correspondence re client outreach and new plaintiff identification	0.20	125.00
02/10/2021	KQ	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) YouTube weekly lead call. Discussed client retention.	0.20	90.00
	SW	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) YouTube weekly lead call. Discussed client retention.	0.20	230.00
02/17/2021	HH	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation ECFs	0.10	38.50
	KQ	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) JSLF internal call. Discussed retaining client.	0.10	45.00
	KAL	L190	A105	YouTube internal call	0.40	250.00
	KAL	L190	A108	Client call re potential client	0.40	250.00
	SW	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Team call.	0.50	575.00
02/23/2021	KQ	L240	A104	Review/analyze YouTube reply iso mtn for summary judgement	0.80	360.00
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze YouTube's reply brief in support of its motion to dismiss	2.20	1,375.00
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re whether YouTube's reply brief merits surreply in anticipation of hearing	0.30	187.50
03/01/2021	HH	L190	A103	Draft/revise	3.60	1,386.00
03/02/2021	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with P. Murphree re motion to dismiss hearing preparation	0.20	125.00
03/03/2021	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with P. Murphree re motion to dismiss hearing preparation	0.20	125.00
03/04/2021	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with L. Tyler and S. Williams re motion to dismiss hearing preparation	0.10	62.50
	SW	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) w/K. Malone re motion to dismiss hearing preparation.	0.10	115.00
03/08/2021	KQ	L240	A103	Draft/revise chart re cases	0.30	135.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 11

					Hours	
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams re motion to dismiss hearing preparation	0.10	62.50
	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with K. Quackenbush and H. Haile re motion to dismiss hearing preparation	0.40	250.00
	KM	L200	A105	Confer with P. McMurphee re motion to dismiss hearing strategy	0.70	437.50
	SW	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) confer w/K. Malone re MTD.		
03/11/2021	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze outline re negligence claims in preparation for hearing	2.20	1,375.00
03/12/2021	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze briefing papers on motion to dismiss and case law and synthesize materials in preparation for motion to dismiss hearing oral argument	1.30	812.50
03/15/2021	KQ	L240	A103	Draft/revise memo re youtube's arguments for MTD	0.20	90.00
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze caselaw cited in briefing in preparation for hearing	4.20	2,625.00
03/16/2021	KQ	L240	A103	Draft/revise memo re YouTube arguments on MTD to prepare for oral argument	5.40	2,430.00
	KM	L200	A102	Research codification of negligence claims as basis for UCL claim	1.90	1,187.50
03/17/2021	KQ	L240	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Kate Malone and Keydon Levy re preparation for MTD hearing.	1.30	585.00
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze legal arguments with K. Quackenbush and K. Levy in preparation for hearing	1.70	1,062.50
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze caselaw cited in briefing in preparation for hearing	4.30	2,687.50
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze briefing papers on motion to dismiss and case law and synthesize materials in preparation for motion to dismiss hearing oral argument	2.40	1,500.00
	SW	L200	A104	Review/analyze work w/K. Malone re MTD hearing prep.	2.40	2,760.00
03/18/2021	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with K. Quackenbush and K. Levy regarding hearing preparation in light of rescheduled hearing	0.70	437.50
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze briefing papers on motion to dismiss and case law and synthesize materials in preparation for motion to dismiss hearing oral argument	5.50	3,437.50
03/24/2021	KQ	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) weekly lead counsel call. Discussed potential new client and prep for MTD hearing	1.00	450.00
	SW	L200	A104	Review/analyze Discuss potential new client and prep for MTD hearing.	2.00	2,300.00
03/29/2021	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with R. Yelton re status of potential clients and ongoing action items	1.00	625.00
04/06/2021	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re news item discussing current status of YouTube's content moderation policies	0.20	125.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 12

					Hours	
04/14/2021	HH	L190	A103	Draft/revise ntc of change of firm name	0.70	269.50
04/16/2021	KM	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with R. Yelton re status of client outreach and ongoing action items	0.30	187.50
06/21/2021	KM	L200	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) Confer re motion to dismiss hearing scheduling and settlement discussions	0.50	312.50
	SW	L190	A107	Call re MTD Hearing Schedule	0.25	287.50
06/22/2021	HH	L210	A105	Send Jenel calendar dates	0.10	38.50
06/23/2021	APH	L110	A105	Telephone conference discussing status of case and motion to dismiss.	0.80	500.00
06/24/2021	APH	L110	A104	Analyzed motion to dismiss.	1.00	625.00
	APH	L110	A104	Analyzed opposition to motion to dismiss.	1.20	750.00
	SW	L200	A104	Review and analysis of motion to dismiss	2.00	2,300.00
06/25/2021	APH	L350	A105	Telephone conference with co counsel discussing motion to dismiss hearing.	1.20	750.00
07/06/2021	KM	L200	A101	Plan and prepare for hearing on motion to dismiss	4.40	2,750.00
07/07/2021	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze briefing and case law in preparation for motion to dismiss hearing	6.10	3,812.50
	HH	L250	A104	Pulling cases cited related to MTD	3.55	1,366.75
	SW	L190	A105	Mock Argument Call w/Kate M.	0.50	575.00
07/08/2021	KM	L200	A104	Analyze case law and briefing to prepare for hearing on motion to dismiss	5.20	3,250.00
07/09/2021	APH	L200	A104	Analyzed reply in support of opposition for motion to dismiss in prep of hearing.	1.00	625.00
	APH	L200	A104	Reviewed motion to dismiss and opposition thereto in connection with MTD hearing.	1.50	937.50
	APH	L200	A105	Communicate (within legal team) in preparation of MTD hearing.	1.20	750.00
	SW	L200	A104	Review/analyze in preparation of MTD hearing.	1.20	1,380.00
07/13/2021	KM	L200	A109	Appear for/attend hearing on motion to dismiss	1.50	937.50
	KM	L200	A104	Review/analyze case law and briefing in preparation for motion to dismiss hearing	5.80	3,625.00
	APH	L310	A105	Communicate (within legal team) in connection with motion to dismiss hearing.	0.80	500.00
	APH	L310	A109	Attended MTD hearing.	1.50	937.50
	HH	L250	A109	Appear for/attend MTD hearing	2.35	904.75
	SW	L190	A101	Hearing Prep Call w/Kate M.	0.50	575.00
	SW	L190	A109	Hearing on Motion to Dismiss		
07/14/2021	HH	L250	A103	Draft/revise transcript request	0.10	38.50

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 13

					Hours	
07/16/2021	SW	L190	A106	Call w/Client	0.50	575.00
07/22/2021	KM	L120	A105	Confer with P. Murphree re amendments to complaint and strategy re same	0.80	500.00
07/29/2021	SW	L190	A108	Call w/Zach Briers and others	0.50	575.00
08/06/2021	KM	L210	A103	Draft/revise amended complaint	4.40	2,750.00
08/09/2021	HH	L210	A101	Plan and prepare for filing	0.30	115.50
	SW	L190	A108	Call w/Zach Briers	0.50	575.00
08/10/2021	HH	L210	A103	Formatted stipulation requesting extended time to file amended complaint.	1.50	577.50
08/11/2021	HH	L210	A103	Prepare stipulation for filing	2.65	1,020.25
	HH	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation ECFs	0.15	57.75
	HH	L210	A108	Email proposed order to the Court	0.10	38.50
09/28/2021	KM	L120	A106	Communicate (with client) re status of case	0.50	312.50
10/13/2021	HH	L210	A103	Draft/revise stip re deadline for amended complaint and filing	0.95	365.75
	HH	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation ECFs	1.20	462.00
10/20/2021	HH	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation ecfs	0.70	269.50
01/12/2022	HH	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation ECFs	1.50	577.50
01/20/2022	HH	L210	A101	Send dates for calendar	0.45	173.25
01/21/2022	HH	L190	A101	Prepare needed JAMS paperwork	1.75	673.75
01/26/2022	HH	L190	A101	JAM documents prepare & circulate	2.00	770.00
03/02/2022	SW	L190	A105	Mediation w/Judge Westerfield.	8.00	9,600.00
	SW	L190	A105	Mediation prep call.	0.50	600.00
03/08/2022	SW	L190	A105	Mediation w/Judge Westerfield.	5.00	6,000.00
03/15/2022	SW	L190	A105	Call w/Accenture.	1.00	1,200.00
	GR	L120	A109	Appear for/attend meeting with Accenture and YouTube	1.00	385.00
03/16/2022	GR	TR120	A108	Communicate (other external) re next call with YouTube.	0.40	154.00
	GR	L460	A105	Communicate (within legal team) regarding drafting/filing preliminary approval motion.	0.20	77.00
	GR	L460	A104	Review/analyze case laws and legal standard, ND cal. guidelines for preliminary approval of settlements; began drafting motion.	7.50	2,887.50
	YJ	PA199	A104	Review complaint and S drive documents and filings	3.00	1,275.00
	YJ	P280	A104	Review/analyze and format Settlement Approval brief and related documents	0.70	297.50

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 14

					Hours	
	YJ	P280	A104	Attend meeting with attorney to discuss the Settlement approval brief and related documents.	0.30	127.50
03/18/2022	YJ	L120	A109	Review Complaint and format the same; Read the complaint and discuss with G. Raghunandan regarding the complaint formatting	2.50	1,062.50
	YJ	L101	A103	Draft/Meeting with G. Raghunandan regarding rules and prepare documents	2.00	850.00
03/21/2022	YJ	P280	A104	Meeting with G. Raghunandan to discuss long and short forms, prepare the same and format the same	3.10	1,317.50
03/22/2022	YJ	L390	A105	Communicate (within legal team) regarding last order and check docket regarding the same	0.30	127.50
	GR	L460	A103	Draft/revise preliminary settlement approval motion and notice.	4.50	1,732.50
03/23/2022	SW	L190	A105	Call w/Experts.	0.50	600.00
	GR	L460	A103	Draft/revise preliminary approval of settlement motion ancillary papers.	8.00	3,080.00
	GR	L120	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) on settlement terms.	1.00	385.00
03/24/2022	GR	L430	A103	Draft/revise preliminary approval of settlement motion.	4.00	1,540.00
03/25/2022	GR	WC160	A103	Draft/revise preliminary approval papers based on ND Cal. guidelines, marked the draft and sent for review.	4.00	1,540.00
	YJ	L210	A104	Review/analyze settlement brief against the guidelines and discuss my comments with G. Raghunandan regarding the same	2.10	892.50
03/28/2022	SW	L190	A105	Doe settlement discussion.	0.50	600.00
	GR	WC160	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) re settlement term sheet.	0.50	192.50
03/29/2022	GR	WC160	A121	Review and Analysis of settlement agreement shared by defense counsel.	2.50	962.50
	GR	WC160	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) re settlement agreement	0.50	192.50
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding brief and updating the same against the guidelines	0.30	127.50
	SW	WC160	A121	Review and Analysis Review and analysis of draft settlement agreement.	0.50	600.00
03/31/2022	YJ	L103	A105	Communicate (within legal team) to discuss additional documents and content	0.30	127.50
04/01/2022	SR	L460	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re Settlement Administrators, notices, and final approval filing procedures	0.80	320.00
04/04/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding settlement documents and logistics	0.20	85.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 15

					Hours	
04/08/2022	GR	WC450	A109	Appear for/attend settlement conference	6.00	2,310.00
04/11/2022	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with Epiq regarding obtaining claim administrator documents	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding claims administrator and documents	0.10	42.50
	SR	L460	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re settlement administration	0.70	280.00
04/14/2022	GR	B310	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) feasibility of current claims administrator and other alternatives.	1.00	385.00
04/25/2022	SW	L190	A109	Call w/Patrick Murphree and others.	1.00	1,200.00
04/26/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding case and logistics	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams and G. Raghunandan regarding serving subpoena to Accenture	0.10	42.50
	SW	L190	A109	Call re subpoena.	0.50	600.00
04/27/2022	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise Download form and edit Accenture subpoena	0.20	85.00
04/28/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding comments from S. Williams on the brief	0.30	127.50
	YJ	B110	A104	Review/analyze comments in brief and assist G. Raghunandan	1.20	510.00
	YJ	B110	A104	Review/analyze Westlaw and download case cited in Preliminary Approval brief	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A104	Review/analyze NDcal rules regarding Preliminary Approval brief statement of questions	0.50	212.50
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding additional information on the brief	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan to discuss brief and citations and add cites per guidelines	0.50	212.50
05/01/2022	SW	L190	A105	Settlement agreement call.	0.50	600.00
05/03/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding subpoena and other discovery logistics	0.20	85.00
05/04/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding preliminary brief signatures	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise edit attorney signatures to preliminary settlement brief	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding subpoena	0.10	42.50
05/05/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams and G. Raghunandan regarding subpoena serve	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding subpoena serve name	0.10	42.50



Jane Doe  
Account No. 1086.01  
RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
Invoice No. 129  
Page No. 16

					Hours	
	SW	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) call w/Yasmine and Gayatri regarding subpoena	0.20	240.00
05/10/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding adding Attachment A to subpoena	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise Attachment A to subpoena and update subpoena	0.30	127.50
	SW	L190	A105	Settlement call.	0.50	600.00
05/16/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding subpoena changes	0.30	127.50
	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise Attachment A to Accenture subpoena	0.60	255.00
	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with processing service regarding subpoena and place for holding documents	0.50	212.50
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams regarding Accenture subpoena serve	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise notice of service of subpoena and update subpoena	0.50	212.50
	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise proof read/format Attachment A after S. Williams edits	0.50	212.50
	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with local subpoena processor for a referral agent in Chicago for service	0.20	85.00
	SW	L190	A105	Settlement call; subpoena	0.70	840.00
05/17/2022	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with document processor regarding serving the subpoena	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with G. Raghunandan and S. Williams regarding updating the subpoena and service	0.30	127.50
	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise subpoena and related documents for service and finalize the same	0.30	127.50
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with A. Ortiz regarding mailing subpoena to defense counsel.	0.10	42.50
05/18/2022	SW	L190	A105	Settlement call.	0.50	600.00
05/19/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding status report exemplar and find the same	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise joint status report and proposed order	0.60	255.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams regarding status report	0.10	42.50
05/20/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams regarding Status report due date	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A102	Research on Judge's rules/proposed order and her email for ECF filing	0.40	170.00
	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise finalize joint status report and confidentiality and settlement agreements	0.60	255.00
05/24/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams regarding Joint status report filing	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A101	Plan and prepare for Joint Status report filing and distribute Proposed Order / distribute filing	0.60	255.00
	YJ	B110	A104	Review/analyze local rules and ECF filings for the case	0.35	148.75

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 17

					Hours	
06/01/2022	SW	L190	A105	Call re Subpoena to Accenture	0.50	600.00
06/02/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding Accenture production	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding list of preliminary approval papers	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team)		
06/07/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding preliminary approval papers and logistics	0.20	85.00
06/09/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding Approval papers	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation update contents in approval papers	0.50	212.50
06/13/2022	YJ	L102	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan and distribute Opposition to MTD	0.10	42.50
06/14/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding approval settlement agreement and comparison	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation save correspondence	0.40	170.00
06/15/2022	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with opposing counsel regarding production	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation download production, distribute and save	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with A. Cera and G. Raghunandan regarding settlement papers	0.20	85.00
06/16/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with A. Cera regarding settlement papers	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with G. Raghunandan regarding case documents she worked on and logistics	0.30	127.50
	SW	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team)	0.50	600.00
06/17/2022	YJ	L102	A103	Draft/revise motion to approve settlement edit/proof read and format	1.10	467.50
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with A. Cera and G. Raghunandan regarding motion for preliminary approval and logistics	0.40	170.00
	SW	L190	A105	Call re Accenture Data (YT Content Moderators Settlement)	0.50	600.00
06/21/2022	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise S. Williams review motion to approve settlement brief, declaration and Proposed Order, formatted/edit	2.00	850.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) teams call with A. Cera regarding declaration in support of preliminary approval brief and logistics	0.10	42.50
06/28/2022	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation save settlement agreement and Declaration in support of motion for preliminary approval	0.10	42.50

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 18

				Hours		
	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation review and find declaration from Facebook case regarding approval of settlement for S. Williams	0.10	42.50
07/01/2022	SW	L230	A101	Plan and prepare preliminary approval papers, conferences with co-counsel, correspondence defense counsel, conferences with consultants and notice provider	3.00	3,600.00
07/02/2022	SW	L230	A101	Plan and prepare preliminary approval papers, conferences with co-counsel, correspondence defense counsel, conferences with consultants and notice provider	4.00	4,800.00
07/03/2022	SW	L230	A101	Plan and prepare preliminary approval papers, conferences with co-counsel, correspondence defense counsel, conferences with consultants and notice provider	2.00	2,400.00
07/04/2022	SW	L230	A101	Plan and prepare preliminary approval papers, conferences with co-counsel, correspondence defense counsel, conferences with consultants and notice provider	3.00	3,600.00
07/05/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams regarding preliminary approval filing	0.30	127.50
	YJ	B110	A102	Research on Local rules, ECF rules and Judge's rules on preliminary approval filings procedures and rules	0.30	127.50
	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise/ Proof read preliminary approval briefs and related documents and efile	6.80	2,890.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams regarding preliminary approval brief and related documents	0.40	170.00
	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with local and co-counsel regarding preliminary approval brief and other related documents	0.50	212.50
	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation distribute and save and rename e-filed preliminary approval brief and related documents	0.50	212.50
	YJ	B110	A102	Research on ECF filings of sealed documents, Judge Roger's standing orders and rules for filing	0.50	212.50
	SW	L230	A101	Plan and prepare preliminary approval papers, conferences with co-counsel, correspondence defense counsel, conferences with consultants and notice provider	3.00	3,600.00
07/06/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams regarding filing and chambers copy	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A102	Research on chamber's copy and communicate with clerk regarding the same	0.30	127.50
	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation prepare binder, index of the e-filed administrative motion to efile and related documents in support of motion to preliminary approval of settlement. prepare for delivery	2.20	935.00
	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with S. Williams regarding case filings to send defendants	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Prepare efiled documents from the Administrative motion to file under seal and related documents to email defendants	0.40	170.00

Jane Doe  
Account No. 1086.01  
RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
Invoice No. 129  
Page No. 19

					Hours	
	AO	L320	A110	Binder production/mailing assist; communicate with Y Jayasuriya	1.00	400.00
07/07/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with team regarding sending word documents of long form and summary note to court	0.10	42.50
	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with court and send word documents of exhibits filed on preliminary approval filing	0.20	85.00
07/11/2022	YJ	B110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with A. Jensen regarding drafting motion to seal and related documents	0.30	127.50
	YJ	B110	A102	Research on Judge Gonzales-Rogers rules and filing administrative motion to file under seal and related rules to correct the administrative motion	0.40	170.00
	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation prepare documents for corrected motion to approval of settlement and related documents to file	3.20	1,360.00
	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with Judge Gonzalez-Rogers regarding the filing	0.10	42.50
	ANJ	L140	A110	Updated case calendar	0.10	42.50
	ANJ	L250	A104	Attention to filing corrected motion for preliminary approval	8.00	3,400.00
07/12/2022	YJ	B110	A103	Draft/revise administrative motion to file under seal and preliminary approval of settlement papers and related documents for filing	4.50	1,912.50
	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with court regarding filing administrative motion to file under seal	0.20	85.00
	ANJ	L250	A104	Attention to filing corrected motion for preliminary approval	8.00	3,400.00
07/13/2022	YJ	B110	A108	Communicate (other external) with court and docketing regarding refiling preliminary approval filing	0.20	85.00
	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation prepare binder and index for Judge with preliminary approval filings	1.20	510.00
	YJ	B110	A110	Manage data/files/documentation save efiled documents from administrative motion to seal / preliminary approval of settlement documents	0.50	212.50
	AO	L320	A110	Binder production/mailing assist; communicate with Y Jayasuriya	1.00	400.00
	ANJ	L250	A105	Communicated with team re contacting clerk re correcting docket	0.20	85.00
07/14/2022	YJ	L210	A105	Communicate (within legal team) with A. Ortiz regarding FedEx and binder to Judge Yvonne Gonzalez-Rogers	0.10	42.50
	AO	L320	A110	Binder production mailing tracking assist; communicate with Y Jayasuriya	1.00	400.00
07/25/2022	YJ	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation download, distribute and save defendants notice to preliminary approval	0.10	42.50
08/15/2022	AAM	L160	A104	Review/analyze documents prior to prelim approval hearing	2.40	960.00
	ANJ	L450	A110	Reviewed rules re in person hearings and communicated same to attorneys; prepared hearing binder	1.00	425.00

Jane Doe  
Account No. 1086.01  
RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
Invoice No. 129  
Page No. 20

					Hours	
	GR	L160	A101	Plan and prepare for preliminary approval of settlement, vetting documents, preparing notes.	4.00	1,540.00
	SW	L160	A109	Appear for/attend Prepare for settlement approval hearing.	3.00	3,600.00
08/16/2022	AAM	L160	A104	Review/analyze prelim approval papers	1.80	720.00
	AAM	L160	A109	Appear for/attend preliminary approval hearing	3.20	1,280.00
	AAM	L160	A103	Draft/revise papers for preliminary approval	2.10	840.00
	SW	L190	A105	Hearing on Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Actions Settlement and Appointment of Settlement Counsel.	1.00	1,200.00
	GR	L160	A109	Appear for/attend hearing on preliminary motion for approval of settlement.	5.00	1,925.00
	GR	L160	A103	Draft/revise preliminary hearing papers per court's order specifically the preliminary motion and agreement to include new instruction.	6.00	2,310.00
	GR	L160	A102	Research on bluetooth factors for the preliminary motion.	2.00	770.00
	SW	L160	A109	Appear for/attend Prepare for and attend preliminary approval hearing/follow up	5.00	6,000.00
08/17/2022	AAM	L260	A103	Draft/revise youtube documents for preliminary approval (declaration of Norman and Settlement Agreement)	1.90	760.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distribute ECF	0.20	80.00
	AAM	L100	A109	Appear for/attend strategy meeting for prelim papers	0.10	40.00
	RP	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Jensen re Case updates.	0.20	80.00
	RP	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) S. Williams re Case updates.	0.10	40.00
	RP	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re Settlement Agreement Amended Complaint.	0.20	80.00
	RP	L430	A110	Manage data/files/documentation finalized and filed Transcript Order Request	0.20	80.00
	AAM	L160	A102	Research on bluetooth factors	2.00	800.00
	AAM	L160	A103	Draft/revise notices for preliminary approval	0.70	280.00
	AAM	L160	A105	Communicate (within legal team) on additional aspects for the preliminary approval papers	0.70	280.00
	AAM	L160	A103	Draft/revise preliminary approval papers	3.30	1,320.00
	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) w/ Team re settlement agreement.	0.20	80.00
	RP	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) J. Day re Case updates.	0.20	80.00
	GR	L160	A103	Draft/revise motion for preliminary approval by adding citations and material on bluetooth factors and other inclusions per court's order.	8.00	3,080.00
	GR	L160	A103	Draft/revise amended complaint based on court's instructions and shared with co-counsel.	2.50	962.50
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondance	0.20	80.00
	ANJ	L250	A103	Draft/revise hearing transcript order	0.50	212.50
	SW	L120	A109	Appear for/attend Team meeting	2.50	3,000.00
08/18/2022	RP	L430	A103	Draft/revise Mtn to Extend Prelim App Filing	0.30	120.00
	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re amended complaint and settlement agreement	0.50	200.00
	AAM	L160	A103	Draft/revise preliminary approval papers	7.40	2,960.00
	SW	L190	A105	Call w/Bram	0.50	600.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 21

					Hours	
	RP	L100	A108	Communicate (other external) ND Cal court reporter re Hearing transcript request	0.30	120.00
	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) S. Silvera re Hearing transcript request	0.20	80.00
	GR	L160	A103	Draft/revise SNW declaration based on court's latest instructions.	4.00	1,540.00
	GR	L160	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re next steps for filing the next day.	0.50	192.50
	GR	L160	A103	Draft/revise preliminary motion for approval in accordance with SNW declaration.	3.00	1,155.00
	GR	L160	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re motion, court transcripts, and declarations.	0.30	115.50
	GR	L160	A103	Draft/revise amended complaint for re-filing on Friday.	2.00	770.00
08/19/2022	AAM	L160	A108	Communicate (other external) experts on revised declarations	0.50	200.00
	AAM	L160	A103	Draft/revise all the preliminary papers in preparation for filing	12.10	4,840.00
	ANJ	L250	A104	Review motion for preliminary approval supplemental filing	6.00	2,550.00
	SW	L190	A105	Content Moderators - Call re Settlement	1.00	1,200.00
	SW	L190	A105	INTERNAL Team Call	0.50	600.00
	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Jensen re amended complaint and settlement agreement	0.50	200.00
	RP	L430	A103	Draft/revise Supplement Motion Preliminary Approval	1.00	400.00
	RP	L430	A103	Draft/revise Williams Declaration ISO Supplement Motion Preliminary Approval	0.70	280.00
	RP	L430	A103	Draft/revise Charest Declaration ISO Supplement Motion Preliminary Approval	0.50	200.00
	RP	L430	A103	Draft/revise Proposed Order Granting Preliminary Approval	0.70	280.00
	RP	L430	A103	Draft/revise Long Form Notice Exh. 1	0.40	160.00
	RP	L430	A103	Draft/revise Short Form Notice Exh. 2	0.40	160.00
	RP	L430	A103	Draft/revise Amended Settlement Agreement Exh.3	0.40	160.00
	RP	L430	A103	Draft/revise Amended Complaint	0.90	360.00
	RP	L430	A110	Manage data/files/documentation finalized and filed via ECF Supplement Motion Preliminary Approval w/ Supporting documents	0.60	240.00
	RP	L430	A110	Manage data/files/documentation finalized and filed via ECF Amended Complaint	0.40	160.00
	RP	L430	A108	Communicate (other external) w/ Hon Yvonne Gonzalez Rogers re Proposed Order Granting Preliminary Approval	0.30	120.00
	GR	L160	A103	Draft/revise amended complaint for pre-filing.	5.50	2,117.50
	GR	L160	A103	Draft/revise motion for preliminary approval and preparation for filing.	3.00	1,155.00
	GR	L160	A103	Draft/revise SNW declaration and prepare for filing.	1.00	385.00
	GR	L160	A105	Communicate (within legal team) and prepare for filing papers before court.	0.50	192.50
08/22/2022	RP	WC450	A105	Communicate (within legal team) w/ A. Jensen re prelim approval filing	0.40	160.00
	RP	L430	A110	Manage data/files/documentation prepared chambers copies for Judge Yvonne Gonzalez Rogers	0.40	160.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distribute ECF	0.40	160.00
	RP	WC450	A105	Communicate (within legal team) w/ A. Maggard re prelim approval filing	0.40	160.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 22

					Hours	
	ANJ	L140	A101	Prepared chambers copies of Motion for Preliminary Approval	0.60	255.00
	SW	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) f/u settlement, t/cs D. Charest, review and analysis of papers and arguments raised by YouTube.	2.50	3,000.00
08/23/2022	SW	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Continue finalizing settlement file supplement declaration.	1.50	1,800.00
08/25/2022	SW	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Bi-weekly Deposition Strike Force meeting.	1.00	1,200.00
08/29/2022	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distribute ECF	0.20	80.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed Correspondance	0.30	120.00
09/08/2022	RP	L100	A108	Communicate (other external) meet on confer with defs re settlement	0.20	80.00
	SW	L190	A105	External Call w/Daniel Charest	0.50	600.00
09/09/2022	SW	L190	A107	Telephone conference with co-counsel and defense counsel re settlement agreement; prepare and file supplemental filing with executed settlement agreement	1.00	1,200.00
09/12/2022	RP	L430	A105	Communicate (within legal team) w/ S. Williams and A. Maggard re prelim approval papers	0.40	160.00
	RP	L430	A105	Communicate (within legal team) w/ A. Maggard re prelim approval papers	0.30	120.00
	AAM	L160	A103	Draft/revise redlines for court pursuant to their email this morning	1.10	440.00
	RP	L430	A108	Communicate (other external) Hon Gonzalez Rogers re prelim approval papers	0.30	120.00
	RP	L430	A104	Review/analyze redlined settlement agreement	0.50	200.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed Correspondence	0.30	120.00
	SW	L320	A101	Provide materials to Court per request	1.00	1,200.00
	SW	L190	A105	YouTube Team Call	0.50	600.00
09/19/2022	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) L. Tyler re Settlement Agreement	0.20	80.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distribute ECF	0.20	80.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed Correspondence	0.30	120.00
	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Jensen re calendar updates	0.10	40.00
09/20/2022	AAM	L160	A108	Communicate (other external) co-counsel and claims admin on schedule for final approval	0.60	240.00
09/29/2022	AAM	L100	A104	Review/analyze order granting preliminary approval	1.20	480.00
	SW	L120	A104	Review/analyze order granting preliminary approval	5.00	6,000.00
	ANJ	L140	A110	Updated case calendar	0.10	42.50

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 23

					Hours	
10/03/2022	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Jensen re calendar updates	0.20	80.00
	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Maggardre calendar updates	0.20	80.00
	ANJ	L140	A110	Updated case calendar	0.10	42.50
10/04/2022	ANJ	L140	A110	Updated case calendar	0.10	42.50
10/05/2022	ANJ	L140	A110	Updated case calendar	0.10	42.50
10/13/2022	AAM	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) call on extra class members data for settlement	0.20	80.00
	SW	L101	A105	Prepare for and conference call w/co-counsel and opposing counsel re additional class members, ramifications for settlement.	1.50	1,800.00
10/17/2022	SW	L101	A105	Call re class size	0.50	600.00
10/21/2022	AAM	L100	A104	Review/analyze notices and schedule for final approval	1.40	560.00
	SW	L101	A105	Correspondence with co-counsel and claims administrator; correspondence with defense counsel.	1.00	1,200.00
10/26/2022	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Jensen re notice of class size and settlement	0.20	80.00
	RP	L100	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) J. Gravois re notice of class size and settlement	0.20	80.00
	RP	L100	A103	Draft/revise formatted notice of class size and settlement	0.40	160.00
	RP	L100	A110	Manage data/files/documentation finalized and filed notice of class size and settlement	0.40	160.00
	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) S. Williams re notice of class size and settlement	0.20	80.00
	ANJ	L250	A104	Reviewed notice regarding class size	0.20	85.00
10/27/2022	RP	L100	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) J. Gravois re notice of class size and settlement	0.20	80.00
11/10/2022	SW	L320	A108	T/cP Murphree re final approval filings	0.50	600.00
11/14/2022	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) re Final Approval papers	0.40	160.00
	LC	L430	A103	Draft/revise: Draft Client declaration (in support of attorneys fees/expenses) and circulate internally to team	8.00	3,080.00
	LC	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team): Call with AM and RP re fees motion/accompanying docs	0.20	77.00
	LC	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team): Attend call co-counsel	0.20	77.00
11/15/2022	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Decl of Doe Motion for Fees	0.70	280.00
	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Maggard re Final Approval papers	0.30	120.00
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Prop order Granting Motion for Fees	0.40	160.00
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Decl of Williams Motion for Fees	1.10	440.00
11/17/2022	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Final Approval papers	0.50	200.00



Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 24

					Hours	
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Motion for Fees	1.60	640.00
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Decl of Williams Motion for Fees	0.90	360.00
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Decl of Charest Motion for Fees	0.70	280.00
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Prop order Granting Motion for Fees	0.90	360.00
	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) S. Williams re Final Approval Hearing	0.20	80.00
	RP	L100	A108	Communicate (other external) court clerk re re Final Approval Hearing	0.20	80.00
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Decl of Doe Motion for Fees	0.70	280.00
11/18/2022	AAM	L160	A103	Draft/revise motion for fees	10.20	4,080.00
	ANJ	L250	A104	Attention to reviewing, updating, finalizing and filing fees motion and supporting documents	8.00	3,400.00
11/21/2022	AAM	L100	A102	Research on in camera review in ND CAL	0.90	360.00
	RP	L190	A108	Communicate (other external) w/ Western attorney services re chambers copy Attn fees	0.20	80.00
	ANJ	L250	A105	Emailed R. Ponce re chambers copies of fees motion	0.10	42.50
	ANJ	L140	A110	Updated case calendar	0.10	42.50
11/22/2022	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distribute ECF	0.20	80.00
11/28/2022	AAM	L100	A103	Draft/revise motion for in camera review and research on same	3.90	1,560.00
11/29/2022	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.30	120.00
12/01/2022	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distribute ECF	0.20	80.00
12/02/2022	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondance	0.30	120.00
	SW	L101	A109	Gordon settlement	1.00	1,200.00
12/22/2022	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) M. Murray re prelim approval discussions.	0.10	40.00
12/28/2022	RP	L120	A107	Communicate (opponents/other outside counsel) KCC/Counsel Meeting	0.30	120.00
01/02/2023	SW	L110	A109	follow up with co-counsel regarding missing class member contact information.	0.50	600.00
01/03/2023	AAM	L100	A103	Draft/revise motion for final approval	2.00	840.00
	RP	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) L. Concepcion re final approval filing	0.20	89.00
	SW	L110	A109	Call with co-counsel and claims administrator regarding confidentiality issue.	1.00	1,200.00
	LC	L430	A102	Research: related to final approval of class action settlement.	0.80	324.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondance	0.30	133.50

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 25

					Hours	
01/04/2023	AAM	L100	A105	Communicate (within legal team) final approval papers strategy discussion	0.20	84.00
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Dec ISO Ps Class Motion For Final Approval of Class Action Settlement	0.30	133.50
	AAM	L100	A102	Research on final approval motions before YGR	0.50	210.00
	SW	L110	A109	Prepare for and attend call with team regarding final approval briefing.	1.50	1,800.00
	LC	L430	A105	Communicate (within legal team): Call with SNW and AM regarding drafting of final approval briefing	0.20	81.00
	LC	L430	A103	Draft/revise: brief in support of final approval	8.00	3,240.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise S. William Dec ISO Ps motion for final approval	0.30	133.50
	RP	L140	A101	Plan and prepare for motion for final approval reviewed	0.30	133.50
	RP	L140	A105	Communicate (within legal team) L. Concepcion re final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondance	0.30	133.50
01/05/2023	AAM	L100	A103	Draft/revise final approval papers	3.60	1,512.00
	LC	L430	A103	Draft/revise: brief in support of final approval	12.00	4,860.00
01/06/2023	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Williams Dec ISO Ps Class Motion For Final Approval of Class Action Settlement	0.30	133.50
	AAM	L100	A103	Draft/revise papers for final approval	4.20	1,764.00
	LC	L430	A103	Draft/revise: brief in support of final approval	10.00	4,050.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise Prop order granting Ps motion for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise S. William Dec ISO Ps motion for final approval	0.30	133.50
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise final judgment of dismissal	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Maggard re final approval	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A105	Communicate (within legal team) L. Concepcion re final approval	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.20	89.00
01/09/2023	SW	L110	A109	Prepare for and call with Youtube and Accenture; prepare final approval papers.	4.50	5,400.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise Prop order granting Ps motion for final approval	0.60	267.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise S. William Dec ISO Ps motion for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise final judgment of dismissal	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Maggard re final approval	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A105	Communicate (within legal team) L. Concepcion re final approval	0.20	89.00
01/10/2023	AAM	L100	A104	Review/analyze papers for final approval.	2.10	882.00
	AAM	L100	A104	Review/analyze declarations and brief for circulation	0.50	210.00
	LC	L430	A105	Communicate (within legal team): related to motion for final approval of settlement	0.20	81.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise Prop order granting Ps motion for final approval	0.90	400.50
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise S. William Dec ISO Ps motion for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Maggard for final approval	0.60	267.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 26

					Hours	
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondance	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondance	0.20	89.00
01/11/2023	AAM	L100	A103	Draft/revise final approval papers for grammar, nits, and cites.	1.50	630.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondance	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise Prop order granting Ps motion for final approval	0.60	267.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise S. William Dec ISO Ps motion for final approval	0.40	178.00
01/12/2023	AAM	L100	A103	Draft/revise papers for final approval	3.40	1,428.00
	RP	L140	A108	Communicate (other external) Judge Yvonne Gonzalez Rogers re Final Judgment	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise Ps motion for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise S. William Dec ISO Ps motion for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Exhibits A - C to S. Williams dec ISO Mtn for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise D. Charest Dec ISO Ps motion for final approval	1.40	623.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise M. Murray Dec ISO Ps motion for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Exhibits A - D to M. Murray dec ISO Mtn for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise Prop order granting Ps motion for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A103	Draft/revise Final Judgement of dismissal	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A105	Communicate (within legal team) L. Concepcion for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Maggard for final approval	0.80	356.00
	RP	L140	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Jensen for final approval	0.40	178.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation finalized and filed Ps motion for final approval	0.40	178.00
	LC	L430	A105	Communicate (within legal team) regarding filing of final approval briefing	0.10	40.50
01/13/2023	AAM	L100	A103	Draft/revise potential response motion for continuance of hearing	0.70	294.00
	RP	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Western Attorney Services re Mtn final approval chambers copy	0.40	178.00
01/17/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondance	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A105	Communicate (within legal team) S. Williams re Accenture subpoena	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondance	0.30	133.50
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed discovery materials	0.30	133.50
	RP	L140	A108	Communicate (other external) J. Gravois re May 17, 2022 Subpoena	0.30	133.50

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 27

					Hours	
01/19/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.40	178.00
01/20/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distribute ECF	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.30	133.50
	RP	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Maggard re CAFA notices	0.20	89.00
01/25/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed youtube data list	0.20	89.00
01/26/2023	AAM	L120	A105	Communicate (within legal team) call about position of AG on settlement	0.10	42.00
01/27/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distribute ECF	0.30	133.50
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.20	89.00
01/28/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.20	89.00
01/30/2023	AAM	L140	A104	Review/analyze response to motion to move final approval hearing and filing	0.40	168.00
	RP	L250	A103	Draft/revise Resp to Mtn to Continue Hearing	0.20	89.00
	RP	L250	A105	Communicate (within legal team) S. Williams and A. Maggard re Resp to Mtn to Continue Hearing	0.20	89.00
	RP	L250	A110	Manage data/files/documentation finalized and filed Resp to Mtn to Continue Hearing	0.20	89.00
	RP	L250	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distribute ECF	0.10	44.50
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.20	89.00
01/31/2023	RP	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Jensen re schedule/ calendar updates	0.10	44.50
	RP	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Jensen re schedule/ calendar updates	0.10	44.50
	RP	L250	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distribute ECF	0.20	89.00
	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.30	133.50
	RP	L140	A104	Review/analyze electronic case files	1.10	489.50
	ANJ	L140	A105	Updated case calendar	0.10	44.50
02/01/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.40	178.00
	RP	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Maggard re case updates	0.20	89.00
02/02/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence	0.40	178.00

Jane Doe  
Account No. 1086.01  
RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
Invoice No. 129  
Page No. 28

						Hours	
02/03/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence		0.40	178.00
02/06/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence		0.20	89.00
02/07/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence		0.20	89.00
	SW	B110	A107	Telephone call with defense counsel regarding CAFA.		0.50	600.00
02/08/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence		0.20	89.00
02/09/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence		0.30	133.50
02/10/2023	RP	L140	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence		0.20	89.00
02/14/2023	RP	L190	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence		0.20	89.00
02/16/2023	RP	L190	A110	Manage data/files/documentation Saved and distributed correspondence		0.20	89.00
02/21/2023	RP	L300	A105	Communicate (within legal team) K. McMahon re case updates		0.10	44.50
03/30/2023	RP	L330	A105	Communicate (within legal team) E. Buchanan re notice of withdrawal		0.30	133.50
04/03/2023	RP	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) A. Jensen re Maggard ntc withdrawal		0.10	44.50
05/05/2023	RP	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Plaintiff's Motion for Final Approval of Class Action Settlement		0.50	222.50
05/08/2023	RP	L190	A105	Communicate (within legal team) final approval hearing		0.20	89.00
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Mtn File Redacted Dec Doe		0.70	311.50
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise S. Williams dec ISO Mtn File Redacted Dec Doe		0.70	311.50
	RP	L110	A103	Draft/revise Prop Order Granting Mtn File Redacted Dec Doe		0.50	222.50
	RP	L210	A103	Draft/revise Jane Doe Dec ISO Mtn for Attorneys fees		0.50	222.50
	RP	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation finalized and filed Mtn File Redacted Dec Doe		0.60	267.00
	RP	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation finalized and filed Jane Doe Dec ISO Mtn for Attorneys fees under seal		0.40	178.00
	RP	L210	A110	Manage data/files/documentation finalized and filed Jane Doe Dec ISO Mtn for Attorneys fees - Redacted		0.50	222.50
05/09/2023	RP	L110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Plaintiff's Motion for Final Approval of Class Action Settlement		0.30	133.50

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 29

				Hours		
	RP	L110	A103	Draft/revise S. Williams dec ISO Plaintiff's Motion for Final Approval of Class Action Settlement	0.30	133.50
05/10/2023	RP	L110	A105	Communicate (within legal team) Plaintiff's Motion for Final Approval of Class Action Settlement	0.20	89.00
				For Current Services Rendered	888.14	516,630.50

#### Timekeeper Summary

Timekeeper	Hours	Rate	Total
Kyle Quackenbush	59.80	\$425.00	\$25,415.00
Kyle Quackenbush	28.00	450.00	12,600.00
Gurjit Aulkh	2.00	400.00	800.00
Steven Williams	61.00	1,150.00	70,150.00
Steven Williams	75.40	1,200.00	90,480.00
Heaven Haile	27.85	275.00	7,658.75
Heaven Haile	32.30	385.00	12,435.50
Ame Ortiz	3.00	400.00	1,200.00
Ruby Ponce	1.30	385.00	500.50
Ruby Ponce	26.70	400.00	10,680.00
Ruby Ponce	31.20	445.00	13,884.00
Sean Robertson	1.50	400.00	600.00
Katharine Malone	192.14	625.00	120,087.50
Abraham Maggard	57.70	400.00	23,080.00
Abraham Maggard	19.20	420.00	8,064.00
Latoya Concepcion	8.40	385.00	3,234.00
Latoya Concepcion	31.30	405.00	12,676.50
Keydon A. Levy	14.60	550.00	8,030.00
Keydon A. Levy	26.40	625.00	16,500.00
Anna-Patrice Harris	10.20	625.00	6,375.00
Ashleigh N. Jensen	33.20	425.00	14,110.00
Ashleigh N. Jensen	0.10	445.00	44.50
Gayatri Raghunandan	88.40	385.00	34,034.00
Yasmin Jayasuriya	56.45	425.00	23,991.25

#### Expenses

09/21/2020	L110	E107	One Legal LLC, Deborah Pansby, Court Filing Fee\$1,435.00/Court Technology Access Fee\$3.50/eChe... ExpRpt574	1,496.06
09/21/2020	L110	E107	One Legal LLC, Deborah Pansby, eFiling Charge \$9.95, ExpRpt574	9.95
10/07/2020	L110	E107	One Legal LLC, Deborah Pansby, Court Technology Access Fee \$3.50/Court Convenience Fee, ExpRpt585	13.57
10/09/2020	L110	E107	One Legal LLC, Deborah Pansby, Courtesy Copy \$35.00/Photocopy Charges \$0.25, ExpRpt585	35.25
11/30/2020	L110	E106	PACER	0.90
12/16/2020	L110	E124	Jane Lee Designs, Inc., Invoice 1714 dated 12/7/2020	75.00
12/31/2020	L110	E106	Westlaw	7,392.00
12/31/2020	L110	E106	PACER	52.60
01/31/2021	L110	E106	PACER	33.90
01/31/2021	L110	E106	Westlaw	5,232.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
 Invoice No. 129  
 Page No. 30

02/28/2021	L110	E106	Westlaw	1,084.00
02/28/2021	L110	E106	PACER	0.50
05/31/2021	L110	E106	PACER	4.50
07/31/2021	L110	E106	Westlaw	2,004.00
07/31/2021	L110	E101	Copying - B&W	395.25
08/31/2021	L110	E106	PACER	3.80
09/30/2021	L110	E106	PACER	3.00
10/31/2021	L110	E106	PACER	7.20
01/31/2022	L110	E106	PACER	1.40
02/14/2022	L110	E121	JAMS, Invoice 6062140 dated 2/14/2022	3,475.00
03/14/2022	L110	E107	Fedex, Invoice 7-681-10310 dated 3/4/2022	40.07
03/31/2022	L110	E106	PACER	6.10
04/01/2022	L110	E121	JAMS, Invoice 6086442 dated 3/3/2022	3,400.00
04/30/2022	L110	E106	Westlaw	2,670.00
04/30/2022	L110	E106	PACER	0.30
05/03/2022	L110	E107	Fedex, Invoice 7-718-12458 dated 4/8/2022	40.68
05/18/2022	L110	E121	JAMS, Invoice 6169950 dated 5/6/2022	287.50
05/31/2022	L110	E101	Copying - B&W	7.25
05/31/2022	L110	E106	PACER	5.10
06/02/2022	L110	E107	United Processing, Inc., Invoice 389683 dated 5/18/2022	125.00
06/30/2022	L110	E106	PACER	2.50
07/31/2022	L110	E101	Copying - B&W	6.00
07/31/2022	L110	E101	Copying - Color Copies	272.00
07/31/2022	L110	E106	PACER	15.20
07/31/2022	L110	E106	Westlaw	650.00
08/01/2022	L110	E107	Fedex, Invoice 7-827-02631 dated 7/22/2022	84.21
08/01/2022	L110	E107	Fedex, Invoice 7-820-35803 dated 7/15/2022	85.07
08/16/2022	L110	E109	Uber, Abraham Maggard - Reimbursement, Uber to Courthouse for Hearing, ExpRpt896	34.47
08/19/2022	L110	E115	United States Court Report, Lee-Anne Shortridge, Invoice 20223269 dated 8/17/2022	65.00
08/31/2022	L110	E101	Copying - B&W	7.50
08/31/2022	L110	E101	Copying - Color Copies	221.00
08/31/2022	L110	E106	PACER	15.60
08/31/2022	L110	E106	Westlaw	2,325.00
09/15/2022	L110	E107	Fedex, Invoice 7-863-94587 dated 8/26/2022	27.91
10/31/2022	L110	E106	PACER	3.00
11/30/2022	L110	E106	PACER	22.50
12/01/2022	L110	E107	Western Attorney Services, Invoice 84071 dated 11/27/2022	115.93
01/15/2023	L110	E107	Western Attorney Services, Invoice 84293 dated 1/15/2023	164.30
01/31/2023	L110	E106	PACER	49.30
03/31/2023	L110	E106	PACER	5.20
			Total Expenses	32,073.57
			Total Current Work	548,704.07
			<b>Balance Due</b>	<b><u>\$548,704.07</u></b>

**Task Code Summary**

		<u>Fees</u>	<u>Expenses</u>
B110	Case Administration	18158.75	0.00
B100	Administration	18,158.75	0.00

Jane Doe  
 Account No. 1086.01  
 RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023

Invoice No. 129

Page No. 31

	<u>Fees</u>	<u>Expenses</u>
B310 Claims Administration and Objections	385.00	0.00
B300 Claims and Plan	385.00	0.00
L100 Case Assessment, Development and Administration	17798.00	0.00
L101 Firm Meetings (non-billable)	5650.00	0.00
L102 Time Input (non-billable)	510.00	0.00
L103 General Administrative (non-billable)	127.50	0.00
L110 Fact Investigation/Development	19803.50	32073.57
L120 Analysis/Strategy	15388.50	0.00
L140 Document/File Management	12241.50	0.00
L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	47238.00	0.00
L190 Other Case Assessment, Development and Administration	66587.50	0.00
L100 Case Assessment, Development and Administration	185,344.50	32,073.57
L200 Pre-Trial Pleadings and Motions	136292.50	0.00
L210 Pleadings	48016.25	0.00
L230 Court Mandated Conferences	18000.00	0.00
L240 Dispositive Motions	18205.00	0.00
L250 Other Written Motions and Submissions	24075.50	0.00
L260 Class Action Certification and Notice	760.00	0.00
L200 Pre-Trial Pleadings and Motions	245,349.25	0.00
L300 Discovery	44.50	0.00
L310 Written Discovery	2075.00	0.00
L320 Document Production	23670.00	0.00
L330 Depositions	1858.50	0.00
L350 Discovery Motions	750.00	0.00
L390 Other Discovery	127.50	0.00
L300 Discovery	28,525.50	0.00
L430 Written Motions and Submissions	20776.50	0.00
L450 Trial and Hearing Attendance	425.00	0.00
L460 Post-Trial Motions and Submissions	8377.00	0.00
L400 Trial Preparation and Trial	29,578.50	0.00
P280 Other	1742.50	0.00
P200 Fact Gathering/Due Diligence	1,742.50	0.00
PA199 Other Assessment, Development, or Administration	1275.00	0.00
PA100 Assessment, Development, and Administration	1,275.00	0.00
TR120 Analysis/Strategy	154.00	0.00
TR100 Assessment, Development, and Administration	154.00	0.00
WC160 Settlement/Resolution	3487.50	0.00
WC100 Initial Assessment of Case and/or Issue and Outcomes	3,487.50	0.00
WC450 Hearing	2630.00	0.00



Jane Doe  
Account No. 1086.01  
RE: YouTube

Invoice Date: May 10, 2023  
Invoice No. 129  
Page No. 32

	<u>Fees</u>	<u>Expenses</u>
WC400 Hearings/Trial Practice	2,630.00	0.00

Statements Printed:	1
Hours:	888.14
Fees:	516,630.50
Expenses:	32,073.57